
Volume 34
Number 13
March 15, 2017
Pages 445 - 452

The
Oklahoma
Register
Oklahoma
Secretary of State
Office of Administrative Rules



Mary Fallin, Governor
Mike Hunter,

Secretary of State
Peggy Coe, Editor-in-Chief

THE OKLAHOMA REGISTER is an official publication of the State of Oklahoma. It is published semi-monthly on
the first working day of the month and on the first working day following the 14th day of the month under the authority
of 75 O.S., Sections 250 et seq. and OAC 655:10-15-1. The rules of the State of Oklahoma are codified and published
in the Oklahoma Administrative Code.

The Oklahoma Register and the documents accepted for publication are AVAILABLE FOR PUBLIC INSPECTION
at the Office of Administrative Rules pursuant to the Oklahoma Open Records Act. Copies of the Register are also
available for public inspection at many County Clerks' offices in Oklahoma, the Jan Eric Cartwright Memorial Law
Library in the State Capitol, and the following depository libraries:

Ada - East Central University, Linscheid Library
J.W. Martin Library

Bartlesville - Bartlesville Public Library
Claremore - Rogers State University, Stratton Taylor Library
Clinton - Clinton Public Library
Durant - Southeastern Oklahoma State University, H.G.

Bennett Memorial Library
Edmond - University of Central Oklahoma, Chambers Library
Enid - Enid Public Library
Goodwell - Oklahoma Panhandle State University, Marvin E.

McKee Library
Lawton - Lawton Public Library

McAlester - McAlester Public Library
Norman - University of Oklahoma, Bizzell Memorial

Library
Oklahoma City - Metropolitan Library System
Oklahoma City - Publications Clearinghouse,

Oklahoma Department of Libraries
Stillwater - Oklahoma State University, Edmon Low

Library
Tahlequah - Northeastern State University, John

Vaughan Library
Tulsa - Tulsa City-County Library
Weatherford - Southwestern Oklahoma State

University, Al Harris Library

CITE MATERIAL PUBLISHED IN THE OKLAHOMA REGISTER by the volume and the beginning page
number of the document in the Register. For example: 34 Ok Reg 256.

SUBSCRIPTION RATES for the Register are $500.00 per year for the printed issues and $300.00 per year for the
CD-ROM issues, payable in advance. When available, individual printed issues may be purchased for $20.00 plus the
cost of postage, payable in advance. Make checks payable to "Secretary of State." Send subscription requests, change
of address notices, and undelivered copies to: Secretary of State, Office of Administrative Rules, 421 NW 13th Street,
Suite 220, Oklahoma City, OK 73103.

INFORMATION ABOUT THIS PUBLICATION may be obtained by contacting the OAR by mail at Oklahoma
Secretary of State, Office of Administrative Rules, 421 NW 13th Street, Suite 220, Oklahoma City, OK 73103, by
phone at (405) 521-4911, or by fax at (405) 522-3555. Information may also be obtained by visiting the OAR's office,
located in Suite 220, Colcord Center, 421 NW 13th Street, Oklahoma City, between 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday
through Friday.

This publication is issued and printed by the Secretary of State as authorized by 75 O.S., Section 255. 43 copies have been prepared and
distributed at a cost of $95.57. Copies have been deposited with the Oklahoma Department of Libraries, Publications Clearinghouse.
ISSN 0030-1728



Table of Contents

Agency/Action/Subject Index . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . iii
Rules Affected Index . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . iv
Agency Index (Title numbers assigned) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . vi
Submissions to Governor and Legislature

Health Care Authority, Oklahoma (Title 317) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 445, 446, 447
Regents for Higher Education, State (Title 610) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 447, 448
Uniform Building Code Commission, Oklahoma (Title 748) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 448
Virtual Charter School Board, Statewide (Title 777) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 449
Wildlife Conservation, Department of (Title 800) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 450, 451

i



ii



Agency/Action/Subject Index
HEALTH Care Authority, Oklahoma (Title 317)

Submissions to Governor and Legislature
Administrative Operations (Chapter 1) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 445
Purchasing (Chapter 10) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 445
Medical Providers - Fee for Service (Chapter 30) . . . . . . . . . 445,

446, 447
Medical Assistance for Adults and Children - Eligibility

(Chapter 35) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 447
REGENTS for Higher Education, State (Title 610)

Submissions to Governor and Legislature
Student Financial Aid and Scholarships (Chapter 25) . . . . . 447,

448
UNIFORM Building Code Commission, Oklahoma
(Title 748)

Submissions to Governor and Legislature
Adopted Codes (Chapter 20) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 448

VIRTUAL Charter School Board, Statewide (Title 777)
Submissions to Governor and Legislature

Administrative Operations (Chapter 1) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 449
Statewide Virtual Charter Schools (Chapter 10) . . . . . . . . . . . 449
Oklahoma Supplemental Online Course Certification

(Chapter 15) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 449
WILDLIFE Conservation, Department of (Title 800)

Submissions to Governor and Legislature
Sport Fishing Rules (Chapter 10) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 450
Restriction on Aquatic Species Introduction

(Chapter 20) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 450
Wildlife Rules (Chapter 25) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 450
Department of Wildlife Lands Management

(Chapter 30) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 451

iii



Rules Affected Index
[(E) = Emergency action]

Rule Register Page Rule Register Page

40:1-1-1. . . . . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 95
40:20-1-3. . . . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 96
40:25-1-2. . . . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 98
40:25-1-3. . . . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 99
40:25-1-4. . . . . . . . . . . . [REVOKED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 99
165:5-21-3.1. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 53
165:25-1-11. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 121
165:25-3-6.28. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 123
165:59-1-1. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 5
165:59-1-2. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 6
165:59-1-3. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 6
165:59-1-4. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 6
165:59-1-7. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 8
165:59-3-1. . . . . . . . . . [REVOKED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 8
165:59-3-11. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 8
165:59-3-13. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 8
165:59-3-14. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 8
165:59-3-15. . . . . . . . . [REVOKED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 9
165:59-3-16. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 9
165:59-3-30. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10
165:59-3-32. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10
165:59-3-34. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10
165:59-3-36. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11
165:59-3-38. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11
165:59-3-40. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11
165:59-3-42. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11
165:59-3-44. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11
165:59-3-46. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 12
165:59-3-60. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 12
165:59-3-61. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 12
165:59-3-62. . . . . . . . . [REVOKED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 12
165:59-3-65. . . . . . . . . [RESERVED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14
165:59-3-66. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14
165:59-3-67. . . . . . . . . [RESERVED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 15
165:59-3-68. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 15
165:59-3-69. . . . . . . . . [RESERVED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16
165:59-3-70. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16
165:59-3-71. . . . . . . . . [RESERVED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 17
165:59-3-72. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 17
165:59-7-1. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 18
165:59-7-5. . . . . . . . . . [REVOKED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 21
165:59-7-6. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 21
165:59-7-7. . . . . . . . . . [REVOKED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 22
165:59-7-8. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 23
165:59-7-9. . . . . . . . . . [REVOKED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 23
165:59-7-10. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 24
165:59-7-13. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 24
165:59-7-15. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 24
165:59-7-17. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 24
165:59-7-18. . . . . . . . . [RESERVED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 24
165:59-7-19. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 24
165:59-9-1. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 25
165:59-9-3. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 25
165:59-9-5. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 26
165:59-9-6. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 26
165:59-9-11. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 26
165:59-9-13. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 27
165:59-9-15. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 27
165:59-9-17. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 27
165:59-9-21. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 27
165:59-9-23. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 27

165:59-9-25. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 28
165:59-9-27. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 29
165:59-9-29. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 29
175:20-1-1. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 437
175:20-1-2. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 437
175:20-3-1. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 438
175:20-5-1. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 438
175:20-5-2. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 439
175:20-5-3. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 439
175:20-5-4. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 440
175:20-5-5. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 440
175:20-5-6. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 440
175:20-5-7. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 440
175:20-7-1. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 440
175:20-9-1. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 441
175:20-9-2. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 441
175:20-9-3. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 441
175:20-9-4. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 442
175:20-11-1. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 442
175:20-13-1. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 442
175:20-15-1. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 442
317:2-1-2. . . . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 339
317:2-1-16. . . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 340
317:30-3-19.2. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 187
317:30-3-27. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 342
317:30-5-2. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 188
317:30-5-22. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 193
317:30-5-42.17. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 57
317:30-5-72.1. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 347
317:30-5-78. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 348
317:30-5-87. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 349
317:30-5-136. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 343
317:30-5-226. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 194
317:30-5-229. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 194
317:30-5-241.1. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 54
317:30-5-356. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 195
317:30-5-432.1. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 57
317:30-5-664.8. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 195
317:30-5-1090. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 350
317:30-5-1098. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 350
317:35-5-2. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 196
317:35-22-2. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 197
340:40-1-2. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 58
340:40-3-1. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 58
340:40-7-3. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 60
340:40-7-5. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 60
340:40-7-6. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 61
340:40-7-7. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 62
340:40-7-8. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 63
340:40-7-9. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 68
340:40-7-11. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 70
340:40-7-12. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 73
340:40-9-1. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 75
340:40-9-2. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 76
340:40-13-3. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 77
340:65-3-8. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 78
340:110-1-17. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 198
340:110-3-85. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 201
340:110-3-86. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 204
340:110-3-86.1. . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 206
340:110-3-88. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 207

iv



Rules Affected Index – continued

340:110-3-89.1. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 208
340:110-3-91.1. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 209
340:110-3-93. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 209
340:110-3-97.1. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 210
340:110-3-278. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 211
340:110-3-279. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 212
340:110-3-280. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 214
340:110-3-281.1. . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 215
340:110-3-281.2. . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 216
340:110-3-284. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 218
340:110-3-284.1. . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 220
340:110-3-284.2. . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 220
340:110-3-289. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 222
340:110-3-296. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 223
340:110-3-301. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 224
340:110, App. EE. . . . [REVOKED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 227
340:110, App. EE. . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 227
365:25-7-60. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 351
365:25-7-63. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 352
365:25-7-65. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 352
365:25-7-66. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 356
365:25-7-67. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 356
365:25-7-68. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 356
365:25-7-70. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 360
365:25-7-72. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 360
365:25-7-73. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 361
365:25, App. CC. . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 366
365:25, App. DD. . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 368
365:25, App. EE. . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 370
365:25, App. FF. . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 375
485:10-5-3.2. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 172
485:10-5-5.2. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 172
485:10-6-2. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 173
490:1-7-2. . . . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 443
490:10-3-3. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 444
595:11-11-1. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 293
595:11-11-2. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 293
595:11-11-3. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 294
595:11-11-4. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 294
595:11-11-5. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 295

595:11-11-6. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 296
595:11-11-7. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 297
595:11-11-8. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 297
595:11-11-9. . . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 297
595:11-11-10. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 297
595:11-11-11. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 297
595:11-11-12. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 298
595:11-11-13. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 298
595:11-11-14. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 299
595:11-11-15. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 299
595:11-11-16. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 300
595:11-11-17. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 300
595:11-11-18. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 300
595:11-11-19. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 301
595:11-11-20. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 301
595:11-11-21. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 301
595:11-11-22. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 302
595:11-11-23. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 302
595:11-11-24. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 302
595:11-11-25. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 302
595:11-11-26. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 302
595:11-11-27. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 303
595:40-1-9. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 303
710:45-9-81. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 80
710:45-9-82. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 80
710:45-9-83. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 80
710:45-9-84. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 80
710:50-3-35. . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 81
710:50-9-3. . . . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 81
710:50-15-50. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 82
710:50-15-74. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 82
710:50-15-76. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 84
710:50-15-90. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 85
710:50-15-103. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 85
710:50-15-104. . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 86
800:25-37-12. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 123
800:25-37-13. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 124
800:25-37-14. . . . . . . . [AMENDED] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 124
800:25-37-16. . . . . . . . [NEW] (E) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 125

v



Agency/Title Index
[Assigned as of 03-15-17]

Agency Title

Oklahoma ABSTRACTORS Board . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 5
Oklahoma ACCOUNTANCY Board . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 10
State ACCREDITING Agency . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 15
AD Valorem Task Force (abolished 7-1-93) . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 20
Oklahoma AERONAUTICS Commission . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 25
Board of Regents for the Oklahoma AGRICULTURAL and Mechanical

Colleges (exempted 11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 30
Oklahoma Department of AGRICULTURE, Food, and Forestry . . .. . . . 35
Oklahoma Board of Licensed ALCOHOL and Drug Counselors . . .. . . . 38
Board of Tests for ALCOHOL and Drug Influence . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 40
ALCOHOLIC Beverage Laws Enforcement Commission . . . . . .. . . . . . 45
ANATOMICAL Board of the State of Oklahoma . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 50
Board of Governors of the Licensed ARCHITECTS, Landscape

Architects and Registered Interior Designers of Oklahoma
(Formerly: Board of Governors of the Licensed ARCHITECTS
and Landscape Architects of Oklahoma; and Board of Governors of
the Licensed ARCHITECTS, Landscape Architects and Interior
Designers of Oklahoma . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 55

ARCHIVES and Records Commission . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 60
Board of Trustees for the ARDMORE Higher

Education Program (exempted 11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 65
Oklahoma ARTS Council . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 70
Oklahoma State ATHLETIC Commission (Formerly: Oklahoma

Professional BOXING Commission) - See Title 92
ATTORNEY General . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 75
State AUDITOR and Inspector . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 80
State BANKING Department . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 85
Oklahoma State Employees BENEFITS Council (consolidated under

Office of Management and Enterprise Services 8-26-11 - See Title
260) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 86

Oklahoma State Employees BENEFITS Council . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 87
Council of BOND Oversight . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 90
Oklahoma State ATHLETIC Commission (Formerly: Oklahoma

Professional BOXING Commission) . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 92
State BURIAL Board (abolished 7-1-92) . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 95
[RESERVED] . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 100
Oklahoma CAPITAL Investment Board . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 105
Oklahoma CAPITOL Improvement Authority . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . 110
State CAPITOL Preservation Commission . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 115
CAPITOL-MEDICAL Center Improvement and Zoning

Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 120
Oklahoma Department of CAREER and Technology Education

(Formerly: Oklahoma Department of VOCATIONAL and
Technical Education) - See Title 780

Board of Regents of CARL Albert State College (exempted
11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 125

Department of CENTRAL Services (Formerly: Office of PUBLIC
Affairs) - See Title 580

CEREBRAL Palsy Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 130
Commission on CHILDREN and Youth . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 135
Board of CHIROPRACTIC Examiners . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 140
Oklahoma Department of EMERGENCY Management

(Formerly: Department of CIVIL Emergency Management) . . .. . . 145
Oklahoma Department of COMMERCE . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 150
COMMUNITY Hospitals Authority . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 152
COMPSOURCE Oklahoma (Formerly: State INSURANCE

Fund) - See Title 370
Oklahoma CONSERVATION Commission . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 155
CONSTRUCTION Industries Board . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 158
Department of CONSUMER Credit . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 160
CORPORATION Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 165
Department of CORRECTIONS . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 170
State Board of COSMETOLOGY and Barbering . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 175
Oklahoma State CREDIT Union Board . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 180
CRIME Victims Compensation Board . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 185
Joint CRIMINAL Justice System Task Force Committee . . . . . .. . . . . . 190
Board of DENTISTRY . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 195
Oklahoma DEVELOPMENT Finance Authority . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 200

Agency Title

Office of DISABILITY Concerns (Formerly: Office of
HANDICAPPED Concerns) - See Title 305

Board of Regents of EASTERN Oklahoma State College (exempted
11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 205

EDGE Fund Policy Board . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 208
State Department of EDUCATION . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 210
EDUCATION Oversight Board (merged under Office of Educational

Quality and Accountability 7-1-14 - See Title 218) . . . . . . .. . . . . . . 215
Office of EDUCATIONAL Quality and Accountability . . . . . .. . . . . . . 218
Oklahoma EDUCATIONAL Television Authority . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 220
[RESERVED] . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 225
State ELECTION Board . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 230
Oklahoma FUNERAL Board (Formerly: Oklahoma State Board of

EMBALMERS and Funeral Directors) . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 235
Oklahoma Department of EMERGENCY Management

(Formerly: Department of CIVIL Emergency Management) -
See Title 145

Oklahoma EMPLOYMENT Security Commission . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . 240
Oklahoma ENERGY Resources Board . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 243
State Board of Licensure for Professional ENGINEERS and Land

Surveyors (Formerly: State Board of Registration for Professional
ENGINEERS and Land Surveyors) . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 245

Board of Trustees for the ENID Higher
Education Program (exempted 11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 250

Department of ENVIRONMENTAL Quality . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . 252
State Board of EQUALIZATION . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 255
ETHICS Commission (Title revoked) . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 257
ETHICS Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 258
Office of MANAGEMENT and Enterprise Services (Formerly: Office

of State FINANCE) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 260
State FIRE Marshal Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 265
Oklahoma Council on FIREFIGHTER Training . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 268
Oklahoma FIREFIGHTERS Pension and Retirement System . . . .. . . . . 270
[RESERVED] . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 275
FORENSIC Review Board . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 277
State Board of Registration for FORESTERS . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . 280
FOSTER Care Review Advisory Board . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 285
Oklahoma FUNERAL Board (Formerly: Oklahoma State Board of

Embalmers and Funeral Directors) - See Title 235
Oklahoma FUTURES . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 290
GOVERNOR (See also Title 1, Executive Orders) . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 295
GRAND River Dam Authority . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 300
Group Self-Insurance Association GUARANTY Fund Board . . . .. . . . . 302
Individual Self-Insured GUARANTY Fund Board . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 303
STATE Use Committee (Formerly: Committee on Purchases of Products

and Services of the Severely HANDICAPPED; consolidated
under Office of Management and Enterprise Services 8-26-11 - See
Title 260) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 304

Office of DISABILITY Concerns (Formerly: Office of
HANDICAPPED Concerns) . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 305

Oklahoma State Department of HEALTH . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 310
Oklahoma Basic HEALTH Benefits Board (abolished 11-1-97) . . . .. . . . 315
Oklahoma HEALTH Care Authority . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 317
HIGHWAY Construction Materials Technician Certification

Board . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 318
Oklahoma HISTORICAL Society . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 320
Oklahoma HORSE Racing Commission . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 325
Oklahoma HOUSING Finance Agency . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 330
Oklahoma HUMAN Rights Commission . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 335
Department of HUMAN Services . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 340
Committee for INCENTIVE Awards for State Employees . . . . . .. . . . . . 345
Oklahoma INDIAN Affairs Commission . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 350
Oklahoma INDIGENT Defense System . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 352
Oklahoma INDUSTRIAL Finance Authority . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . 355
INJURY Review Board . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 357
Oklahoma State and Education Employees Group INSURANCE Board

(consolidated under Office of Management and Enterprise Services
8-26-11 - See Title 260) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 360

INSURANCE Department . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 365

vi



Agency/Title Index – continued

Agency Title

COMPSOURCE Oklahoma
(Formerly: State INSURANCE Fund) . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 370

Oklahoma State Bureau of INVESTIGATION . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . 375
Council on JUDICIAL Complaints . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 376
Office of JUVENILE Affairs . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 377
Department of LABOR . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 380
Department of the Commissioners of the LAND Office . . . . . . .. . . . . . . 385
Council on LAW Enforcement Education and Training . . . . . . .. . . . . . . 390
Oklahoma LAW Enforcement Retirement System . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 395
Board on LEGISLATIVE Compensation . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 400
Oklahoma Department of LIBRARIES . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 405
LIEUTENANT Governor . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 410
Oklahoma LINKED Deposit Review Board . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 415
Oklahoma LIQUEFIED Petroleum Gas Board . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . 420
Oklahoma LIQUEFIED Petroleum Gas Research, Marketing and Safety

Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 422
LITERACY Initiatives Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 425
LONG-RANGE Capital Planning Commission . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . 428
Oklahoma State Board of Examiners for LONG-TERM Care

Administrators (Formerly: Oklahoma State Board of Examiners
for NURSING Home Administrators) - See Title 490

LOTTERY Commission, Oklahoma . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 429
Board of Trustees for the MCCURTAIN County Higher Education

Program (exempted 11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 430
Office of MANAGEMENT and Enterprise Services (Formerly: Office

of State FINANCE) - See Title 260
Commission on MARGINALLY Producing Oil and Gas Wells . . . .. . . . 432
State Board of MEDICAL Licensure and Supervision . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . 435
MEDICAL Technology and Research Authority of Oklahoma . . . .. . . . . 440
Board of MEDICOLEGAL Investigations . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 445
Department of MENTAL Health and Substance Abuse Services . . . .. . . . 450
MERIT Protection Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 455
MILITARY Planning Commission, Oklahoma Strategic . . . . . .. . . . . . . 457
Department of MINES . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 460
Oklahoma MOTOR Vehicle Commission . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 465
Board of Regents of MURRAY State College (exempted 11-1-98) . . .. . . 470
Oklahoma State Bureau of NARCOTICS and Dangerous Drugs

Control . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 475
Board of Regents of NORTHERN Oklahoma College (exempted

11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 480
Oklahoma Board of NURSING . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 485
Oklahoma State Board of Examiners for LONG-TERM Care

Administrators (Formerly: Oklahoma State Board of Examiners
for NURSING Home Administrators) . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 490

Board of Regents of OKLAHOMA City Community College (exempted
11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 495

Board of Regents of OKLAHOMA Colleges (exempted 11-1-98) . . .. . . . 500
Board of Examiners in OPTOMETRY . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 505
State Board of OSTEOPATHIC Examiners . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 510
PARDON and Parole Board . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 515
Oklahoma PEANUT Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 520
Oklahoma State PENSION Commission . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 525
State Board of Examiners of PERFUSIONISTS . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 527
Office of PERSONNEL Management (consolidated under Office

of Management and Enterprise Services 8-26-11 - See Title
260) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 530

Board of Commercial PET Breeders (abolished 7-1-12 - See Title
35) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 532

Oklahoma State Board of PHARMACY . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 535
PHYSICIAN Manpower Training Commission . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . 540
Board of PODIATRIC Medical Examiners . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 545
Oklahoma POLICE Pension and Retirement System . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . 550
State Department of POLLUTION Control (abolished 1-1-93) . . . .. . . . 555
POLYGRAPH Examiners Board . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 560
Oklahoma Board of PRIVATE Vocational Schools . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 565
State Board for PROPERTY and Casualty Rates

(abolished 7-1-06; see also Title 365) . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 570
State Board of Examiners of PSYCHOLOGISTS . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 575
Department of CENTRAL Services (Formerly: Office of PUBLIC

Affairs; consolidated under Office of Management and Enterprise
Services 8-26-11 - See Title 260) . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 580

Agency Title

PUBLIC Employees Relations Board . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 585
Oklahoma PUBLIC Employees Retirement System . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . 590
Department of PUBLIC Safety . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 595
REAL Estate Appraiser Board . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 600
Oklahoma REAL Estate Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 605
Board of Regents of REDLANDS Community College (exempted

11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 607
State REGENTS for Higher Education . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 610
State Department of REHABILITATION Services . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . 612
Board of Regents of ROGERS State College (exempted 11-1-98) . . .. . . . 615
Board of Regents of ROSE State College (exempted 11-1-98) . . . . .. . . . . 620
Oklahoma SAVINGS and Loan Board (abolished 7-1-93) . . . . . .. . . . . . 625
SCENIC Rivers Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 630
Oklahoma Commission on SCHOOL and County Funds

Management . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 635
Advisory Task Force on the Sale of SCHOOL Lands (functions

concluded 2-92) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 640
The Oklahoma School of SCIENCE and Mathematics . . . . . . .. . . . . . . 645
Oklahoma Center for the Advancement of SCIENCE and

Technology . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 650
SECRETARY of State . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 655
Department of SECURITIES . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 660
Board of Regents of SEMINOLE State College (exempted

11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 665
SHEEP and Wool Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 670
State Board of Licensed SOCIAL Workers . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 675
SOUTHERN Growth Policies Board . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 680
Oklahoma SOYBEAN Commission (abolished 7-1-97) . . . . . . .. . . . . . . 685
Board of Examiners for SPEECH-LANGUAGE Pathology and

Audiology (Formerly: Board of Examiners for SPEECH
Pathology and Audiology) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 690

STATE Employee Charitable Contributions, Oversight
Committee for (Formerly: STATE Agency
Review Committee) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 695

STATE Use Committee (Formerly: Committee on Purchases of Products
and Services of the Severely HANDICAPPED) –See Title 304

Oklahoma STUDENT Loan Authority . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 700
TASK Force 2000 . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 705
Oklahoma TAX Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 710
Oklahoma Commission for TEACHER Preparation (merged under

Office of Educational Quality and Accountability 7-1-14 - See Title
218) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 712

TEACHERS’ Retirement System . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 715
State TEXTBOOK Committee . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 720
TOBACCO Settlement Endowment Trust Fund . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . 723
Oklahoma TOURISM and Recreation Department . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 725
Department of TRANSPORTATION . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 730
Oklahoma TRANSPORTATION Authority (Name changed to

Oklahoma TURNPIKE Authority 11-1-05) - See Title 731
Oklahoma TURNPIKE Authority (Formerly: Oklahoma

TRANSPORTATION Authority AND Oklahoma TURNPIKE
Authority) - See also Title 745 . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 731

State TREASURER . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 735
Board of Regents of TULSA Community College (exempted

11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 740
Oklahoma TURNPIKE Authority (Name changed to Oklahoma

TRANSPORATION Authority 11-1-99 - no rules enacted in this
Title - See Title 731) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 745

Oklahoma UNIFORM Building Code Commission . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . 748
Board of Trustees for the UNIVERSITY Center at Tulsa (exempted

11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 750
UNIVERSITY Hospitals Authority . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 752
UNIVERSITY Hospitals Trust . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 753
Board of Regents of the UNIVERSITY of Oklahoma (exempted

11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 755
Board of Regents of the UNIVERSITY of Science and Arts

of Oklahoma (exempted 11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 760
Oklahoma USED Motor Vehicle and Parts Commission . . . . . . .. . . . . . . 765
Oklahoma Department of VETERANS Affairs . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . 770
Board of VETERINARY Medical Examiners . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . 775
Statewide VIRTUAL Charter School Board . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . 777

vii



Agency/Title Index – continued

Agency Title

Oklahoma Department of CAREER and Technology Education
(Formerly: Oklahoma Department of VOCATIONAL and
Technical Education) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 780

Oklahoma WATER Resources Board . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . 785
Board of Regents of WESTERN Oklahoma State College (exempted

11-1-98) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 790

Agency Title

Oklahoma WHEAT Commission . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 795
Department of WILDLIFE Conservation . . . . . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . . . . 800
WILL Rogers and J.M. Davis Memorials Commission . . . . . . .. . . . . . . 805
Oklahoma WORKERS' Compensation Commission . . . . . . .. . . . . . . . 810

viii



Submissions to Governor and Legislature
Within 10 calendar days after adoption by an agency of proposed PERMANENT rules, the agency must submit the rules to the

Governor and the Legislature. A "statement" of such submission must subsequently be published by the agency in the Register.
For additional information on submissions to the Governor/Legislature, see 75 O.S., Section 303.1 and 308.

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY

CHAPTER 1. ADMINISTRATIVE
OPERATIONS

[OAR Docket #17-151]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 3. Formal and Informal Procedures
317:1-3-4. [AMENDED]
(Reference APA WF # 16-21)

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 10, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-151; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY

CHAPTER 10. PURCHASING

[OAR Docket #17-152]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
317:10-1-1. [AMENDED]
317:10-1-3. [AMENDED]
317:10-1-4. [AMENDED]
317:10-1-12. [AMENDED]
317:10-1-16. [AMENDED]
(Reference APA WF # 16-22)

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 10, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-152; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY

CHAPTER 30. MEDICAL PROVIDERS - FEE
FOR SERVICE

[OAR Docket #17-143]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 5. Individual Providers and Specialties
Part 3. Hospitals
317:30-5-42.17. [AMENDED]
Part 45. Optometrists
317:30-5-432.1. [AMENDED]
(Reference APA WF # 16-02)

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 10, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-143; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY

CHAPTER 30. MEDICAL PROVIDERS - FEE
FOR SERVICE

[OAR Docket #17-144]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 5. Individual Providers and Specialties
Part 21. Outpatient Behavioral Health Agency Services
317:30-5-241.2. [AMENDED]
(Reference APA WF # 16-04)

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 10, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-144; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY

CHAPTER 30. MEDICAL PROVIDERS - FEE
FOR SERVICE

[OAR Docket #17-145]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 5. Individual Providers and Specialties
Part 26. Licensed Behavioral Health Providers
317:30-5-281. [AMENDED]
(Reference APA WF # 16-05)

March 15, 2017 445 Oklahoma Register (Volume 34, Number 13)



Submissions to Governor and Legislature

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 10, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-145; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY

CHAPTER 30. MEDICAL PROVIDERS - FEE
FOR SERVICE

[OAR Docket #17-146]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 5. Individual Providers and Specialties
Part 103. Qualified Schools as Providers of Health Related

Services
317:30-5-1027. [AMENDED]
Part 104. School - Based Case Management Services
317:30-5-1033. [AMENDED]
(Reference APA WF # 16-11)

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 10, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-146; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY

CHAPTER 30. MEDICAL PROVIDERS - FEE
FOR SERVICE

[OAR Docket #17-147]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 5. Individual Providers and Specialties
Part 1. Physicians
317:30-5-2. [AMENDED]
(Reference APA WF # 16-12)

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 10, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-147; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY

CHAPTER 30. MEDICAL PROVIDERS - FEE
FOR SERVICE

[OAR Docket #17-148]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 5. Individual Providers and Specialties
Part 6. Inpatient Psychiatric Hospitals
317:30-5-95.26. [AMENDED]
317:30-5-95.33. [AMENDED]
317:30-5-95.34. [AMENDED]
317:30-5-96.3. [AMENDED]
(Reference APA WF # 16-14)

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 10, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-148; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY

CHAPTER 30. MEDICAL PROVIDERS - FEE
FOR SERVICE

[OAR Docket #17-149]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 5. Individual Providers and Specialties
Part 1. Physicians
317:30-5-22. [AMENDED]
317:30-5-22.1. [AMENDED]
Part 19. Certified Nurse Midwives
317:30-5-226. [AMENDED]
317:30-5-229. [AMENDED]
Part 35. Rural Health Clinics
317:30-5-356. [AMENDED]
Part 75. Federally Qualified Health Centers
317:30-5-664.8. [AMENDED]
(Reference APA WF # 16-15A)

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 10, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-149; filed 2-10-17]

Oklahoma Register (Volume 34, Number 13) 446 March 15, 2017



Submissions to Governor and Legislature

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY

CHAPTER 30. MEDICAL PROVIDERS - FEE
FOR SERVICE

[OAR Docket #17-153]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 5. Individual Providers and Specialties
Part 75. Federally Qualified Health Centers
317:30-5-660.3. [AMENDED]
317:30-5-661.4. [AMENDED]
317:30-5-664.1. [AMENDED]
Part 110. Indian Health Services, Tribal Programs, and

Urban Indian Clinics (I/T/US)
317:30-5-1087. [AMENDED]
317:30-5-1090. [AMENDED]
317:30-5-1094. [AMENDED]
317:30-5-1098. [AMENDED]
(Reference APA WF # 16-23)

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 10, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-153; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY

CHAPTER 30. MEDICAL PROVIDERS - FEE
FOR SERVICE

[OAR Docket #17-154]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 5. Individual Providers and Specialties
Part 1. Physicians
317:30-5-20. [AMENDED]
(Reference APA WF # 16-26)

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 10, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-154; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY

CHAPTER 30. MEDICAL PROVIDERS - FEE
FOR SERVICE

[OAR Docket #17-155]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 5. Individual Providers and Specialties
Part 3. Hospitals
317:30-5-42.16. [AMENDED]
Part 61. Home Health Agencies
317:30-5-546. [AMENDED]
(Reference APA WF # 16-27)

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 10, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-155; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY

CHAPTER 35. MEDICAL ASSISTANCE FOR
ADULTS AND CHILDREN - ELIGIBILITY

[OAR Docket #17-150]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 5. Eligibility and Countable Income
Part 1. Determination of Qualifying Categorical

Relationships
317:35-5-2. [AMENDED]
Subchapter 22. Pregnancy Related Benefits Covered Under

Title XXI
317:35-22-2. [AMENDED]
(Reference APA WF # 16-15B)

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 10, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-150; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 610. STATE REGENTS FOR HIGHER
EDUCATION

CHAPTER 25. STUDENT FINANCIAL AID
AND SCHOLARSHIPS

[OAR Docket #17-139]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

March 15, 2017 447 Oklahoma Register (Volume 34, Number 13)



Submissions to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 1. Academic Scholars Program
610:25-1-3. General principles for operation of program

[AMENDED]
610:25-1-4. Eligibility Requirements and Term of

Scholarship Award [AMENDED]
SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 9, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-139; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 610. STATE REGENTS FOR HIGHER
EDUCATION

CHAPTER 25. STUDENT FINANCIAL AID
AND SCHOLARSHIPS

[OAR Docket #17-140]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 7. Oklahoma Tuition Aid Grant Program
610:25-7-6. Eligibility; amount of grant; application

procedures and deadlines; disbursement of funds
[AMENDED]

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 9, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-140; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 610. STATE REGENTS FOR HIGHER
EDUCATION

CHAPTER 25. STUDENT FINANCIAL AID
AND SCHOLARSHIPS

[OAR Docket #17-141]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 23. Oklahoma Higher Learning Access

Program
610:25-23-4. Program Requirements [AMENDED]

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 9, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-141; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 610. STATE REGENTS FOR HIGHER
EDUCATION

CHAPTER 25. STUDENT FINANCIAL AID
AND SCHOLARSHIPS

[OAR Docket #17-142]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 33. Regional University Baccalaureate

Scholarship Program
610:25-33-4. Eligibility Requirements [AMENDED]
610:25-33-5. Criteria for Continued Eligibility

[AMENDED]
SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 9, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-142; filed 2-10-17]

TITLE 748. OKLAHOMA UNIFORM
BUILDING CODE COMMISSION
CHAPTER 20. ADOPTED CODES

[OAR Docket #17-159]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission of submission to Governor and Legislature

PROPOSED RULES:
Subchapter 1. IBC® 2015
748:20-1-1. Adoption of International Building Code®,

2015 Edition (IBC® 2015) [AMENDED]
748:20-1-9. IBC® 2015 Chapter 4 Special Detailed

Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy
[AMENDED]

748:20-1-18. IBC® 2015 Chapter 35 Referenced Standards
[AMENDED]

Subchapter 3. IFC® 2015
748:20-3-1. Adoption of International Fire Code®, 2015

Edition (IFC® 2015) [AMENDED]
748:20-3-7. IFC® 2015 Chapter 2 Definitions

[AMENDED]
748:20-3-13.1. IFC® 2015 Chapter 57 Flammable

Combustible Liquids [RENUMBERED TO
748:20-3.13.4.]

748:20-3-13.2. IFC® 2015 Chapter 23 Motor
Fuel-Dispensing Facilities and Repair Garages [NEW]

748:20-3-13.3. IFC® 2015 Chapter 55 Cryogenic Fluids
[NEW]

748:20-3-13.4. IFC® 2015 Chapter 57 Flammable and
Combustible Liquids [NEW]

748:20-3-13.5. IFC® 2015 Chapter 61 Liquid Petroleum
Gases [NEW]

748:20-3-14. IFC® 2015 Chapter 80 Referenced Standards
[AMENDED]

Oklahoma Register (Volume 34, Number 13) 448 March 15, 2017



Submissions to Governor and Legislature

Subchapter 5. IRC® 2015
748:20-5-3. IRC® 2015 Appendices [AMENDED]
748:20-5-28. Appendix Y, Residential Tornado Provisions

[AMENDED]
Subchapter 7. IEBC® 2015
748:20-7-1. Adoption of International Existing Building

Code®, 2015 Edition (IEBC® 2015) [AMENDED]
748:20-7-9. IEBC® 2015 Chapter 16 Referenced Standards

[AMENDED]
Subchapter 9. NEC® 2014
748:20-9-1. NEC® 2014 Adoption of National Electrical

Code®, 2014 Edition (NEC® 2014) [AMENDED]
748:20-9-7. NEC® 2014 Chapter 5 Special Occupancies

[AMENDED]
Subchapter 11. IFGC® 2015
748:20-11-1. Adoption of International Fuel Gas Code®,

2015 Edition (IFGC® 2015) [AMENDED]
748:20-11-6.1. IFGC® 2015 Chapter 2 Definitions [NEW]
748:20-11-8. IFGC® 2015 Chapter 4 Gas Piping

Installations [AMENDED]
784:20-11-10. IFGC® 2015 Chapter 8 Referenced

Standards [AMENDED]
Subchapter 13. IMC® 2015
748:20-13-1. Adoption of International Mechanical Code®,

2015 Edition (IMC® 2015) [AMENDED]
748:20-13-9. IMC® 2015 Chapter 5 Exhaust Systems

[AMENDED]
748:20-13-11. IMC® 2015 Chapter 15 Referenced

Standards [AMENDED]
Subchapter 15. IPC® 2015
748:20-15-1. Adoption of International Plumbing Code®,

2015 Edition (IPC® 2015) [AMENDED]
748:20-15-8. IPC® 2015 Chapter 3 General Regulations

[AMENDED]
748:20-15-17. IPC® 2015 Chapter 15 Referenced

Standards [AMENDED]
SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 23, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-159; filed 2-23-17]

TITLE 777. STATEWIDE VIRTUAL
CHARTER SCHOOL BOARD

CHAPTER 1. ADMINISTRATIVE
OPERATIONS

[OAR Docket #17-160]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 1. General Provisions
777:1-1-5 [AMENDED]

777:1-1-9 [AMENDED]
SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 23, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-160; filed 2-23-17]

TITLE 777. STATEWIDE VIRTUAL
CHARTER SCHOOL BOARD

CHAPTER 10. STATEWIDE VIRTUAL
CHARTER SCHOOLS

[OAR Docket #17-161]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 1. General Provisions
777:10-1-2 [AMENDED]
777:10-1-3 [NEW]
Subchapter 3. Statewide Virtual Charter School

Sponsorship
777:10-3-3 [AMENDED]
777:10-3-4 [NEW]
777:10-3-5 [AMENDED]
Subchapter 5. Statewide Virtual Charter School Facilities
777:10-5-3 [AMENDED]

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 23, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-161; filed 2-23-17]

TITLE 777. STATEWIDE VIRTUAL
CHARTER SCHOOL BOARD
CHAPTER 15. OKLAHOMA

SUPPLEMENTAL ONLINE COURSE
CERTIFICATION

[OAR Docket #17-162]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
777:15-1-1 [NEW]
777:15-1-2 [NEW]
777:15-1-3 [NEW]
777:15-1-4 [NEW]
777:15-1-5 [NEW]
777:15-1-6 [NEW]
777:15-1-7 [NEW]
777:15-1-8 [NEW]
777:15-1-9 [NEW]

March 15, 2017 449 Oklahoma Register (Volume 34, Number 13)



Submissions to Governor and Legislature

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 23, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-162; filed 2-23-17]

TITLE 800. DEPARTMENT OF WILDLIFE
CONSERVATION

CHAPTER 10. SPORT FISHING RULES

[OAR Docket #17-155A]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 1. Harvest and Possession Limits
800:10-1-4. Size limits on fish [AMENDED]
Subchapter 3. Methods of Taking
800:10-3-5. Use of bow and arrow, grabhooks, gigs,

spears, and spearguns, snagging, noodling and netting
[AMENDED]

Subchapter 5. Area Restrictions and Special Fees
800:10-5-3. Designated trout areas [AMENDED]
800:10-5-6. Lakes, reservoirs, rivers and streams

[AMENDED]
SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 9, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-155A; filed 2-15-17]

TITLE 800. DEPARTMENT OF WILDLIFE
CONSERVATION

CHAPTER 20. RESTRICTION ON AQUATIC
SPECIES INTRODUCTION

[OAR Docket #17-156]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 2. Fish Introductions of Fish and Aquatic

Organisms in Waters of the State
800:20-2-3. Introduction of Fish and Aquatic Organisms

[NEW]
SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 9, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-156; filed 2-15-17]

TITLE 800. DEPARTMENT OF WILDLIFE
CONSERVATION

CHAPTER 25. WILDLIFE RULES

[OAR Docket #17-157]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 3. Hunting on Corps of Engineers Lands
800:25-3-2. Areas open to archery equipment and shotguns

with pellets only [AMENDED]
800:25-3-3. Areas open to archery equipment only

[AMENDED]
800:25-3-5. Areas open to archery equipment and all

legal firearms other than centerfire rifles and handguns
[AMENDED]

Subchapter 7. General Hunting Seasons
Part 1. General Provisions
800:25-7-3. General provisions [AMENDED]
Part 7. Falconry
800:25-7-31. Taking provisions [AMENDED]
Part 12. Antelope
800:25-7-47. General provisions for antelope - archery

[AMENDED]
Part 14. Elk
800:25-7-56. General provisions for elk [AMENDED]
Part 19. Season on Areas Owned or Managed by the

Oklahoma Department of Wildlife Conservation and the
U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service

800:25-7-86.1. Camp Gruber Maneuver Training Center
(CGMTCCGTC) [AMENDED]

800:25-7-97. Fobb Bottom WMA [AMENDED]
800:25-7-108. Hickory Creek WMA [AMENDED]
800:25-7-120. Love Valley WMA [AMENDED]
Part 25. Oklahoma Land Access Program [NEW]
800:25-7-180. General provisions for OLAP walk-in areas

[NEW]
800:25-7-181. OLAP walk-in hunting areas, seasons, and

equipment restrictions [NEW]
800:25-7-182. OLAP wildlife-viewing areas, seasons, and

equipment restrictions [NEW]
Subchapter 9. Controlled Hunts
Part 3. Antelope
800:25-9-12. General Antelope Regulation [AMENDED]
Subchapter 37. Nuisance Wildlife Control Program
Part 3. Wildlife and Feral Hog Nuisance and Depredation

Rules
800:25-37-12. General Provisions [AMENDED]
800:25-37-13. Exemptions [AMENDED]
800:5-37-14. Specific Provisions [AMENDED]
800:25-37-16. Feral swine night shooting exemptions

[NEW]
Subchapter 40. Oklahoma Land Access Program [NEW]
800:25-40-1. Purpose [NEW]
800:25-40-2. Definitions [NEW]

Oklahoma Register (Volume 34, Number 13) 450 March 15, 2017



Submissions to Governor and Legislature

800:25-40-3. Qualifications and enrollment procedures
[NEW]

800:25-40-4. Lease agreement [NEW]
800:25-40-5. Compensation [NEW]
800:25-40-6. Landowner responsibilities [NEW]
800:25-40-7. Department responsibilities [NEW]
800:25-40-8. OLAP sportsperson responsibilities [NEW]
800:25-40-9. Right to deny access [NEW]

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 9, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-157; filed 2-15-17]

TITLE 800. DEPARTMENT OF WILDLIFE
CONSERVATION

CHAPTER 30. DEPARTMENT OF
WILDLIFE LANDS MANAGEMENT

[OAR Docket #17-158]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission to Governor and Legislature

RULES:
Subchapter 1. Use of Department Managed Lands
800:30-1-8. Language, disorderly assemblage, noise or

other disruptive acts [AMENDED]
800:30-1-14. Firearms [AMENDED]
800:30-1-16. Shooting ranges [AMENDED]

SUBMISSION OF ADOPTED RULES TO GOVERNOR
AND LEGISLATURE:

February 9, 2017

[OAR Docket #17-158; filed 2-15-17]

March 15, 2017 451 Oklahoma Register (Volume 34, Number 13)



Oklahoma Register (Volume 34, Number 13) 452 March 15, 2017


