\Volume 29
Number 23
August 15, 2012
Pages 1786 - 1802

The
Oklahoma

Registet

Oklahoma
Secretary of State
Office of Administrative Rules



Mary Fallin, Governor
V. Glenn Coffee,
Secretary of State
Peggy Coe, Editor-in-Chief

THE OKLAHOMA REGISTER is an official publication of the State of Oklahoma. It is published semi-monthly on
the first working day of the month and on the first working day following the 14th day of the month under the authority
of 75 O.S., Sections 250 et seq. and OAC 655:10-15-1. The rules of the State of Oklahoma are codified and published
in the Oklahoma Administrative Code.

The Oklahoma Register and the documents accepted for publication are AVAILABLE FOR PUBLIC INSPECTION
at the Office of Administrative Rules pursuant to the Oklahoma Open Records Act. Copies of the Register are also
available for public inspection at many County Clerks' offices in Oklahoma, the Jan Eric Cartwright Memorial Law
Library in the State Capitol, and the following depository libraries:

Ada - East Central University, Linscheid Library Norman - University of Oklahoma, Bizzell Memorial
Alva - Northwestern Oklahoma State University, Library
J.W. Martin Library Oklahoma City - Metropolitan Library System
Bartlesville - Bartlesville Public Library Oklahoma City - Oklahoma Department of Libraries
Claremore - Rogers State University, Stratton Taylor Library Stillwater - Oklahoma State University, Edmon Low
Clinton - Clinton Public Library Library
Durant - Southeastern Oklahoma State University, H.G. Tahlequah - Northeastern State University, John
Bennett Memorial Library Vaughan Library
Edmond - University of Central Oklahoma, Chambers Library ~ Tulsa - Tulsa City-County Library System
Enid - Public Library of Enid and Garfield County Tulsa - University of Tulsa, McFarlin Library
Goodwell - Oklahoma Panhandle State University Weatherford - Southwestern Oklahoma State
Lawton - Lawton Public Library University, Al Harris Library

McAlester - McAlester Public Library

CITE MATERIAL PUBLISHED IN THE OKLAHOMA REGISTER by the volume and the beginning page
number of the document in the Register. For example: 29 Ok Reg 256.

SUBSCRIPTION RATES for the Register are $500.00 per year for the printed issues and $300.00 per year for the
CD-ROM issues, payable in advance. When available, individual printed issues may be purchased for $20.00 plus the
cost of postage, payable in advance. Make checks payable to "Secretary of State." Send subscription requests, change
of address notices, and undelivered copies to: Secretary of State, Office of Administrative Rules, 2300 N. Lincoln
Boulevard, Suite 101, Oklahoma City, OK 73105.

INFORMATION ABOUT THIS PUBLICATION may be obtained by contacting the OAR by mail at Oklahoma
Secretary of State, Office of Administrative Rules, 2300 North Lincoln Boulevard, Suite 101, Oklahoma City, OK
73105, by phone at (405) 521-4911, or by fax at (405) 522-3555. Information may also be obtained by visiting the
OAR's office, located in Room 220, Will Rogers Building, 2401 N. Lincoln Boulevard, Oklahoma City, between 8:00
a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday.

This publication is issued and printed by the Secretary of State as authorized by 75 O.S., Section 255. 53 copies have been prepared and
distributed at a cost of $161.69. Copies have been deposited with the Oklahoma Department of Libraries, Publications Clearinghouse.
ISSN 0030-1728



Table of Contents

Agency/ACtION/SUDJECT INAEX ... o iii
Rules Affected INeX ... oo e iv
Agency Index (Title numbersassigned) ... e XX
Notices of Rulemaking Intent

Uniform Building Code Commission (Title 748) ... ... e e 1786
Emergency Adoptions

Health Care Authority, Oklahoma (Title 317) ... i e i i 1788,1793

Human Services, Department of (Title 340) ... ... i e 1795

Public Safety, Department of (Title 595) . ... .. i 1795, 1796

Real Estate Appraiser Board (Title 600) . .........oiuinii e 1799
EXecutive Orders (Title 1) .. ..o e 1800






GOVERNOR
Executive Orders
Ordering flags at half-staff to honor victims of shooting in
Aurora, Colorado (12-19) 1800
Ordering flags at half-staff to honor former State Senator Gene
Stipe (12-20) 1800
Declaring disaster emergency caused by wildfires and drought

in Oklahoma (12-21) ......oovviiiiiii e 1800
HEALTH Care Authority, Oklahoma (Title 317)
Emergency Adoptions
Medical Providers-Fee for Service (Chapter 30) ......... 1788
Developmental Disabilities Services (Chapter 40) ....... 1793
HUMAN Services, Department of (Title 340)
Emergency Adoptions
Administrative Components (Chapter2) ................. 1795

Agency/Action/Subject Index

PUBLIC Safety, Department of (Title 595)
Emergency Adoptions
Class D Driver Licenses and Identification Cards and Motor

License Agent Procedures (Chapter 10) ............... 1795
Special Traffic-Related Enforcement Designation
(Chapter 70) ... 1796
REAL Estate Appraiser Board (Title 600)
Emergency Adoptions
Licensure and Certification Requirements
(Chapter 10) ..ot 1799
UNIFORM Building Code Commission (Title 748)
Notices of Rulemaking Intent
General Provisions (Chapter3) ..........ccoevvviiiinennns 1786
Fees and Collection of Fees (Chapter5) .................. 1786



Rules Affected Index

[(E) = Emergency action]

Rule Register Page
10:15-23-2.1. ... ..... [NEWT(E) © .o, 95
10:15-23-2.1. ........ [NEW] ... 1687
10:15-25-4. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........cevvenn. .. 96
10:15-25-4. ......... [AMENDED] ...t 1688
25:15-1-2............ [AMENDED] ............ovvivinn 451
25:15-1-3............ [AMENDED] ...........cccoviiiin. 452
25:15-1-4............ [AMENDED] ..........cooiiiiiit. 453
25:30-1-2............ [AMENDED] ............coovvivnnt 457
25:30-1-3............ [AMENDED] ...........cccovnnnn. 458
25:30-3-4............ [AMENDED] ..........ccoiiiiit. 458
25:30-7-1............ [AMENDED] ............oovvivnnn 458
25:30-7-3............ [AMENDED] ...........ccovnnnn. 459
25:30-9-3............ [AMENDED] ..........ccooiiiit. 459
35:2-3-10............ [REVOKED] .....covviviiienn 583
35:3-1-3. ... [NEW] ..o 1688
35:3-15. ..o [NEW] ©oo 895
35:10-1-3............ [AMENDED] ............covviiinn 584
35:13-1-1............ [AMENDED] ...........ccovvnnn. 1689
35:13-1-2. ...l [AMENDED] ............cooiiit. 1689
35:15-3-2...... ... ... [AMENDED] ............oovvivnn, 897
35:15-5-1. ........... [AMENDED] ............ccoovunt, 1690
35:15-11-52. ........ [AMENDED] ..........ccoiiiiiit. 898
35:15-11-53. ........ [AMENDED] ............ovvivinn 899
35:15-11-54. ........ [AMENDED] ..........cccoviiinn. 899
35:15-11-55. ........ [AMENDED] ...........c.ciiiiit. 901
35:15-11-56. ........ [AMENDED] ............covvvinn, 902
35:15-15-72. ........ [REVOKED] .....ovvviveei. 902
35:15-36-3. ......... [AMENDED] .............ooiat. 1691
35:15-42-51. ........ [AMENDED] ..................... 1692
35:15-44-4, ......... [AMENDED] ...........c.covinnn 1692
35:15-44-6. ......... [AMENDED] ............coiiiat. 1693
35:15-45-37. ........ [REVOKED] .......oovvvvviinn, 1691
35:15-45-39. ........ [AMENDED] ............cooviit 1691
35:15-45-132. ....... [AMENDED] .............ooiat. 1693
35:15-47-6. ......... [AMENDED] ..................... 1693
35:17-36............ [AMENDED] ...........cccvvnnn. 903
35:17-3-11. ......... [AMENDED] ..........coooiiiiit. 906
35:17-3-13. ......... [AMENDED] ............covviinnn 909
35:17-3-14. ......... [AMENDED] ..........cccoviiiin. 910
35:17-3-25. ......... [AMENDED] ..........ccoiiiiiit. 911
35:17-4-4............ [AMENDED] ............covvivnnn, 913
35:17-4-9............ [AMENDED] ..........c.ccoviiiiit. 914
35:17-4-11. ......... [AMENDED] ...t 916
35:17-4-12. ......... [AMENDED] ............coovvivinn 917
35:17-4-21. ......... [AMENDED] ..........cccovviiinn. 918
35:17-5-11. ......... [AMENDED] .............otat. 1694
35:17-7-8............ [AMENDED] ..................... 1695
35:30-17-13. ........ [AMENDED] ..........ccooiiiiin. 585
35:30-17-89.1. ....... [AMENDED] ...........c.iiiiit. 585
35:30-43-1. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o, 351
35:30-43-2. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o, 351
35:37-3-1............ [AMENDED] ...........cccooiiiiit. 586
35:37-3-3............ [AMENDED] ............oovvivnnn, 586
35:37-5-1............ [AMENDED] ...........cccvvnnn. 586
35:37-5-2. ... [AMENDED] ..........cccoiiiit. 586
35:40-15-1. ......... [NEW] ... 587
35:40-15-2. ......... [NEW] oo 587
35:40-15-3. ......... [NEW] ... 587
35:40-15-4, ......... [NEW] ... 588
35:40-15-5. ......... [NEW] oo 588
35:40-15-6. ......... [NEW] ... 588

Rule Register Page
35:40-15-7. ......... [NEW] ... 588
35:144-1-2. ... ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ovvvee. .. 352
35:44-1-2. ... ....... [AMENDED] ...........cccvv.. 920
35:44-1-3............ [AMENDED] .................. ... 921
35:44-3-3............ [AMENDED] .............ccoovit 921
35:55-1-1. ........... [NEW](E) ..o, 1748
35:55-1-2. ... ... [NEW](E) oo, 1748
35:55-1-3. ... .onn . [NEWI(E) ..o, 1748
35:55-1-4, ........... [NEWI(E) ..o, 1749
35:55-1-5. . .......... [NEWJ(E) oo 1749
35:55-16. ... ...... .. [NEWI(E) ..o, 1750
35:55-1-7. ...t [NEWI(E) ..o, 1750
35:55-1-8............ [NEWJ(E) ..o 1750
35:55-1-9. ... ........ [NEWI(E) oo, 1750
35:55-1-10. ......... [NEWI(E) ..o 1750
35:55-1-11. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o 1751
35:55-1-12. ......... [NEWI(E) ..o, 1751
35:55-1-13. ......... [NEWI(E) ..o, 1751
35:55-3-1............ [NEWJ(E) ..o 1751
35:55-3-2. ..o, [NEWI(E) ..o, 1751
35:55-3-3............ [NEWI(E) ..o, 1751
35:55-3-4. . .......... [NEWJ(E) ..o 1752
35:55-3-5. ..., [NEWI(E) ..o, 1752
35:55-3-6. ........... [NEWI(E) ..o, 1753
35:55-3-7. ..o [NEWT(E) oo, 1753
35:55-3-8. ... .o, [NEWI(E) ..o, 1753
35:55-3-9. ........... [NEWI(E) ..o, 1753
35:55-3-10. ......... [NEW](E) oo, 1753
35:55-5-1. ... ..., [NEWI(E) ..o, 1753
35:55-5-2, ... ........ [NEWI(E) ..o, 1754
35:55-5-3. ... [NEWT(E) oo, 1754
35:55-5-4. ... ..., [NEWI(E) ..o, 1754
35:55-5-5, ... ........ [NEWI(E) ..o, 1756
35:55-7-1. ..o [NEW](E) oo, 1756
35:55-7-2. ..o [NEWI(E) ..o, 1756
35:55-7-3. ..., [NEWI(E) ..o, 1757
35:55-7-4. ........... [NEWT(E) oo, 1757
35:55-7-5. ... oei . [NEWI(E) ..o, 1757
35:55-7-6. ........... [NEWI(E) ..o, 1757
55:10-1-3............ [AMENDED] ................... ... 921
55:10-3-3............ [AMENDED] .............ccovvt 923
55:10-3-6............ [AMENDED] ...........cccvv.. 923
55:10-3-11. ......... [AMENDED] .................. ... 923
55:10-3-13. ......... [AMENDED] .............coovit 923
55:10-5-1. ........... [AMENDED] ................ott 924
55:10-5-2. ........... [AMENDED] .................. ... 924
55:10-5-4............ [AMENDED] .............ccovvt, 924
55:10-5-5. ........... [AMENDED] ..............iut 924
55:10-5-6............ [AMENDED] .................. ... 924
55:10-5-7............ [AMENDED] .............ccovit, 925
55:10-5-8............ [AMENDED] ...........ocovv.. 925
55:10-5-10. ......... [AMENDED] .................. ... 925
55:10-5-11. ......... [AMENDED] .............ccovut, 927
55:10-7-1............ [AMENDED] ...........ocovvn.. 928
55:10-7-2............ [AMENDED] .................. ... 928
55:10-7-9............ [AMENDED] .............coovit 928
55:10-9-1............ [AMENDED] ...........coocvvn.. 929
55:10-9-6............ [AMENDED] .................. ... 929
55:10-9-8............ [AMENDED] .............ccovvt 929
55:10-9-10. ......... [AMENDED] ...........cccvven.. 929
55:10-11-7. ......... [AMENDED] .................. ... 930



Rules Affected Index — continued

55:10-11-9. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccoovviii., 930
55:10-11-10. ........ [AMENDED] ...........covenin.. 931
55:10-13-1. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccoovvveei.. 931
55:10-13-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........c.oovvein., 932
55:10-13-4. ......... [AMENDED] ...........coveni.. 932
55:10-13-5. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccoovvneei.. 932
55:10-13-6. ......... [AMENDED] ........c.oovveeni., 932
55:10-13-7. ......... [AMENDED] ..........ccovenin., 933
55:10-13-8. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccoovvvueei.. 933
55:10-13-9. ......... [AMENDED] ........c.oovvenn.. 933
55:10-13-10. ........ [AMENDED] ...........coveenin.. 933
55:10-13-12. ........ [AMENDED] .......ccoovviveei.. 933
55:10-13-13. ........ [AMENDED] ........c.oovvveii., 933
55:10-13-16. ........ [AMENDED] ..........ccoveni.. 933
55:10-13-20. ........ [AMENDED] ........c0ovvveei.. 934
55:10-15-4. ......... [AMENDED] ..........oovveeni.. 934
55:10-15-9. ......... [AMENDED] ...........covveni.. 934
55:10-15-11. ........ [AMENDED] ........covvnveii.. 934
55:10-17-6. ......... [AMENDED] ........c.oovveeni., 934
55:10-17-7. ......... [AMENDED] ...........covenin.. 935
55:10-17-9. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccoovvvveei.. 935
55:10-17-10. ........ [AMENDED] ..........oovveeni., 935
55:10-17-12. ........ [AMENDED] ...........coveeni.. 936
75:15-1-1.1. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccoovvvnn.. 1759
75:15-1-2. ... ... [AMENDED] ..........ooovvenn.. 1760
75:15-2-1. ... ... ... [AMENDED] ............cvenn.. 1763
75:15-2-2. ... [AMENDED] .......ccoovevnn.. 1765
75:15-2-3............ [AMENDED] ...........covvenn.. 1765
75:15-2-4. ... ........ [AMENDED] ............ccoenn.. 1766
75:15-5-3. ... ........ [AMENDED] .......ccvoevnnn.. 1766
75:15-5-3.1. ......... [AMENDED] ........c.oovvvnn.. 1766
75:5-7-1 ... [AMENDED] ............cvenn.. 1767
75:15-7-5. ... ... [AMENDED] .......ccvoennenn.. 1768
75:15-7-6. . .......... [AMENDED] ...........covvnn.. 1768
75:15-7-9. . .......... [AMENDED] ............cvnn.. 1768
75:15-13-1. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccooevnnn.. 1769
75:15-17-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........c.ocovvnn.. 1769
75:25-1-2. ... ...... [AMENDED] ............coenn.. 1770
75:25-1-2.1. ......... INEW] ©.o 1770
75:25-1-3............ [AMENDED] ........c.oovvvenn... 1771
75:25-3-1............ [AMENDED] ............cvenn.. 1773
75:25-3-4. . .......... [AMENDED] .......ccoovnvnn... 1774
75:25-3-6............ [AMENDED] ........c.ocovvnn... 1776
75:25-3-13. ......... [AMENDED] ............cvnn.. 1776
75:25-3-15. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccoovevnn.. 1776
75:25-3-16. ......... [AMENDED] ........c.oovvvnn.. 1776
75:25-5-3. . .......... [AMENDED] ............cvenn.. 1776
75:25-5-19. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccoovevnn.. 1777
75:25-5-20. ......... [AMENDED] ..........oovvvnn.. 1777
75:25-5-21. ......... [AMENDED] ............cvnn.. 1778
87:10-1-2. ........... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 11
87:10-17-3. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........covvenne. .. 12
87:10-19-1. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........covveenn.... 14
92:10-1-2. . .......... [AMENDED] .......ccoovvnnn.. 1696
92:10-1-5. ........... [AMENDED] ..........ocovvenn.. 1697
92:10-1-8............ [AMENDED] ............ccoenn.. 1697
120:10-5-25. ........ [AMENDED] .......ccvoennn.. 1698
120:10-15-16. ....... INEW] ..o 1700
160:5-1-2. ... ........ [AMENDED] ...........coovenn., 936
165:5-1-3. ... ........ [AMENDED] .......ccooveneei.. 939
165:5-1-5. ... ........ [AMENDED] ..........oovvenn.. 939
165:5-1-26. ......... [AMENDED] ...........covennn., 940
165:5-3-1. ........... [AMENDED] .......ccoovvveei.. 947
165:5-5-1. ........... [AMENDED] ........c.oovveii., 940
165:5-7-6.1. ......... INEW] ..o 942
165:5-7-6.2. ......... INEW] ©ooe e 942

165:5-7-9............ [AMENDED] ................oot. 943

165:5-7-27. ......... [AMENDED] ..............coitt 944
165:5-7-35.1. ........ [NEW] ... 945
165:5-9-2............ [AMENDED] .............coiniet 946
165:5-9-3............ [AMENDED] ...............ooitt 947
165:10-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] ...............oi0t 950
165:10-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] .............cooiiint 950
165:10-3-4. ......... [AMENDED] ...............oit e 950
165:10-3-10. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oooi0t 950
165:10-3-28. ........ [AMENDED] ...t 950
165:10-5-5. ......... [AMENDED] ..............cooit e 950
165:10-7-5. ......... [AMENDED] ..............ooitt 950
165:10-7-16. ........ [AMENDED] .............coiiitt 950
165:10-7-19. ........ [AMENDED] ...............ooo0 e 950
165:10-7-20. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oooitt 950
165:10-7-24. ........ [AMENDED] .............coivitt 950
165:10-9-1. ......... [AMENDED] ...............oi0 e 950
165:10-9-2. ......... [AMENDED] ..............oooi0t 950
165:10-9-3. ......... [AMENDED] .............ccoovitt 950
165:10-9-4. ......... [AMENDED] ..............ooit e 950
165:10-11-3. ........ [AMENDED] ..............coitt 950
165:10-21-21. ....... [AMENDED] ............ccoinitt 950
165:10-21-22. ....... [AMENDED] ..............oooitt 950
165:10-21-36. ....... [AMENDED] ...............oi0t 950
165:10-21-45. ....... [AMENDED] .............cooinitt, 950
165:10-21-55. ....... [AMENDED] ..............coitt 950
165:10-21-58. ....... [AMENDED] ..............oovitt 950
165:10-21-78. ....... [AMENDED] .............coiiit s 950
165:10-21-80. ....... [AMENDED] .............cooitt 950
165:10-21-82. ....... [AMENDED] ..............oooitt 950
165:10-21-82.2. ......[AMENDED] ...................... 950
165:10-21-82.3. ......[AMENDED] ................. ... 950
165:10-29-3. ........ [NEW] ... 950
165:30-3-1. ......... [AMENDED] .............coivint 952
165:30-3-3. ......... [AMENDED] .............ccoitt 953
165:30-3-11. ........ [AMENDED] ..............covint 953
165:30-3-17. ........ [AMENDED] .............conitt 955
165:30-3-71. ........ [AMENDED] ..............coett 955
165:30-3-75. ........ [AMENDED] ..............ooveet 955
165:30-3-92. ........ [AMENDED] .............cooiiit 955
165:30-7-6. ......... [AMENDED] .............ccoitt 956
165:30-7-12. ........ [AMENDED] ..............ooviet 956
165:30-7-15. ........ [NEW] .. 957
165:30-10-45. ....... [AMENDED] .............coovitt 957
165:30-13-2. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oooitt 957
165:30-13-20. ....... [AMENDED] .............coiiitt 958
165:30-13-26. ....... [AMENDED] .............conitt 959
165:30-15-4. ........ [AMENDED] ..............ooovett 960
165:30-16-1. ........ [AMENDED] ............ccooinit 961
165:30-16-11. ....... [NEW] ... 961
165:30-19-3. ........ [AMENDED] ...............ooiet 961
165:30-19-4. ........ [AMENDED] ...t 962
165:30-19-19. ....... [AMENDED] .............coooitt 962
165:30-21-4. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oooitt 963
165:30-21-16. ....... [AMENDED] ...t 963
165:35-34-1. ........ [AMENDED] .............oooont. 1541
165:35-34-3. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oooot 1542
165:35-34-4. ........ [NEW] ..o 1544
165:35-37-1. ........ [AMENDED] .............ocont. 1546
165:35-37-4. ........ [AMENDED] ...............oot 1546
165:35-43-1. ........ [NEW] ..o 1547
165:35-43-2. ........ [NEW] ... 1547
165:35-43-3. ........ [NEW] ... 1547
165:35-43-4. ........ [NEW] ..o 1547
165:35-43-5. ........ [NEW] ..o 1548
165:35-43-6. ........ [NEW] ... 1548
165:35-43-7. ........ [NEW] ..o 1548
165:55-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] ..............ooonet. 1550



Rules Affected Index — continued

165:55-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] ...............ovtt 1550
165:55-1-13. ........ [AMENDED] ...............o0vet 1554
165:55-3-1. ......... [AMENDED] ............ooivnnt 1554
165:55-3-20. ........ [AMENDED] ..............c.o0eet 1557
165:55-3-22. ........ [AMENDED] ...............ovee 1557
165:55-3-23. ........ [AMENDED] ............ooivnnt 1558
165:55-3-31. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 1559
165:55-5-1. ......... [AMENDED] ...............o0vet 1559
165:55-5-2. ......... [AMENDED] ...........cccoivnnt 1559
165:55-5-3. ......... [REVOKED] ...t 1559
165:55-5-10. ........ [AMENDED] ...............o0ott 1560
165:55-5-10.1. ....... [REVOKED] ...t 1560
165:55-5-10.2. ....... [AMENDED] ...............ove e 1561
165:55-5-10.3. ....... [AMENDED] ...............oote 1561
165:55-5-11. ........ [AMENDED] ............coivnnt 1561
165:55-5-13. ........ [AMENDED] ...............oott 1562
165:55-5-14. ........ [AMENDED] ...............co0e 1562
165:55-5-20. ........ [AMENDED] .............coovnnt 1563
165:55-5-21. ........ [AMENDED] ...............ovet 1563
165:55-5-22. ........ [AMENDED] ...............oote 1563
165:55-5-23. ........ [AMENDED] ...........covivnnt 1563
165:55-5-30. ........ [AMENDED] ...............ovtt 1563
165:55-5-32. ........ [AMENDED] ................o0e 1564
165:55-5-34. ........ [AMENDED] ...........ccovivnnt 1564
165:55-5-36. ........ [AMENDED] ...............onet 1564
165:55-5-50. ........ [REVOKED] ..........coviiinnt 1564
165:55-5-64. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 1565
165:55-5-65. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 1565
165:55-5-66. ........ [REVOKED] ..........coviiinnt 1565
165:55-5-67. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 1567
165:55-5-68. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 1567
165:55-5-69. ........ [REVOKED] ..........coviiiinnt 1567
165:55-5-70. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 1567
165:55-5-71. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 1567
165:55-5-72. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 1567
165:55-5-73. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 1567
165:55-5-74. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 1567
165:55-5-75. ........ [REVOKED] ..........ccoviinnt 1567
165:55-5-76. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 1567
165:55-9-1. ......... [AMENDED] ...............oeet 1568
165:55-9-2. ......... [AMENDED] ...............ovvet 1568
165:55-9-4. ......... [AMENDED] ............cooivnnt 1569
165:55-9-8. ......... [AMENDED] ...............ovtt 1569
165:55-9-14. ........ [AMENDED] ...............ovet 1569
165:55-11-4. ........ [AMENDED] ............ccoovnnt 1570
165:55-11-7. ........ [AMENDED] ..............ovvet 1571
165:55-11-12. ....... [AMENDED] ...............oo0e 1571
165:55-11-13. ....... [AMENDED] ............ccoivnnt 1571
165:55-11-14. ....... [AMENDED] .............oovnet 1572
165:55-13-1. ........ [AMENDED] ...............oo0e 1572
165:55-13-2. ........ [AMENDED] ............ccoonnnt 1572
165:55-13-10. ....... [AMENDED] ...............ovet 1572
165:55-13-12. ....... [AMENDED] ................o0e 1573
165:55-13-12.1. ......[NEW] ... ... 1574
165:55-13-20. ....... [AMENDED] ...............ooet 1574
165:55-13-22. ....... [AMENDED] ...............o0vte 1575
165:55-13-23. ....... [AMENDED] ............ccoivnnt 1575
165:55-13-24. ....... [AMENDED] ...............ovet 1575
165:55-13-30. ....... [AMENDED] ...............oo0e 1576
165:55-13-31. ....... [REVOKED] ...t 1576
165:55-13-50. ....... [AMENDED] ...............o0vet 1576
165:55-13-51. ....... [AMENDED] ...............ovet 1576
165:55-13-52. ....... [AMENDED] ............ccoonnnt 1576
165:55-13-53. ....... [AMENDED] ..............oovnet 1576
165:55-15-1. ........ [AMENDED] ...............oeee 1577
165:55-15-3. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 1578
165:55-15-5. ........ [AMENDED] ...............ovvtt 1578

Vi

165:55-17-29. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvennn... 1579
165:55-22-5. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovvenn... 1579
165:55-22-9. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1580
165:55-23-1. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvven.... 1581
165:55-25-1. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccvvenn... 1581
165:55, App. A. . ..... [REVOKED] ....ovooeeennnnn.. 1582
165:59-3-62. ........ [AMENDED] .........coovvenn... 1583
165:59-7-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovvenn... 1585
165:59-7-6. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1585
175:10-7-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........covivuinn... 964
175:10-7-6. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvinen.. 964
175:10-7-31. ........ INEW] oo 964
175:10-9-55. ........ INEW] oo 964
210:1-32. ... [AMENDED](E) . ... oo, 9%
210:1-32. .o [AMENDED] ........ovvuveinen.. 965
210:1-5-7. ..o [AMENDED](E) .. ..., 100
210:1-5-7. ... [AMENDED] .........ccoovvven... 969
210:1-5-8. . ....... ... [AMENDED](E) ..., 101
210:1-5-8. . .......... [AMENDED] ........ccovvvinen... 970
210:10-1-9. ......... [REVOKED](E) ... 14
210:10-1-9. ......... [REVOKED] ....ovoeeeenann, 972
210:10-1-18. ........ INEW] oo 973
210:10-1-19. ........ INEW] oo 975
210:10-1-20. ........ INEW] oo 1587
210:10-96. ......... [AMENDED] .........coovvenn... 1588
210:10-13-16. ....... [AMENDED](E) ......cvveenn ... 1683
210:10-13-22. ....... INEW] oo 1589
210:15-3-5.8. ........ [REVOKED] .....vvoeeeann.. 1701
210:15-3-90. ........ [REVOKED] .....oooeeeannn. 1701
210:15-3-90.1. ....... [REVOKED] ....vvoveeennnn. 1701
210:15-3-90.2. ....... INEW] oo 1701
210:15-3-90.3. ....... INEW] oo 1701
210:15-3-91. ........ [REVOKED] ....ovvoeeennnnn.. 1701
210:15-3-91.1. ....... INEW] oo 1701
210:15-3-92. ........ [REVOKED] ......ooveeennn. 1701
210:15-3-92.2. ....... INEW] o, 1701
210:15-3-93. ........ [REVOKED] .....vvoeeeenn. 1701
210:15-3-93.3. ....... INEW] oo 1701
210:15-3-94. ........ [REVOKED] ....ovoveeennnnnn.. 1701
210:15-3-94.4. ... . ... INEW] e 1701
210:15-3-95. ........ [REVOKED] .....oooveeannn.. 1701
210:15-3-95.5. . ...... INEW] o, 1701
210:15-3-96. ........ [REVOKED] .....vvoeeennn. 1701
210:15-3-96.6. . . ..... INEW] oo 1701
210:15-3-97. ........ [REVOKED] ....ovoeeennnnn.. 1701
210:15-3-97.7. ... ... INEW] e 1701
210:15-3-98. ........ [REVOKED] ......ooveeennn.. 1701
210:15-3-98.8. ....... INEW] o, 1701
210:15-3-99. ........ [REVOKED] .....vvoeeeennn.. 1701
210:15-3-99.9. ....... INEW] oo 1701
210:15-3-100. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovvoeeennnnnn.. 1701
210:15-3-100.1. . ... .. [NEW] © .\, 1701
210:15-3-100.2. ..... . [NEW] ..o, 1701
210:15-3-100.3. ... . . [NEW] © .o, 1701
210:15-3-101. ....... [REVOKED] .....vvoeeennn.. 1701
210:15-3-101.1. ... ... [NEW] © oo 1701
210:15-3-102. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovvoeeennnnn.. 1701
210:15-3-102.2. ... . [NEW] .ot 1701
210:15-3-103. ....... [REVOKED] ......ooveeennn. 1701
210:15-3-103.3. ... .. . [NEW] oo 1701
210:15-3-104. ....... [REVOKED] .....vvoeeenn.. 1701
210:15-3-104.4. . ... . [NEW] ...oooiiieeiiie i, 1701
210:15-8-3. ......... [REVOKED] ....ovvoeeennnn.. 1701
210:15-23-10. ....... INEW] e 1701
210:15-27-1. ........ [AMENDED](E) .. ..., 103
210:15-27-1. ........ [AMENDED] ........ovvviinenn.. 977
210:15-27-2. ........ INEW]T oo 978



Rules Affected Index — continued

210:15-27-3. ........ INEWT oo 979
210:15-34-1. ........ INEWT oo 980
210:15-34-2. ........ INEW] oo 981
210:15-34-3. ........ INEW] oo 981
210:15-34-4. ........ INEW] oo 981
210:15-34-5. ........ INEW] oo 981
210:15-34-6. ........ INEW] oo 982
210:15-34-7. ........ INEW] oo 982
210:15-34-8. ........ INEW] oo 982
210:15-34-9. ........ INEW] oo 982
210:15-34-10. ....... INEW] oo 982
210:15-34-11. ....... INEW] oo 983
210:15-34-12. ....... INEW] oo 983
210:15-34-13. ....... INEWT oo 983
210:15-34-14. ....... INEW] oo 983
210:15-34-15. ....... INEW] oo 983
210:15-34-16. ....... INEWT oo 983
210:20-9-98. ........ [AMENDED] ........cevvvnn... 1595
210:20-9-104. . ...... INEW] oo 1596
210:25-5-5. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccoovvnn... 1597
210:30-5-1. ......... [AMENDED] .......oovininen.. 984
240:1-39............ [AMENDED] ........covovvinenn.. 459
240:5-1-3. . .......... INEW] oo 461
240:10-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] .......covvvienen.. 461
240:10-14. ......... INEWT oo 463
240:10-1-5. ......... INEW] oo 463
240:10-3-20. ........ [AMENDED] ........cvvuvvinen.. 463
240:10-3-23. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvovvenn.. 463
240:10-3-24. ........ [REVOKED] .....vooeeiinan. 464
240:10-3-41. ........ [AMENDED] ........cvvvviinen.. 465
240:10-3-45. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvinen... 465
240:10-3-54. ........ INEW] oo 466
240:15-11-1. ........ [AMENDED] .......oovivenen.. 466
240:21-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] ........covvvvinen.. 467
240:21-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........coovvinen... 467
240:21-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] .......oeviienn.. 468
240:21-1-4. ......... INEW] oo 468
240:21-3-1. ......... [REVOKED] .....vooeeeiinan, 468
240:21-3-2. ......... [REVOKED] ....vvoeeeeiaan, 468
240:21-33. ......... [REVOKED] ....ovvoeeeinann, 468
240:21-3-4. ......... [REVOKED] ....ovooeeeiinan, 468
240:21-3-5. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 468
240:21-36. ......... [REVOKED] ....vvooeeeinnn, 468
240:21-7-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........coovvinenn... 468
240:21-72. ......... [AMENDED] .......ooveienen.. 469
240:21-7-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........covvvenenn.. 469
240:21-7-5. ......... [AMENDED] .........coovvinen... 469
252:4-7-73. ......... [AMENDED] .......oovienen.. 088
252:4-7-74. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovvvinn.. 989
252:100-1-3. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccovvinen.. 990
252:100-2-1. ........ [AMENDED] .......oovininen.. 589
252:100-2-3. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovvvenen.. 589
252:100-7-15. ....... [AMENDED] .........coovvinen.. 994
252:100-7-18. ....... [AMENDED] .......cevivienen.. 995
252:100-8-2. ........ [AMENDED] ........covivvenenn.. 605
252:100-8-4. ........ [AMENDED] .........coovvinen... 609
252:100-8-31. ....... [AMENDED] .......covvviinen.. 611
252:100-8-33. ....... [AMENDED] ........coovvvinen.. 618
252:100-8-51.1. ......[AMENDED] .........coevveeenn... 620
252:100-31-1. ....... [AMENDED] .......ccvvininen.. 997
252:100-31-2. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccovvvinn... 997
252:100-31-4. ....... INEWT oo 998
252:100-31-7. ....... [AMENDED] .......oovivinn.. 998
252:100-31-13. ...... [AMENDED] ........covvvvennn.. 998
252:100-31-15. ...... [AMENDED] .........ccvvvinen... 998
252:100-31-16. ...... [AMENDED] .......covvviinnn.. 999
252:100-31-25. ...... [AMENDED] ........covvvvenenn... 999

vii

252:100-31-26. ...... [AMENDED] ......oovoenean 1000
252:100-31-27. ...... [REVOKED] ......ccovvneenn., 1001
252:100, App. Q... .... [REVOKED] ..., 590
252:100, App. Q. ... ... INEW] oo 590
252:110-1-1. ........ [AMENDED] .......c.ooovenn. 1002
252:110-1-2. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1002
252:110-1-7. ........ [REVOKED] ......oovveenean 1002
252:110-5-1. ........ [AMENDED] ..........covvenn.. 1002
252:110-15-1. ....... INEW] oo 1003
252:110-15-2. ....... INEW] oo 1004
252:110-15-3. ....... INEW] oo 1004
252:110-15-4. ....... INEW] ©ooeeie i 1004
252:110-15-5. ....... INEW] ©ooie i 1004
252:110-15-6. ....... INEW] oo 1005
252:205-3-1. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o, 620
252:410-1-7. ........ [AMENDED] .......ccoveinein., 621
252:410-3-33. ....... [AMENDED] ........c.oovvvenin.. 627
252:410-10-1. ....... [AMENDED] ......coveeinenn.. 621
252:410-10-35. ...... [AMENDED] .......ccoveoiniin.. 622
252:410-10-40. ...... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvvenin.. 624
252:410-10-71. ...... [AMENDED] ......coveeinein.. 625
252:410-11-1. ....... [AMENDED] .......ccoveonenin.. 628
252:410-11-2. ....... [AMENDED] ........c.oovvvennin.. 629
252:410-11-4. ....... [AMENDED] ......coveeiienn.. 629
252:410-11-71. ...... [AMENDED] .......ccoveoininn.. 629
252:410-11-74. ...... [AMENDED] .........ccooivvenin.. 629
252:410-11-75. ...... [AMENDED] ......coveeinein. 630
252:410-11-81. ...... [AMENDED] .......ccoveinein.. 631
252:410-19-1. ....... [REVOKED] .....oovveeiinnin, 631
252:410-19-2. ....... [REVOKED] ... 631
252:410-19-3. ....... [REVOKED] ..., 632
252:410-19-4. ....... [REVOKED] ..., 632
252:410-19-5. ....... [REVOKED] ..., 632
252:410-19-6. ....... [REVOKED] ..., 632
252:410-19-7. ....... [REVOKED] .....oovveeinain, 632
252:410-19-8. ....... [REVOKED] ... 632
252:410-19-9. ....... [REVOKED] ..., 632
252:410-19-10. ...... [REVOKED] ..., 633
252:410-19-11. ...... [REVOKED] ... 633
252:410-20-1. ....... [AMENDED] .......cvveiinein., 625
252:515-1-2. ........ [AMENDED] .........oovvvenn. 1006
252:515-1-3. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1010
252:515-3-1. ........ [AMENDED] ......oovoeeveen 1010
252:515-3-2. ........ [AMENDED] .......coooovenn. 1010
252:515-3-6. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1011
252:515-3-39. ....... [AMENDED] ......oovoeeneei. 1011
252:515-19-1. ....... [AMENDED] .........oovvenn.. 1011
252:515-19-38. ...... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1012
252:515-19-40. ...... [AMENDED] ......oovoeeiien. 1012
252:515-21-1. ....... [AMENDED] ..........ovvenn.. 1012
252:515-21-2. ....... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1012
252:515-21-3. ....... [AMENDED] ......oovoeneen 1013
252:515-21-4. ....... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn. 1013
252:515-21-5. ....... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1013
252:515-21-32. ...... [AMENDED] .. ... 1013
252:515-21-32.1. .....[AMENDED] ..................... 1014
252:515-21-33. ...... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1014
252:515-21-34. ...... [AMENDED] ......oovoeeneen. 1014
252:515-21-35. ...... [AMENDED] .........oovveni. 1014
252:515-21-36. ...... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1014
252:515-21-51. ...... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1014
252:515-21-71. ...... [AMENDED] .........oovvvenn. 1015
252:515-21-72. ...... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1015
252:515-21-74. ...... [AMENDED] .......cooenien 1016
252:515-21-75. ...... [AMENDED] .......c.oovvenn. 1016
252:515-21-91. ...... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1016
252:515-21-92. ...... [AMENDED] ......covoenean 1016



Rules Affected Index — continued

252:515-21-111. ... .. [AMENDED] ......oveenei 1017
252:515-21-112. ... .. [AMENDED] .......c.oovvvennn.. 1017
252:515, App. H...... [REVOKED] ... 1019
252:515, App. H...... INEW] oo 1019
252:515, App. 1. ..... [REVOKED] ......ccovevvenin., 1025
252:515, App. I. ..... INEW] ©ooee i 1025
252:606-1-4. ........ [AMENDED] ......covvveiviein.. 634
252:619-1-4. ........ [AMENDED] ........c.oovvvennn.. 1030
252:619-3-2. ........ [AMENDED] ...\ 1031
252:619-3-3. ........ [REVOKED] ......cvveevni. 1032
252:619-5-2. ........ [REVOKED] ......ccovvvvennn., 1032
252:621-1-1. ........ [AMENDED] ...\ 1033
252:621-3-4. ........ [REVOKED] ......ovvvevnen 1033
252:621-3-5. ........ [REVOKED] .......covvvvennn.. 1034
252:621-3-6. ........ [REVOKED] ... 1034
252:621-5-2. ........ [REVOKED] ......ovvveevii 1034
252:621-5-3. ........ [REVOKED] ......ccovvvvenn.. 1035
252:621-5-4. ........ [REVOKED] ... 1035
252:621-7-1. ........ [AMENDED] ......ocvoevei 1035
252:623-1-7. ........ [AMENDED] .......c.ovoveenn... 635
252:626-9-2. ........ [AMENDED] ...\ 1036
252:626-9-8. ........ [AMENDED] ......oovoenei 1036
252:626-9-9. ........ [AMENDED] ........c.ovovvenin.. 1037
252:626-9-14. ....... INEW] ©oooeee i 1041
252:626-13-1. ....... [AMENDED] ......ovienai 1042
252:626-13-2. ....... [AMENDED] .......c.ooovvennn.. 1042
252:626-13-3. ....... [AMENDED] ...\ 1043
252:626-13-4. ....... [AMENDED] ..o 1043
252:626-13-5. ....... [AMENDED] ........c.ooovvennn.. 1043
252:627-1-1. ........ INEW] ©oooee i 1045
252:627-1-2. ........ INEW] oo 1045
252:627-1-3. ........ INEW] oo 1045
252:627-1-4. ........ INEW] ©ooooee i 1046
252:627-1-5. ........ INEW] oo 1046
252:627-1-6. ........ INEW] oo 1047
252:627-1-7. ........ INEW] ©oooeee i 1047
252:627-3-1. ........ INEW] oo 1047
252:627-3-2. ........ INEW] oo 1047
252:627-3-3. ........ INEW] ©ooooee i 1048
252:627-3-4. ........ INEW] oo 1048
252:627-5-1. ........ INEW] oo 1049
252:627, App. A. . ... INEW] ©oooeee i 1050
252:631-1-3. ........ [AMENDED] ..o 1051
252:631-3-3. ........ [AMENDED] ........c.oovvvennn.. 1051
252:631-3-11. ....... [AMENDED] ...\ 1053
252:641-1-2. ........ [AMENDED] ... 1054
252:641-1-3. ........ [AMENDED] ........c.oovvvenin.. 1055
252:641-3-2. ........ [AMENDED] ...\ 1056
252:641-3-4. ........ [AMENDED] ..o 1057
252:641-9-2. ........ [AMENDED] ........c.ooovvenn.. 1058
252:641-10-2. ....... [AMENDED] ...\ 1058
252:641-10-3. ....... [AMENDED] ... 1059
252:641-15-3. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccooovvennn.. 1060
252:641, App. C. . .... [REVOKED] ... 1061
252:641, App. C. .. ... INEW] oo 1061
252:656-1-1. ........ [AMENDED] .......ccovvvennn.. 1062
252:656-1-2. ........ [AMENDED] ...\ 1062
252:656-1-3. ........ INEW] ©oooeoe i 1063
252:656-3-1. ........ [AMENDED] .......c.ooovvennn.. 1063
252:656-3-2. ........ [AMENDED] ...\ 1063
252:656-3-4. ........ [AMENDED] ......ooveeenei 1064
252:656-3-5. ........ [AMENDED] .......ccovovvennn.. 1067
252:656-3-6. ........ [AMENDED] ...\ 1068
252:656-3-8. ........ [REVOKED] ......cvveevaei. 1069
252:656-3-9. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccoovvenin.. 1069
252:656-3-10. ....... [AMENDED] ...\ 1070
252:656-9-2. ........ [AMENDED] ......oovoenei 1070

viii

252:656-25-1. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccvivvennn... 1071
252:656-25-2. ....... [AMENDED] .........cccvvvnn... 1071
252:656-27-1. ....... INEW] oo, 1071
252:656-27-2. ....... INEW] oo 1072
252:656-27-3. ....... INEW] oo 1072
252:656-27-4. ....... INEW] oo 1073
252:656-27-5. ....... INEW] oo 1073
265:45-1-1. ......... INEW] oo 1600
265:45-12. ......... INEW] oo 1600
265:45-13. ......... INEW] oo 1600
265:45-1-4. ......... INEW] oo 1600
265:45-1-5. ......... INEW] oo, 1600
265:45-16. ......... INEW] oo 1600
310:515-1-3. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovvvnn... 1602
310:515-1-4. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1602
310:515-1-8. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvivvenn... 1603
310:667-13-5. ....... INEW] oo 1604
317:2-12. oo [AMENDED](E) ..., 187
317:2-12. ... [AMENDED] ........ccoivvenen.. 470
317:2-1-15. ......... INEWT(E) ©oonneeaeienen 188
317:2-1-15. ......... INEW] oo 471
317:10-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1074
317:10-1-12. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovvvnn... 1074
317:30-3-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1076
317:30-35. ......... [AMENDED] ........covivvenen... 472
317:30-3-19.1. ....... INEW] oo 1075
317:30-3-40. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1077
317:30-3-42. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvivvenn... 1078
317:30-3-57. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1078
317:30-5-7. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1085
317:30-5-12. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1086
317:30-5-42.6. ....... [AMENDED] .........cccvvvnn... 1107
317:30-5-58. ........ INEWT(E) ©oonneeeeeeann, 190
317:30-5-58. ........ INEW] oo 475
317:30-5-95.24. ... ... [AMENDED](E) .. ... 414
317:30-5-95.24. ... ... [AMENDED] ........ccvvveenn... 1126
317:30-5-95.25. ...... [AMENDED](E) .. ..., 415
317:30-5-95.25. ...... [AMENDED] .........cccovvinn... 1127
317:30-5-95.26. . ..... [AMENDED](E) ..., 415
317:30-5-95.26. ...... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1127
317:30-5-95.27. ... ... [AMENDED](E) .. ..., 415
317:30-5-95.27. ...... [AMENDED] ........ovvvnnn... 1127
317:30-5-95.28. ...... [AMENDED](E) .. ..., 416
317:30-5-95.28. ...... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1128
317:30-5-95.29. ...... [AMENDED](E) ..., 416
317:30-5-95.29. ...... [AMENDED] .........coivvenn... 1128
317:30-5-95.30. ...... [AMENDED](E) .. ..., 416
317:30-5-95.30. . ..... [AMENDED] ........cevvvenn... 1128
317:30-5-95.31. ...... [AMENDED](E) ... ... 417
317:30-5-95.31. ...... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1129
317:30-5-96.2. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvnn... 1080
317:30-5-122. ....... [AMENDED] .........coovvenn... 1081
317:30-5-123. ....... [AMENDED] .........cccvvnn... 1089
317:30-5-211.2. ..... .[AMENDED] .......oovvrireennn.. 474
317:30-5-211.10. .. ... [AMENDED] .........cvvvenn... 1103
317:30-5-240. ....... [AMENDED](E) .. ..., 417
317:30-5-240. ....... [AMENDED] ........cevvveenn... 1129
317:30-5-240.1. ......[AMENDED](E) ... ... cvvvvenn.... 417
317:30-5-240.1. ......[AMENDED] .........ccooveen.... 1129
317:30-5-240.2. ......[AMENDED](E) ... ...cvvvveennn... 418
317:30-5-240.2. ......[AMENDED] .........ccvveen.... 1130
317:30-5-241. ....... [AMENDED](E) .. ..., 419
317:30-5-241. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccvivvenn... 1131
317:30-5-241.1. ......[AMENDED](E) . ... .cvvvennn... 420
317:30-5-241.1. ..... .[AMENDED] .........ccoveen.... 1132
317:30-5-241.2. ..... . [AMENDED](E) ... ..oevvvreenn... 422
317:30-5-241.2. ......[AMENDED] .........ceoveen.... 1134



Rules Affected Index — continued

317:30-5-241.3. ......[AMENDED](E) . ..., 425
317:30-5-241.3. ......[AMENDED] .........ccooveen.... 1137
317:30-5-241.4. ......[AMENDED](E) ... ..ocvvvreenn... 426
317:30-5-241.4. ......[AMENDED] .........ccviveen.... 1138
317:30-5-2415. ......[AMENDED](E) . ... .c''vvenn.... 426
317:30-5-241.5. ......[AMENDED] ........ocvveveenn... 1139
317:30-5-276. ....... [AMENDED](E) .. ... 429
317:30-5-276. ....... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1141
317:30-5-281. ....... [AMENDED](E) ..., 430
317:30-5-281. ....... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1142
317:30-5-291. ....... [AMENDED] .........coovvinen.. 478
317:30-5-296. ....... [AMENDED] .......covvviinnn.. 478
317:30-5-306. ....... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1107
317:30-5-307. ....... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1107
317:30-5-326.1. ......[AMENDED] ........ocvvvrennn... 1104
317:30-5-327. ....... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1105
317:30-5-327.1. ......[AMENDED] .........ccoven.... 1105
317:30-5-327.2. ......[REVOKED] ... .ovoveennnn... 1106
317:30-5-328. ....... INEW] oo 1106
317:30-5-390. ....... [AMENDED] .........ccoovvnn... 1081
317:30-5-410. ....... [AMENDED] ........cvvvvnn... 1082
317:30-5-420. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1082
317:30-5-423. ....... [AMENDED] .........cccovenn... 1082
317:30-5-465. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovooeeennnn.. 1086
317:30-5-466. ....... [REVOKED] .....vvoeeeiennn.. 1086
317:30-5-467. ....... [REVOKED] .....oooveeiinn. 1087
317:30-5-480. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1083
317:30-5-482. ....... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1092
317:30-5-482. ....... [AMENDED](E) .. ... 1788
317:30-5-495. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccvivvenn... 1083
317:30-5-515. ....... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1083
317:30-5-535. ....... [AMENDED] .........ccoovvnn... 1083
317:30-5-596. ....... [AMENDED](E) .. ... 431
317:30-5-596. ....... [AMENDED] .........covvvvnn... 1144
317:30-5-596.1. ......[AMENDED](E) ... ...cc'vvenn.... 434
317:30-5-596.1. ......[AMENDED] ........cevvereenn... 1146
317:30-5-664.5. ......[AMENDED] .........ccvvvenn... 1088
317:30-5-676. ....... [AMENDED] .........coovvinen... 478
317:30-5-696. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1108
317:30-5-698. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1111
317:30-5-741. ....... [AMENDED](E) .. ..., 434
317:30-5-741. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvveenn... 1147
317:30-5-760. ....... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1083
317:30-5-763. ....... [AMENDED](E) .. ..., 193
317:30-5-763. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1114
317:30-5-1011. ...... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1084
317:30-5-1012. ...... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1097
317:30-5-1014. ...... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1097
317:30-5-1023. ...... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1098
317:30-5-1027. ...... [AMENDED] .........ccovvvnn... 1101
317:30-5-1076. ...... [AMENDED] ........cevvvenn... 1084
317:30-5-1154. ...... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1088
317:30-5-1201. ...... [AMENDED] .........cccovenn... 1102
317:35-3-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvnn... 1148
317:35-5-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1150
317:35-5-4. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovenn... 1154
317:35-5-8. ......... [AMENDED] ........cevvvenn... 1150
317:35-5-418. ....... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1158
317:35-5-42. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvvinen... 479
317:35-5-43. ........ [AMENDED] ........cevvvvnn... 1156
317:35-6-15. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1161
317:35-7-15. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccccvenn... 1161
317:35-7-37. ........ [AMENDED] ........cevvvnn... 1150
317:35-7-48. ........ [AMENDED] .........cvvvvenn... 1151
317:35-7-60. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovenn... 1151
317:35-7-60.1. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1153
317:35-9-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1163

317:35-9-5. ......... [AMENDED] ......ccooevean. 1163
317:35-9-25. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvenn.. 1164
317:35-9-45. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1164
317:35-9-48.1. ....... [AMENDED] ......covoeeneen 1165
317:35-9-49. ........ [AMENDED] .......c.oovvvinn. 1166
317:35-9-97. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1166
317:35-10-38. ....... [AMENDED] ......oovoenean. 1166
317:35-13-7. ........ [AMENDED] .......c.oovvenn. 1170
317:35-15-1. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1166
317:35-17-1. ........ [AMENDED] ......ooveeneen 1172
317:35-17-2. ........ [AMENDED] .......c.oovvvenn. 1173
317:35-17-3. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... .oooovvenn.. 204
317:35-17-3. ........ [AMENDED] ......oovoeveen 1176
317:35-17-4. ........ [AMENDED] .......c.oovvenn. 1178
317:35-17-5. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1178
317:35-17-11. ....... [AMENDED] ......oovoeeveen 1180
317:35-17-12. ....... [AMENDED] .......c.ooovenn. 1183
317:35-17-14. ....... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1183
317:35-17-15. ....... [AMENDED] .......cooeeveen. 1187
317:35-17-16. ....... [AMENDED] .........oovvvenn., 1187
317:35-17-17. ....... [REVOKED] ... 1188
317:35-17-18. ....... [AMENDED] ......ccvoeveen. 1188
317:35-17-19. ....... [AMENDED] .......c.oovvenn. 1188
317:35-17-21.1. ......[AMENDED] . .........covoni.. .. 1189
317:35-17-24. ....... [AMENDED] ......oovoevean. 1189
317:35-18-1. ........ [AMENDED] .......c.oovvenn. 1190
317:35-18-2. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1190
317:35-18-3. ........ [AMENDED] ......ooveeveen 1190
317:35-18-4. ........ [AMENDED] .........oovvenn. 1190
317:35-18-5. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1190
317:35-18-6. ........ [AMENDED] ......ooveeveen 1191
317:35-18-7. ........ [AMENDED] .......c.ovovenn. 1192
317:35-18-9. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1192
317:35-18-10. ....... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1192
317:35-18-11. ....... [AMENDED] .........oovvenn.. 1193
317:35-19-3. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1167
317:35-19-8. ........ [AMENDED] ......ooveeneei 1167
317:35-19-9. ........ [AMENDED] .........oovvenn. 1167
317:35-22-1. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1157
317:35-23-2. ........ [AMENDED] ......oovoeveen 1193
317:35-23-3. ........ [AMENDED] .......c.oovvvenn. 1194
317:35-23-4. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1194
317:40-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1195
317:40-5-3. ......... [AMENDED] .......c.ooovenn. 1200
317:40-5-5. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1202
317:40-5-8. ......... [REVOKED] ......oovoeeieann. 1203
317:40-5-9. ......... [AMENDED] .........oovvvenn. 1204
317:40-5-13. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1204
317:40-5-59. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1205
317:40-5-101. ....... [AMENDED] .........oovvvenn. 1206
317:40-5-110. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 1794
317:40-5-113. ....... [AMENDED] .......cooveviei. 1208
317:40-5-152. ....... [AMENDED] .......c.oovvvenn. 1198
317:40-7-4. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1199
317:40-7-12. ........ [AMENDED] ......ooveeneei 1208
317:40-7-15. ........ [AMENDED] .......c.oovvenn. 1209
317:40-7-21. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1209
317:45-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] ......oovoeveen 1211
317:45-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] .......c.oovvenn., 1212
317:45-9-4. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o, 484
317:45-11-10. ....... [AMENDED] .......covveinein.. 485
317:45-11-12. ....... [AMENDED] ..........oovvvennin.. 486
317:45-11-24. ....... [AMENDED] ......ooveeiiein. 487
317:45-13-1. ........ [AMENDED] .......ccovenein.. 488
317:50-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] .......c.oovvennn. 1213
317:50-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1214
317:50-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] .. ... 1218



Rules Affected Index — continued

317:50-3-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovveenn.. 1215
317:50-3-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccovvenn.. 1219
317:50-5-2. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccovvveenn.. 1216
317:50-5-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1220
318:10-16. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvvveen.. 725
318:10-1-11. ........ [AMENDED] .......covvveeen.. 725
325:20-1-21. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1221
325:20-1-22. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1222
325:35-1-13. ........ [AMENDED] (E) ...\, 724
325:45-1-18. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvvvenn.. 1222
325:75-1-15. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccvvenn.. 1223
340:2-18............ [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1225
340:2-1-42. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveennn.. 1226
340:2-1-57. ......... [REVOKED] (E) +..ovvveeenn. 1795
340:2-32. ...l [AMENDED] .......covvveeen.. 726
340:2-3-32. ......... [AMENDED] ........coovvieen.. 732
340:2-3-33. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 734
340:2-3-35. ......... [AMENDED] ........coovveeenn.. 735
340:2-3-36. ......... [AMENDED] ........coovveeen.. 736
340:2-3-37. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 741
340:5-34. . .......... [AMENDED] ........cvvveeen.. 743
340:5-54. . .......... [AMENDED] ........coovveeen.. 744
340:5-56. ........... [AMENDED](E) ........vveeenn.. 104
340:5-56. ........... [AMENDED] .......covvveeen.. 745
340:10-3-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........coovvieen.. 749
340:10-3-31. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 752
340:10-3-32. ........ [AMENDED] .......covvveeen.. 753
340:10-3-40. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovveeen.. 754
340:10-3-56. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvvieen.. 755
340:10-3-57. ........ [AMENDED] .......covvveeen.. 757
340:10-20-1. ........ [REVOKED] ..., 759
340:20-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 760
340:20-1-10. ........ [AMENDED] ........ovvveeen.. 761
340:20-1-11. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovveaen.. 762
340:20-1-17. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 764
340:20-1-20. ........ [AMENDED] .......covvveeen.. 765
340:25-1-1.2. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovviaen.. 766
340:25-1-2.1. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 767
340:25-1-5.1. ........ [AMENDED] .......covvveeen.. 767
340:25-5-66. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovveaen.. 768
340:25-5-67. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 768
340:25-5-110.1. ......[AMENDED] ........cvvureeen.. 769
340:25-5-117. ....... [AMENDED] ........coveaen.. 770
340:25-5-123. ....... [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 771
340:25-5-124. ....... [AMENDED] ........ovvveeen.. 771
340:25-5-140. ....... [AMENDED] ........coovvieen.. 772
340:25-5-140.1. ......[AMENDED] .........cccuvven.. 773
340:25-5-168. ....... [AMENDED] .......covveeeen.. 774
340:25-5-171. ....... [AMENDED] ........covveaen.. 777
340:25-5-176. ....... [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 778
340:25-5-178. ....... [AMENDED] .......coovvieen.. 779
340:25-5-179.1. ......[AMENDED] .........cccveeen.. 780
340:25-5-200. ....... [AMENDED] ........cccvvveen.. 780
340:25-5-200.1. ......[AMENDED] ........cvvureeenn.. 782
340:25-5-201.1. ......[AMENDED] .........cccvveen.. 782
340:25-5-270. ....... [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 782
340:25-5-339. ....... [AMENDED] .......coovieen.. 783
340:25-5-340. ....... [AMENDED] ........coovveeen.. 783
340:25-5-345.2. ..... .[AMENDED] ..........ccovvvn.. 784
340:25-5-350.1. ......[AMENDED] ........covureeenn.. 785
340:25-5-350.3. ......[AMENDED] ........ccccveeen.. 785
340:40-7-8. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 788
340:40-7-11. ........ [AMENDED] ........oovvieen.. 791
340:50-3-1. ......... [AMENDED] ........covveeen.. 794
340:50-3-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 796
340:50-3-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........ovvveeenn.. 797
340:50-5-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........covveeen.. 799

340:50-5-28. ........ [AMENDED] ..............cont. 799
340:50-5-45. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oout 800
340:50-7-29. ........ [AMENDED] ............ccooint. 802
340:50-7-30. ........ [AMENDED] ..............cont. 804
340:50-9-1. ......... [AMENDED] ..............cooit 806
340:50-9-4. ......... [AMENDED] ............ccooiit. 809
340:50-9-5. ......... [AMENDED] ..............coitt. 810
340:50-9-6. ......... [AMENDED] ..............ooit. 811
340:65-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] ............ccooiint. 813
340:65-3-1. ......... [AMENDED] ..............oooet. 815
340:65-3-4. ......... [AMENDED] ..............oooeet 818
340:65-3-7. ......... [AMENDED] ............ccooinnnt. 819
340:65-3-8. ......... [AMENDED] .............cointt. 819
340:65-5-1. ......... [AMENDED] .............cooontt 820
340:75-1-44. ........ [AMENDED] ...t 635
340:75-1-45. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oontt. 635
340:75-1-86. ........ [AMENDED] ..............ooonet 635
340:75-3-6.1. ........ [AMENDED] ............coooiint. 635
340:75-3-7.1. ........ [AMENDED] .............coooit. 635
340:75-3-7.3. ........ [AMENDED] .............cooiit 635
340:75-3-84. ........ [AMENDED] ...t 635
340:75-3-10.1. ....... [AMENDED] .............cooiit. 635
340:75-3-10.2. ....... [AMENDED] ..............ooiet 635
340:75-4-9. ......... [AMENDED] ............cooiiint. 635
340:75-4-12.1. ....... [AMENDED] ..............ooiet. 635
340:75-4-13. ........ [REVOKED] .........cooviiiinnt. 635
340:75-4-14. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 635
340:75-6-1. ......... [AMENDED] ..............oit. 635
340:75-6-30. ........ [AMENDED] ..............ooit 635
340:75-6-31. ........ [AMENDED] ...t 635
340:75-6-31.1. ....... [AMENDED] .............coooit. 635
340:75-6-31.3. ....... [AMENDED] ..............oooit 635
340:75-6-40.5. ....... [AMENDED] ...t 635
340:75-6-46. ........ [AMENDED] .............coinnt. 635
340:75-6-48. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oooit 635
340:75-6-48.3. ....... [AMENDED] ...t 635
340:75-6-85.2. ....... [AMENDED] .............cooiit. 635
340:75-6-91. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oooit 635
340:75-6-110. ....... [AMENDED] ...t 635
340:75-7-2. ......... [AMENDED] ..............ooont. 635
340:75-7-10. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oooout 635
340:75-7-12. ........ [AMENDED] ...........cccoiint. 635
340:75-7-14. ........ [AMENDED] .............ccoontt. 635
340:75-7-15. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oooit 635
340:75-7-18. ........ [AMENDED] ...t 635
340:75-7-18. ........ [NEW] ..o 635
340:75-7-19. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oout. 635
340:75-7-24. ........ [AMENDED] ...t 635
340:75-7-37. ........ [AMENDED] ..............ontt. 635
340:75-7-37.1. ....... [AMENDED] .............coontt 635
340:75-7-51. ........ [AMENDED] ............ccooint. 635
340:75-7-52. ........ [AMENDED] ..............cont. 635
340:75-7-65. ........ [AMENDED] .............coonet 635
340:75-7-94. ........ [AMENDED] ...t 635
340:75-13-12. ....... [AMENDED] .............cooontt. 635
340:75-13-13. ....... [AMENDED] .............cooonet 635
340:75-13-15. ....... [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 635
340:75-13-16. ....... [AMENDED] ..............ooont 635
340:75-13-17. ....... [AMENDED] ..............ooit 635
340:75-13-18. ....... [AMENDED] ............cooviint. 635
340:75-13-21. ....... [AMENDED] ............ccooiint. 635
340:75-13-74. ....... [AMENDED] .............coinet 635
340:75-13-75. ....... [AMENDED] ............ccoointt. 635
340:75-13-79. ....... [AMENDED] ..............ont. 635
340:75-13-80. ....... [AMENDED] ..............cooutt 635
340:75-15-6. ........ [AMENDED] ...t 635

340:75-15-42. ....... [AMENDED] ..............oont. 635



Rules Affected Index — continued

340:75-15-45. ....... [AMENDED] ..............coont. 635
340:75-15-47. ....... [AMENDED] ..............couet 635
340:75-15-82. ....... [AMENDED] ............ccooiit. 635
340:75-15-84. ....... [AMENDED] ...............oooet. 635
340:75-15-87. ....... [AMENDED] ...............ooout 635
340:75-15-88. ....... [AMENDED] .............cooiitt. 635
340:75-15-89. ....... [AMENDED] ..............oontt. 635
340:75-15-103. ...... [AMENDED] ................ooo0t 635
340:75-15-128.1. .....[AMENDED] . ................. L. 635
340:75-15-128.4. .....[AMENDED] . ............... ... .. 635
340:75-15-128.5. .....[AMENDED] . .............. ... ..., 635
340:75-15-132. ...... [AMENDED] ............ccointt. 635
340:75-16-30. ....... [AMENDED] ..............conet. 635
340:75-18-1. ........ [AMENDED] ...............oout 635
340:75-18-3. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 635
340:75-18-4. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ...t 635
340:75-18-5. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ...t 635
340:75-18-6. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 635
340:75-18-7. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ...t 635
340:75-18-8. ........ [REVOKED] ..........ccovivinnnt. 635
340:75-18-9. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 635
340:75-18-10. ....... [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 635
340:75-18-11. ....... [REVOKED] ..........ccooviiinnnt. 635
340:75-18-12. ....... [REVOKED] ...... ...t 635
340:75-18-13. ....... [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 635
340:75-18-14. ....... [REVOKED] ...........ccoviiiinnt. 635
340:75-18-15. ....... [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 635
340:100-3-4. ........ [AMENDED] ..............cooit. 823
340:100-3-6. ........ [AMENDED] ................ooot 825
340:100-3-16. ....... [NEW] ..o 826
340:100-3-27. ....... [AMENDED] ..............coooot. 828
340:100-3-27.1. ......[AMENDED] ................ ... .. 831
340:100-3-27.2. ......[AMENDED] ...... ..ot 834
340:100-3-27.3. ......[REVOKED] ...........ccovvunnt. 835
340:100-3-27.4. ......[AMENDED] ............... ... 836
340:100-3-27.5. ......[AMENDED] ..... ...t 836
340:100-3-34. ....... [AMENDED] ..............coot 837
340:100-3-40. ....... [AMENDED] ...............oont 838
340:100-5-20. ....... [AMENDED] ............cooviit. 839
340:100-5-35. ....... [AMENDED] ..................ot. 1227
340:105-10-3. ....... [AMENDED] ..............oout 638
340:105-10-50.1. .....[AMENDED] . ..... ...t 643
340:105-10-72. ...... [AMENDED] ..............coontt 645
340:105-10-74. ...... [AMENDED] ...............cooouet 646
340:105-10-75. ...... [AMENDED] ............ccooint. 646
340:105-11-249. ..... [AMENDED] ..............coit. 647
340:105-11-250. ..... [AMENDED] ...............oout 647
340:110-1-6. ........ [AMENDED] ..............cooot. 1230
340:110-1-83. ....... [AMENDED] ..............co0e 1230
340:110-1-8.4. ....... [NEW] ... 1238
340:110-1-85. ....... [NEW] ..o 1238
340:110-1-86. ....... [NEW] ..o 1238
340:110-1-8.7. ....... [NEW] ... 1239
340:110-1-88. ....... [NEW] ..o 1240
340:110-1-8.9. ....... [NEW] ... 1241
340:110-1-8.10. ... ... [NEW] ... 1241
340:110-1-9. ........ [AMENDED] ..............cooot 1242
340:110-1-9.1. ....... [AMENDED] ................o0oe 1244
340:110-1-93. ....... [AMENDED] ..................oe 1245
340:110-1-10.1. ......[AMENDED] .............. ... ..., 1247
340:110-1-13. ....... [AMENDED] ..................ot 1249
340:110-1-15. ....... [AMENDED] ..................o0. 1249
340:110-1-44. ....... [AMENDED] ..............cooot 1250
340:110-1-46. ....... [AMENDED] ...................0. 1250
340:110-1-47.2. ......[AMENDED] ..................... 1251
340:110-1-54. ....... [AMENDED] ..............ooot 1252
340:110-1-54.1. ......[AMENDED] ..................... 1253

Xi

360:10-3-13. ........ [AMENDED] ........cvivinen.. 489
360:10-3-24. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovenen.. 489
360:10-3-25. ........ [AMENDED] ......covvnnnan.. 490
360:10-3-29.1. ....... [AMENDED] ........coovieen.. 490
360:10-5-16. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccoovveen.. 490
360:10-5-79. ........ [AMENDED] ......oovinnnan.. 491
360:15-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........covinen.. 492
360:15-1-20. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccooveeen.. 492
365:1-14............ [AMENDED] ........covvenenn.. 1254
365:10-1-15. ........ [AMENDED](E) . ..., 253
365:10-1-15. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccvvvnn... 1256
365:10-1-16. ........ INEW] oo 1256
365:10-1-31. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovvevenn.. 1257
365:10-1-32. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccvvvenn... 1257
365:10-5-150. ....... [AMENDED] .......ccvvvvinenn.. 1258
365:10-5-155. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccovvenenn.. 1258
365:10-5-164. ....... INEW] oo 1260
365:10-5-177. ....... [AMENDED] ........covveeenn.. 1260
365:10-29-1. ........ INEW](E) .« 16
365:10-29-1. ........ INEW] oo 1262
365:10-29-2. ........ INEW](E) «'ovveeeeeeaaen 17
365:10-29-2. ........ INEW] oo 1262
365:10-29-3. ........ INEW](E) «oovveeeeaeeei 17
365:10-29-3. ........ INEW] oo 1262
365:10-29-4. ........ INEW](E) «'ovveeeeieaen 17
365:10-29-4. ........ INEW] oo 1262
365:10-29-5. ........ INEW](E) «oovveeeeeeeaen 17
365:10-29-5. ........ INEW] oo 1263
365:10-29-6. ........ INEW](E) «oovvveeeeieeein 17
365:10-29-6. ........ INEW] @ 1263
365:10-29-7. ........ INEW](E) «'ovveeeeeeeaein 17
365:10-29-7. ........ INEW] oo 1263
365:10-29-8. ........ INEW](E) «oovveeeeeeeeenn 17
365:10-29-8. ........ INEW] oo 1263
365:10-29-9. ........ INEW](E) «'ovveeeeaeeei 17
365:10-29-9. ........ INEW] oo 1263
365:10-29-10. ....... INEW](E) «'ovveeeeeeaen 17
365:10-29-10. ....... NEW] oo 1263
365:10, App. PP. ..... INEW](E) «ovvvveeeeeeaen 18
365:10, App. PP. ..... INEW] oo 1264
365:10, App. QQ. ... .[NEWJ(E) ... 20
365:10, App. QQ. ... . [NEW] .o, 1266
365:10, App. RR. ... .[NEW](E) ..., 29
365:10, App. RR. ... .[NEW] ..o, 1275
365:10, App. SS. ..... INEW](E) «.oovveeeeeeaaen 32
365:10, App. SS. ..... INEW] oo 1278
365:10, App. TT. ..... INEW](E) «oovvveeeeeeeei 34
365:10, App. TT. ..... INEW] oo 1280
365:10, App. UU. ... . [NEW] ..o, 1281
365:10, App. VV. ... [NEW] ..o 1283
365:15-7-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........covvveenn.. 1286
365:15-7-30. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovveenn.. 1286
365:25-3-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccvvvenn.. 1287
365:25-3-14. ........ [AMENDED] .......ccvvvveenn.. 1201
365:25-5-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovvenenn.. 1295
365:25-5-4. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccvvvenn.. 1295
365:25-5-34. ........ [AMENDED] .......covvvienn.. 1295
365:25-5-35. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovvenenn.. 1296
365:25-5-43. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccvvvnn.. 1296
377:3-115. ......... [AMENDED](E) ..., 319
377:3-115. ......... [AMENDED] ........cvivieen.. 649
377:3-116. ......... [AMENDED](E) .. ... 320
377:3-116. ......... [AMENDED] ........ovveeen.. 649
377:3-118. ......... [AMENDED](E) .. ..., 320
377:3-118. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccoovveen.. 650
377:3-119. ......... [AMENDED](E) ..., 320
377:3-119. ......... [AMENDED] ........cvivieen.. 650



Rules Affected Index — continued

377:3-11-10. ........ [AMENDED](E) .......'vveeen.. 320
377:3-11-10. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveven.. 650
377:3-11-11. ........ [AMENDED] (E) .. ....'vvveeenn... 321
377:3-11-11. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovveeen.. 650
377:3-11-12. ........ [AMENDED](E) ...... .o 321
377:3-11-12. ........ [AMENDED] ........covveeen.. 650
377:10-7-20. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovveeen.. 651
380:30-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1296
385:1-12. ... [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1298
385:1-14............ [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1298
385:1-1-5............ [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1298
385:1-16............ [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1298
385:1-1-11. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1298
385:1-1-13. ......... INEW] oo 1299
385:15-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1299
385:15-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1299
385:15-1-6. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1299
385:15-1-8. ......... [AMENDED] ........covvveenn.. 1300
385:15-19. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1300
385:15-1-18. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1301
385:15-1-20. ........ [AMENDED] .......ccovvveenn.. 1301
385:15-1-21. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvvvenn.. 1301
385:15-1-22. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccvvvenn.. 1302
385:15-1-25. ........ [AMENDED] ........covvveenn.. 1302
385:15-1-32. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvvvenn.. 1302
385:20-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvvvenn.. 1303
385:20-12. ......... [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1303
385:20-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovveenn.. 1304
385:20-1-6. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 1304
385:20-1-7. ......... [AMENDED] .......coovvveenn.. 1304
385:20-19. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1304
385:20-1-10. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccvvvnn.. 1304
385:20-1-11. ........ [AMENDED] ........covvveenn.. 1304
385:20-1-12. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovveenn.. 1304
385:20-1-13. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccvvvnn.. 1304
385:20-1-14. ........ [AMENDED] ........covvveenn.. 1305
385:20-1-15. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1305
385:20-1-16. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1305
385:20-1-17. ........ [AMENDED] .......ccovveenn.. 1306
385:20-1-19. ........ [REVOKED] ..., 1306
385:20-1-20. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvvvenn.. 1306
385:20-1-21. ........ [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1306
385:20-1-22. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1306
385:25-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1307
385:25-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........covvveenn.. 1307
385:25-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1307
385:25-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccovvenn.. 1307
385:25-1-7. ......... [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1307
385:25-1-12. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovveenn.. 1307
385:25-1-13. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1308
385:25-1-15. ........ [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1308
385:25-1-22. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1308
385:25-1-23. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1308
385:25-1-24. ........ [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1308
385:25-1-25. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1308
385:25-1-31. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1309
385:25-1-33. ........ [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1309
385:25-1-39. ........ [REVOKED] ..., 1309
385:25-1-40. ........ [REVOKED] ..., 1309
385:25-1-41. ........ [AMENDED] .......coovvveenn.. 1309
385:25-1-43. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1309
385:30-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1310
385:30-19. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccovvveenn.. 1310
385:35-1-1. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 1311
385:35-1-2. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 1311
385:35-1-3. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 1311
385:35-1-4. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 1311

Xii

390:1-14. ...l [AMENDED] ........ccvivvenn... 1604
390:1-16............ [AMENDED] ..........cccvvven... 1606
390:2-12. ... [AMENDED] ........covvvvenn... 1606
390:2-14. ... ... [AMENDED] ........ccoovvinn... 1607
390:2-1-11. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccvvenn... 1608
390:15-1-13. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1609
390:15-1-18. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1610
390:15-3-7. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1610
390:15-3-8. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvnn... 1610
390:30-1-6. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1611
390:31-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1612
390:31-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1612
435:10-14. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ... 354
435:20-5-10. ........ INEW] oo 1613
435:30-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1614
435:30-1-16. ........ [AMENDED] .........coivvenn... 1614
450:-27-5-44. .. ... ... INEW] oo 670
450:15-3-8. ......... [AMENDED] .......covvviinenn.. 493
450:15-3-45. ........ [AMENDED] ........covivienenn.. 493
450:15-3-66. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccovvenen.. 494
450:15-3-85. ........ [AMENDED] .......covvviinen.. 495
450:15-7-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........covivienn.. 495
450:15-7-4. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvinen... 496
450:15-7-6. ......... [AMENDED] .......covvuiinen.. 496
450:16-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........covveenen.. 653
450:16-5-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovviven... 655
450:16-5-2.1. ........ [REVOKED] ....ovoeeeenan, 655
450:16-5-3. ......... [REVOKED] ....vvvoeeinnn, 656
450:16-5-4. ......... INEW] e 656
450:16-5-5. ......... INEW] oo 656
450:16-5-6. ......... INEW] oo 656
450:16-7-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvinen.. 656
450:16-7-2. ......... [REVOKED] ....ovoeeeenann, 657
450:16-7-3. ......... [REVOKED] ....vvoeeeinann, 657
450:16-9-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvinen.. 657
450:16-11-1. ........ [AMENDED] .......oovvninenn.. 657
450:16-13-1. ........ [AMENDED] ........covivvenenn.. 658
450:16-13-2. ........ [REVOKED] .....vooeeeinan, 658
450:16-13-3. ........ [REVOKED] ....ovooeeienen, 658
450:16-13-4. ........ [REVOKED] ....vvvoeeeinenn, 658
450:16-13-5. ........ [REVOKED] .....vooeeiinn, 658
450:16-13-7. ........ [AMENDED] .......oovevinen.. 658
450:16-13-8. ........ [REVOKED] ....ovooeeiinann, 658
450:16-13-9. ........ [REVOKED] .....vooeeeinnn, 658
450:16-13-10. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovvoeeinnenn, 658
450:16-13-11. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovooeeiinann, 658
450:16-13-12. ....... [AMENDED] .........coovvinen.. 659
450:16-13-13. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovooeeeinannn, 659
450:16-13-14. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovoeeiiinnn, 659
450:16-13-15. ....... [REVOKED] .....vooeeinen, 659
450:16-13-16. ....... [REVOKED] ....vvoeeeinnannn, 659
450:16-13-17. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovooeeeenann, 659
450:16-13-18. ....... [REVOKED] .....vooeeinen, 659
450:16-13-19. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovoeeeiinnn, 659
450:16-13-20. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovooeeiieann, 659
450:16-13-22. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovvoeeinenn, 659
450:16-13-24. ....... [REVOKED] ....vvoeeeeenann, 659
450:16-13-25. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovoeeeinann, 659
450:16-13-27. ....... [AMENDED] .........ccovvenenn.. 660
450:16-13-27.1. ..... .[REVOKED] ... .vvoveennnnnnnn.. 660
450:16-13-28. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovooeeiinan, 660
450:16-13-33. ....... [AMENDED] .........ccovvenen.. 660
450:16-13-33.1. ......[REVOKED] ... .vvoeeennnnnnnn.. 660
450:16-13-33.2. ..... . [REVOKED] ... .\voveennnnnnn.. 660
450:16-13-33.3. ..... . [REVOKED] .......oovvenvennnnn.. 660
450:16-13-34. ....... [REVOKED] ....vvooeeiinann, 660
450:16-13-35. ....... [REVOKED] ....ovooeeiinnn, 660



Rules Affected Index — continued

450:16-13-35.1. ......[REVOKED] ...............oint. 660
450:16-13-36. ....... [AMENDED] ..............couet 660
450:16-13-37. ....... [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 660
450:16-13-38. ....... [REVOKED] ...... ...t 660
450:16-13-39. ....... [REVOKED] ...........coviviinnt. 660
450:16-13-40. ....... [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 661
450:16-13-45. ....... [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 661
450:16-13-46. ....... [REVOKED] ...........coviiinnnt. 661
450:16-13-48. ....... [AMENDED] .............cooiit. 661
450:16-13-48.1. ......[REVOKED] ...............covtt. 661
450:16-13-49. ....... [REVOKED] ...........ccoviiinnnt 661
450:16-15-1. ........ [AMENDED] ............ccointt. 661
450:16-15-5. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 661
450:16-23-1. ........ [AMENDED] ...............oout 661
450:16-27-1. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 661
450:16-27-2. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ...t 662
450:16-27-3. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ...t 662
450:16-27-4. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 662
450:16-27-5. ........ [NEW] ..o 662
450:16-29-5. ........ [REVOKED] ..........ccovivinnnt. 662
450:16-29-7. ........ [AMENDED] ............ccooiit. 662
450:16-29-8. ........ [AMENDED] ..............coiet. 662
450:16-29-9. ........ [REVOKED] ..........ccooviiinnnt. 662
450:16-30-1. ........ [NEW] ..o 663
450:27-1-1. ......... [NEW] ... 663
450:27-1-2. ......... [NEW] ... 663
450:27-1-3. ......... [NEW] ... 665
450:27-1-4. ......... [NEW] ... 665
450:27-1-5. ......... [NEW] ..o 666
450:27-1-6. ......... [NEW] ..o 666
450:27-3-1. ......... [NEW] ..o 666
450:27-3-2. ......... [NEW] ... 666
450:27-3-3. ......... [NEW] ..o 666
450:27-3-3.1. ........ [NEW] ..o 666
450:27-3-21. ........ [NEW] ... 666
450:27-3-22. ........ [NEW] ..o 666
450:27-3-23. ........ [NEW] ..o 667
450:27-3-24. ........ [NEW] ... 667
450:27-3-25. ........ [NEW] ..o 667
450:27-3-26. ........ [NEW] ... 667
450:27-3-41. ........ [NEW] ... 667
450:27-3-42. ........ [NEW] ..o 668
450:27-3-43. ........ [NEW] ... 668
450:27-3-61. ........ [NEW] ..o 668
450:27-3-62. ........ [NEW] ..o 668
450:27-5-1. ......... [NEW] ... 668
450:27-5-2. ......... [NEW] ..o 669
450:27-5-21. ........ [NEW] ..o 669
450:27-5-22. ........ [NEW] ..o 669
450:27-5-23. ........ [NEW] ... 669
450:27-5-41. ........ [NEW] ..o 670
450:27-5-42. ........ [NEW] ... 670
450:27-5-45. ........ [NEW] ... 670
450:27-7-1. ......... [NEW] ... 670
450:27-7-2. ......... [NEW] ..o 670
450:27-7-3. ......... [NEW] ... 670
450:27-7-4. ......... [NEW] ..o 671
450:27-7-5. ......... [NEW] .. 671
450:27-7-6. ......... [NEW] ... 671
450:27-7-7. ......... [NEW] ..o 671
450:27-7-21. ........ [NEW] ... 671
450:27-7-22. ........ [NEW] ..o 672
450:27-7-23. ........ [NEW] ..o 672
450:27-7-24. ........ [NEW] ..o 672
450:27-7-25. ........ [NEW] ... 672
450:27-7-26. ........ [NEW] ... 672
450:27-7-27. ........ [NEW] .. 673

Xiii

450:27-7-28. ........ INEW] oo 673
450:27-7-29. ........ INEW] oo 673
450:27-7-30. ........ INEW] ©ooeeoe i 673
450:27-7-31. ........ INEW] oo 673
450:27-7-32. ........ INEW] oo 674
450:27-7-33. ........ INEW] ©oooeeie 674
450:27-7-34. ........ INEW] oo 674
450:27-7-41. ........ INEW] oo 674
450:27-7-42. ........ INEW] oo 675
450:27-7-43. ........ INEW] oo 675
450:27-7-44. ..., ... INEW] .o 675
450:27-7-45. ... ... INEW] oo 675
450:27-7-46. ........ INEW] oo 675
450:27-7-47. ........ INEW] oo 675
460:3-1-5. .. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1779
460:3, App. A. ....... [REVOKED] ......ovvenian. 1781
460:10-17-6. ........ [AMENDED] .........oovvenn. 1782
460:10-35-8. ........ INEW] oo 1782
475:1-1-1. ... [AMENDED] .. ... 1312
475:1-56. .. ......... [AMENDED] .........oovveni. 1312
475:1-5-11. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1312
475:10-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] ......oovoeniei. 1313
475:10-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] .......c.oovvenn. 1313
475:10-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1313
475:10-1-9. ......... [AMENDED] ......oovoeeviei 1314
475:10-1-10. ........ [AMENDED] .........oovvenn. 1314
475:10-1-11. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1315
475:10-1-15. ........ [AMENDED] ......oovoeeniei. 1316
475:10-1-16. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvinn. 1316
475:10-1-20. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1316
475:10-1-21. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1316
475:10-1-22. ........ [AMENDED] .........oovvvenn.. 1316
475:15-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1317
475:15-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] ......oovoeveei 1317
475:20-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] .........oovvvenn. 1318
475:20-1-7. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1319
475:20-1-8. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1319
475:25-1-7. ......... [AMENDED] .........oovvvenn. 1319
475:25-1-9. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1319
475:25-1-10. ........ [AMENDED] .. ... 1320
475:25-1-12. ........ [AMENDED] .........oovvvenn.. 1320
475:30-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1320
475:30-1-6. ......... [AMENDED] ......ooveeeneen 1321
475:30-1-10. ........ [AMENDED] ..........ovvvinn. 1322
475:30-1-11. ........ [AMENDED] .. ..o 1322
475:30-1-15. ........ [AMENDED] .. ... 1323
475:45-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........oovvvenn. 1323
475:45-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1323
475:45-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] .. ... 1323
475:45-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] .........oovvvenn. 1323
475:45-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1324
475:50-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] .. ... 1324
475:55-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........oovvenn. 1325
475:55-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1325
485:1-1-1. .. ......... [AMENDED] .. ... 1615
485:10-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] .......c.ooovenn. 1617
485:10-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1617
485:10-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] ......oovoeneai. 1618
485:10-5-12. ........ [AMENDED] .......cooevenn. 1619
485:10-7-1. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1619
485:10-7-2. ......... [AMENDED] .. ... 1620
485:10-7-4. ......... [AMENDED] .........oovvvenn. 1621
485:10-7-5. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1622
485:10-8-1. ......... INEW] oo 1622
485:10-9-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........oovvenn. 1622
485:10-9-2. ......... [AMENDED] .. ..o 1623
485:10-9-4. ......... [AMENDED] .. ... 1625



Rules Affected Index — continued

485:10-9-5. ......... [AMENDED] ...............ovtt 1626
485:10-10-2. ........ [AMENDED] ...............o0vet 1626
485:10-10-3. ........ [AMENDED] ............ooivnnt 1626
485:10-10-5. ........ [AMENDED] ...............oe0 e 1626
485:10-10-6. ........ [AMENDED] ...............o0ote 1627
485:10-10-7. ........ [AMENDED] .............ooivnnt 1627
485:10-10-8. ........ [AMENDED] ..............c.o0net 1627
485:10-10-8.1. ....... [AMENDED] ...............o0oe e 1627
485:10-10-10. ....... [AMENDED] ............ooovnnt 1628
485:10-11-1. ........ [AMENDED] ..............c.o0e0t 1628
485:10-11-2. ........ [AMENDED] ...............o0vet 1629
485:10-11-3. ........ [AMENDED] ............ovivnnt 1631
485:10-13-1. ........ [AMENDED] ...............ovtt 1631
485:10-13-2. ........ [AMENDED] ................o0e 1631
485:10-13-3. ........ [AMENDED] .............ccoovint 1631
485:10-15-4. ........ [AMENDED] ...............ovnet 1631
485:10-15-4.1. ....... [REVOKED] .........ccoviiinnt, 1633
485:10-15-5. ........ [AMENDED] .............ooovnnt 1633
485:10-15-6. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oovvet 1634
485:10-15-7. ........ [AMENDED] ...............o0vee 1635
485:10-15-8. ........ [AMENDED] ............ccoovnnt 1635
485:10-15-9. ........ [AMENDED] ..............ovnet 1636
485:10-15-9.1. ....... [NEW] ... 1636
485:10-16-1. ........ [AMENDED] .............cooovnnt 1636
485:10-16-2. ........ [AMENDED] ..............c.ovvet 1637
485:10-16-3. ........ [AMENDED] ...............o0o0e 1637
485:10-16-4. ........ [AMENDED] ............cooovnnt 1638
485:10-16-5. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oovvtt 1638
485:10-16-6. ........ [AMENDED] ...............o0oet 1638
485:10-16-7. ........ [AMENDED] .............ooovnnt 1639
485:10-16-8. ........ [AMENDED] ..............oovntt 1639
485:10-18-2. ........ [AMENDED] ...............ouet 1639
485:10-18-3. ........ [AMENDED] ............cooivnnt 1640
485:10-18-4. ........ [AMENDED] ...............ovtt 1640
485:10-18-5. ........ [AMENDED] ...............ovvee 1640
490:1-1-1............ [AMENDED] ............cooovnnt 1326
490:1-1-2............ [AMENDED] ...............ov0 e 1326
490:1-3-1............ [AMENDED] ...............o0o0 e 1328
490:1-3-2............ [AMENDED] ............coovnnt 1328
490:1-5-2............ [AMENDED] ...............oo0 e 1329
490:1-5-2.1. ......... [AMENDED] ...............ovee 1329
490:1-5-3............ [AMENDED] .............cooovnnt 1329
490:1-5-6............ [NEW] ..o 1329
490:1-5-7. ... [AMENDED] ...............o0o0t 1329
490:1-5-7.1. ......... [AMENDED] ............ooivnnt 1330
490:1-5-8............ [AMENDED] ...............o0vet 1330
490:1-6-1............ [REVOKED] .........ccoviiinnt 1330
490:1-7-1............ [AMENDED] ...........cooivnnt 1333
490:1-7-2. ... [AMENDED] ...............o0eet 1333
490:1-9-1............ [AMENDED] ...............coee 1330
490:1-9-2............ [AMENDED] ............cooovnnt 1331
490:1-9-3............ [AMENDED] ...............ovet 1331
490:1-9-4............ [AMENDED] ...............ovvee 1331
490:1-9-5............ [AMENDED] ............cooonnnt 1334
490:10-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] ...............ovvtt 1335
490:10-1-2.1. ........ [AMENDED] ...............o0vet 1335
490:10-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] .............cooovnnt 1336
490:10-1-3.1. ........ [NEW] ..o 1336
490:10-1-3.2. ........ [NEW] ..o 1337
490:10-1-33. ........ [NEW] ..o 1337
490:10-1-34. ........ [NEW] ..o 1337
490:10-1-35. ........ [NEW] ... 1338
490:10-1-36. ........ [NEW] ..o 1338
490:10-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] ..............oovnet 1338
490:10-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] ...............co0e 1339
490:10-1-5.1. ........ [NEW] ..o 1339
490:10-1-5.2. ........ [NEW] ..o 1339

Xiv

490:10-1-9. ......... [REVOKED] .....vvoeeann. 1339
490:10-1-10. ........ [REVOKED] ......ooveeann. 1340
490:10-1-11. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1340
490:10-3-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1340
490:10-3-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccvvnn... 1341
490:10-3-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........covvvenn... 1341
490:10-3-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1342
490:10-3-5. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1342
490:10-3-6. ......... [AMENDED] ........cevvvvnn... 1343
490:10-5-3. ......... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1343
490:10-5-5. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1344
490:10-7-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvnn... 1345
490:10-8-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1345
490:10-8-3. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccvvnn... 1345
490:10-8-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........cevvvvnn... 1345
490:10-8-5. ......... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1345
490:10-8-5.1. ........ [AMENDED] ..........ccovvnn... 1346
490:10-8-6. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvnn... 1346
490:10-8-7. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvivvenn... 1346
490:10-8-8. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovenn... 1346
490:10-8-10. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvn.... 1346
490:10-8-11. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovvvenn... 1346
490:10-8-13. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovvenn... 1347
490:10-8-14. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1347
490:10-13-1. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvivvenn... 1347
490:10-13-2. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccvvnn... 1348
490:10-13-3. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1349
490:15-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovvvenn... 1351
490:15-1-3.1. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovvinn... 1351
490:15-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........cevvvvnn... 1351
490:15-3-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1351
490:15-3-3. ......... INEW] o 1352
530:10-3-22. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvnn... 1353
530:10-7-19. ........ [REVOKED] .....vvoeeeann.. 1354
530:10-9-37. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccvvvnn... 1354
530:10-9-38. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvivveenn... 1354
530:10-9-52. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1354
530:10-9-100. ....... [AMENDED] .........cccvvnn... 1355
530:10-9-111. ....... [AMENDED] ........cevvvvnn... 1355
530:10-9-131. ....... [AMENDED] .........coovvenn... 1355
530:10-15-58. ....... INEWT(E) - 63
530:10-15-58. ....... INEW] oo 1356
530:10-17-77. ....... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1356
530:10, App. A. ...... [REVOKED](E) ... 64
530:10, App. A....... INEW](E) ©oovveeeeiiaae 64
530:10, App. A. ...... [REVOKED] .....vvoeeennnn. 1358
530:10, App. A. ...... INEW] o 1358
535:1-11-1. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1641
535:15-3-4.1. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvivvenn... 1641
535:15-3-17. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1642
535:15-69. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvnn... 1642
535:15-16-1. ........ INEW] oo 1642
535:15-16-2. ........ INEW] oo 1642
535:15-16-3. ........ INEW] oo 1642
535:15-16-4. ........ INEW] oo 1643
535:15-16-5. ........ INEW] oo 1643
535:15-16-6. ........ INEW] oo 1644
535:15-16-7. ........ INEW] oo 1644
540:50-1-1. ......... INEWT(E) ©oovneeeeieeen, 893
540:50-1-2. ......... INEWT(E) ©oonnneeeieeenn, 893
540:50-1-3. ......... INEWT(E) ©ooonneeaeeaean, 893
540:50-1-4. ......... INEWT(E) ©ooonneneeienen, 893
540:50-1-5. ......... INEWT(E) ©oonnnneeeeaeen, 894
540:50-1-6. ......... INEWT(E) ©oonneeaeienen, 894
540:50-1-7. ......... INEWT(E) ©ooneneeienen 894
540:50-1-8. ......... INEWT(E) ©ooonneeeineeen, 894
540:50-1-9. ......... INEWT(E) ©oonnneaeeeean, 894



Rules Affected Index — continued

550:1-5-2.......... .. [AMENDED] ..................o0 1359
550:1-7-2.1. .. ....... [AMENDED] ..................o0 1360
580:20-27-1. ........ [NEW] ..o 1703
580:20-27-2. ........ [NEW] ... 1703
580:20-27-3. ........ [NEW] ... 1703
580:20-27-4. ........ [RESERVED] .............ooot. 1704
580:20-27-5. ........ [NEW] ... 1704
580:20-27-6. ........ [RESERVED] .................... 1704
580:20-27-7. ........ [RESERVED] .................... 1704
580:20-27-8. ........ [RESERVED] .................... 1704
580:20-27-9. ........ [NEW] ... 1704
580:20-27-10. ....... [RESERVED] .................t. 1705
580:20-27-11. ....... [NEW] ... 1705
580:20-27-12. ....... [RESERVED] .................... 1705
580:20-27-13. ....... [NEW] ..o 1705
580:20-27-14. ....... [RESERVED] .................... 1705
580:20-27-15. ....... [NEW] ... 1706
580:20-27-16. ....... [RESERVED] .................... 1706
580:20-27-17. ....... [NEW] ... 1706
580:20-27-18. ....... [RESERVED] .................... 1706
580:20-27-19. ....... [NEW] ..o 1706
580:20-27-20. ....... [RESERVED] .................... 1706
580:20-27-21. ....... [NEW] ... 1706
580:20-27-22. ....... [RESERVED] ............. .. ..., 1706
580:20-27-23. ....... [NEW] ... 1706
580:20-27-24. ....... [RESERVED] .................... 1707
580:20-27-25. ....... [RESERVED] .................o.. 1707
580:20-27-26. ....... [RESERVED] ............. ..., 1707
580:20-27-27. ....... [NEW] ... 1707
580:20-27-28. ....... [RESERVED] .................... 1707
580:20-27-29. ....... [NEW] ... 1707
580:55-1-1. ......... [REVOKED] ...........coviiin. 1707
580:55-1-1.1. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 1708
580:55-1-2. ......... [REVOKED] .........ccoviinnt. 1708
580:55-1-3. ......... [REVOKED] ...........ccoviinn. 1709
580:55-1-4. ......... [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 1709
580:55-1-5. ......... [REVOKED] ...t 1709
580:55-1-6. ......... [REVOKED] ...........cccviinit. 1709
580:55-1-7. ......... [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 1709
580:55-1-8. ......... [REVOKED] .........ccooviinnn. 1710
580:55-1-9. ......... [REVOKED] ...........cccoivit. 1710
580:55-1-10. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 1710
580:55-1-11. ........ [REVOKED] ..........ccooviinnn. 1710
580:55-1-12. ........ [REVOKED] ...........ccoivit. 1710
580:55-1-13. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 1711
580:55-1-14. ........ [REVOKED] .........ccoviinnt. 1711
580:55-1-15. ........ [REVOKED] ...........ccoivit. 1711
580:55-1-16. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ...t 1712
580:55-1-17. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 1712
580:55-1-18. ........ [REVOKED] ...........coviiit. 1712
580:55-1-21. ........ [NEW] ..o 1712
580:55-1-22. ........ [RESERVED] .................... 1712
580:55-1-23. ........ [NEW] ... 1712
580:55-1-24. ........ [RESERVED] .................... 1713
580:55-1-25. ........ [NEW] ..o 1713
580:55-1-26. ........ [RESERVED] .................... 1713
580:55-1-27. ........ [NEW] ..o 1713
580:55-1-28. ........ [RESERVED] .................... 1713
580:55-1-29. ........ [NEW] ... 1713
580:55-1-33. ........ [RESERVED] .................... 1714
580:55-5-1. ......... [NEW] ... 1714
580:55-5-2. ......... [NEW] ... 1714
580:55-5-3. ......... [RESERVED] .................... 1714
580:55-5-4. ......... [NEW] ... 1714
580:55-5-5. ......... [RESERVED] .................... 1714
580:55-5-6. ......... [NEW] ..o 1714
580:55-5-7. ......... [RESERVED] .................... 1714

XV

580:55-5-8. ......... INEW] oo 1714
580:55-5-9. ......... [RESERVED] .....oovvvennnn. 1715
580:55-5-10. ........ INEW] oo 1715
580:55-5-11. ........ [RESERVED] ..., 1715
580:55-5-12. ........ INEW] oo 1715
580:55-5-13. ........ INEW] oo 1715
580:55-5-14. ........ INEW] oo 1716
580:55-7-1. ......... INEW] oo 1716
580:55-7-2. ......... [RESERVED] ..., 1716
580:55-7-3. ......... INEW] oo 1716
580:55-7-4. ......... INEW] oo 1716
580:55-9-1. ......... INEW] oo 1717
580:55-9-2. ......... [RESERVED] ..., 1717
580:55-9-3. ......... INEW] oo 1717
580:55-9-4. ......... INEW] oo 1717
580:55-9-5. ......... INEW] oo 1717
580:61-1-1. ......... INEW] oo 1718
580:61-1-2. ......... INEW] oo 1718
580:61-1-3. ......... INEW] oo 1718
585:2-1-1............ [AMENDED] .........cccvvvnn... 1361
585:2-1-2............ [AMENDED] .......covvveenn.. 1361
585:2-1-3............ [AMENDED] ........ccovveeenn.. 1361
585:2-1-4............ [AMENDED] .........cccvvvnn... 1361
585:2-1-5............ [AMENDED] .......covvvvennn.. 1361
585:2-3-1............ [AMENDED] ........coovvenenn.. 1361
585:2-3-5............ [AMENDED] .........ccvvvnn.. 1362
585:2-3-6............ [AMENDED] .......ovvvvennn.. 1362
585:2-3-7............ [AMENDED] ........ccovveeenn.. 1362
585:2-3-8............ [AMENDED] .........ccvvvnn.. 1362
585:2-5-5. ... ...... [AMENDED] .......oovvvennn.. 1362
585:2-5-6............ [AMENDED] ........ccovvivnn.. 1363
585:2-5-7............ [AMENDED] .........ccvvvnn.. 1363
585:2-5-10. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 1364
585:2-7-3............ [AMENDED] ........ccovvennn.. 1364
585:2-7-12. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvvnn.. 1364
585:30-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccvvvveenn.. 1365
585:30-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovvvvenn.. 1365
585:30-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccvvvenn.. 1365
585:30-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccovvennn.. 1365
585:30-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovvieenn.. 1365
585:30-1-6. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccvvvenn.. 1366
585:30-1-7. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccovvveeenn.. 1366
585:30-1-8. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovveeenn.. 1366
585:35-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccvvvenn.. 1366
585:35-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........covvvienn.. 1366
585:35-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovvvnenn.. 1367
585:35-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccvvvenn.. 1367
585:35-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccovvveenn.. 1367
585:35-5-1. ......... [REVOKED] ... 1367
585:35-5-2. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 1367
585:35-5-3. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 1368
585:35-5-4. ......... [REVOKED] ... 1368
585:35-5-5. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 1368
585:35-5-6. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 1368
585:35-5-7. ......... [REVOKED] ... 1368
585:35-5-8. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 1368
585:35-7-1. ......... [AMENDED] .......covvvennn.. 1369
585:35-7-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovvenenn.. 1369
590:1-1-5............ [AMENDED] ........ccoovveen.. 497
500:1-3-8............ [AMENDED] ......oovvniean.. 497
590:10-1-7. ......... [AMENDED](E) ......'vvveenn 50
590:10-1-7. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccoovveen.. 499
500:10-3-8. ......... [AMENDED] ......oovvnnan.. 499
590:10-3-10. ........ [AMENDED](E) ...\ 50
590:10-3-10. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovvveen.. 500
500:10-3-11. ........ [AMENDED](E) . ....''vveeen.. 50
590:10-3-11. ........ [AMENDED] ........covieen.. 500



Rules Affected Index — continued

590:10-3-14. ........ [AMENDED](E) .. ...\ 51
590:10-3-14. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveven.. 501
590:10-7-4. ......... [AMENDED] (E) . ...\ 51
590:10-7-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........coovveeen.. 501
590:10-7-9. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... .o 51
590:10-7-9. ......... [AMENDED] .......coovveeen.. 501
590:10-7-16. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovveeen.. 502
590:10-7-22. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveeenn.. 503
590:10-8-5. ......... [AMENDED] (E) ......\vvveeen... 52
590:10-8-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........coovveeen.. 503
590:10-9-1. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........vvevennn.. 52
590:10-9-1. ......... [AMENDED] .......ooveeeen.. 503
590:15-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........covveeen.. 504
590:15-1-12. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 504
590:15-1-18. ........ [AMENDED] .......covvveeen.. 505
590:25-9-17. ........ [AMENDED] ........covveeen.. 506
590:25-9-20. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 506
590:25-15-2. ........ [AMENDED] .......coovvieen.. 507
590:35-7-1. ......... [AMENDED] ........coovveeen.. 508
590:35-13-9. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 508
590:35-15-3. ........ [AMENDED] .......covvveeen.. 509
590:35-19-7. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovveeen.. 509
595:1-15-3. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1370
595:10-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccovvveenn.. 1372
595:10-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1372
595:10-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1375
595:10-1-8. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 1377
595:10-1-9. ......... [REVOKED] ..., 1377
595:10-1-10. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvvvenn.. 1378
595:10-1-12. ........ [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1379
595:10-1-18. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1379
595:10-1-19. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1380
595:10-1-27. ........ [AMENDED] ........covvveenn.. 1381
595:10-1-28. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovveenn.. 1381
595:10-1-35. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvvvenn.. 1381
595:10-1-50. ........ [AMENDED] ........covvveenn.. 1382
595:10-1-51. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvvvenn.. 1383
595:10-1-56. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvvvenn.. 1384
595:10-1-91. ........ [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1385
595:10-1-92. ........ [AMENDED] (E) .. ...\ 53
595:10-1-92. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccvvenn.. 1386
595:10-1-93. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovveenn.. 1386
595:10-3-1. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1386
595:10-3-4. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvenn.. 1386
595:10-3-9. ......... [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1387
595:10-5-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvveenn.. 1389
595:10-5-5. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ... 1796
595:10-13-5. ........ [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1389
595:11-1-14. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovveeen.. 510
595:11-1-15. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 511
505:11-1-21. ........ [AMENDED] .......covveeen.. 511
595:11-1-61. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovveaen.. 512
595:11-1-62. ........ [AMENDED] ........cccvvveen.. 512
505:11-3-2. ......... [AMENDED] .......covveeen.. 512
595:11-3-6. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovveeen.. 512
595:11-3-7. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 513
595:11-3-8. ......... [AMENDED] ........coveeen.. 514
595:11-9-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........coovviaen.. 515
595:11-9-6. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveeen.. 515
595:11-9-9. ......... [AMENDED] .......covveeen.. 516
595:25-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] (E) . ....'vvveeennnn. 65
595:25-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovven.. 1391
595:25-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] (E) .....'vvveeennn. 66
595:25-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........cccvveenn.. 1392
595:25-5-6. ......... [AMENDED] (E) ...\ 67
595:25-5-6. ......... [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1392
595:25-9-1. ......... [AMENDED] (E) . ....'vvveeennnn. 67

XVi

595:25-9-1. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvivvenn... 1393
595:35-1-6. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1395
595:35-19. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1396
505:35-1-10. ........ [AMENDED] .........coovvenn... 1398
595:50-3-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccccvvnn... 1401
595:50-3-6. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvveenn... 1401
595:60-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........coovvenn... 1402
595:60-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] ..........cccvvvnn... 1402
595:70-1-1. ......... INEWJ(E) .o, 1797
595:70-1-2. ......... INEWT(E) ©oooneeeeenn, 1797
595:70-1-3. ......... INEWT(E) ©oooeeeen 1798
595:70-1-4. ......... INEWJ(E) ©ooonneeeeeeenn. 1798
595:70-1-5. ......... INEWT(E) ©oooeieeenn, 1798
595:70-1-6. ......... INEWT(E) ©oooneeeeeine, 1798
595:70-1-7. ......... INEWJ(E) ©ooonneeeeenaan, 1798
595:70-1-8. ......... INEWT(E) ©ooeneeeenn, 1798
595:70-1-9. ......... INEWT(E) ©oooeneeeee, 1799
600:10-1-18. ........ INEWJ(E) ©ooonnneeeenan, 1799
605:10-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1404
605:10-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] ..........ccovvvnn... 1404
605:10-3-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1405
605:10-3-7. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvovvenn... 1405
605:10-5-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccccvvnn... 1407
605:10-5-1.1. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1408
605:10-5-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvivvenn... 1410
605:10-7-2. ......... [AMENDED] ..........cccvvnn... 1412
605:10-7-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvnn... 1414
605:10-7-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1414
605:10-7-7. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1414
605:10-7-8. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvnn... 1415
605:10-7-8.1. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1415
605:10-7-8.2. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccvvnn... 1416
605:10-7-8.3. ........ [AMENDED] ........cevvvvnn... 1416
605:10-7-8.4. ........ INEW] e 1417
605:10-9-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1417
605:10-9-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1417
605:10-11-2. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1418
605:10-11-3. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovvenn... 1419
605:10-13-1. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1419
605:10-15-3. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvivvenn... 1421
605:10-17-4. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1422
605:10-17-6. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvnn... 1423
605:10, App. A. ....... [REVOKED] .....vooeeennn.. 1424
605:10, App. A. ...... INEW] oo 1424
610:1-13-1. ......... [REVOKED] ....vvoeeeiaaann, 676
610:1-13-2. ......... [REVOKED] ....ovooeeiinn, 677
610:1-13-3. ......... [REVOKED] .....vooeeeinen, 677
610:25-23-2. ........ [AMENDED] .......ccvvvvenn.. 678
610:25-23-3. ........ [AMENDED] ........covovvenenn.. 679
610:25-23-4. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccovvinenn.. 679
610:25-23-5. ........ [AMENDED] .......oovoeinn.. 681
610:25-23-6. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvivvenen.. 682
610:25-23-8. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccovvenen.. 682
610:25-23-9. ........ [AMENDED] .......ooveinn.. 683
612:1-3-2.1. ......... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1427
612:1-11-4. ......... [AMENDED] ..........ccovvvnn... 1428
612:1-11-15. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1428
612:1-11-55. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvovvenn... 1429
612:1-13-7. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1429
612:1-139. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvnn... 1429
612:10-12. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1430
612:10-1-7. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccvvnn... 1434
612:10-7-24.1. ... . ... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1436
612:10-7-25.1. ....... [AMENDED] .........coivvenn... 1438
612:10-7-87. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccovvvnn... 1439
612:10-7-98. ........ [AMENDED] ........covvvvenn... 1440
612:10-7-230.4. ......[AMENDED] . ........ccoovenn... 1442



Rules Affected Index — continued

612:10-13-4. ........ [REVOKED] .....vvoeeeinennnn.. 1443
612:20-2-5. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovenn... 1444
612:20-2-13. ........ [AMENDED] ........cevivnn... 1445
612:20-2-17. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1445
612:20-9-1. ......... INEW] o 1446
612:25-2-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........cevvvvnn... 1448
612:25-26. ......... [REVOKED] .....vvoeeeinnnn.. 1450
612:25-29. ......... INEW] oo 1451
612:25-4-1. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvnn... 1451
612:25-4-3. ......... [REVOKED] .....vvoeeeinnnn.. 1451
612:25-4-4. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1451
612:25-4-14. ........ [AMENDED] ........covvvnn... 1452
612:25-4-15. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1454
612:25-4-16. ........ INEW] o 1454
612:25-4-25. ........ [AMENDED] ........covvvenn... 1454
612:25-4-26. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1454
612:25-4-27. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccvenn... 1454
612:25-4-28. ........ [REVOKED] ....ovvoeeennnnnn.. 1455
612:25-4-29. ........ [REVOKED] ....ovvoeeeienn.. 1455
612:25-4-30. ........ [REVOKED] .....oooveeiinn. 1456
612:25-4-53. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1456
612:25-4-54. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1456
612:25-4-55. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovenn... 1456
612:25-4-56. ........ [AMENDED] ........cevvvnn... 1457
612:25-4-57. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1457
612:25-4-58. ........ [AMENDED] ..........ccovvnn... 1457
612:25-4-59. ........ [AMENDED] ........cevvvvenn... 1457
612:25-4-60. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1458
612:25-4-61. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovinn... 1458
612:25-4-62. ........ [AMENDED] ........cevvvnn... 1459
612:25-4-73. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1459
612:25-4-74. ........ [REVOKED] ......ooveeinnn.. 1460
612:25-6-1. ......... [AMENDED] ........cevvvvenn... 1460
612:25-6-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........covvvinn... 1461
612:25-6-2.1. ........ INEW] oo 1461
612:25-6-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1462
612:25-65. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1462
612:25-6-15. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1463
612:25-6-16. ........ [AMENDED] ........cevvvenn... 1463
612:25-6-18. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1463
612:25-6-19. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1465
612:25-6-20. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1465
612:25-6-21. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1465
612:25-6-22. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccovvnn... 1466
612:25-6-32. ........ [AMENDED] ........cevvvenn... 1466
612:25-6-33. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1467
655:10-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvvnn... 1719
655:10-7-1. ......... [AMENDED] ........cevvvenn... 1721
655:10-7-11. ........ [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1722
655:10-7-13. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccovenn... 1725
655:10-7-32. ........ [AMENDED] ........cevvvenn... 1726
655:10-7-33. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovvvenn... 1726
655:10-9-1. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccovenn... 1727
675:1-1-1.1. ......... [AMENDED](E) .. ...\, 35
675:1-1-1.1. ......... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1729
675:1-14. ........... [AMENDED](E) . ...\ 35
675:1-14. ........... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvveenn... 1729
675:1-19. ........... [AMENDED](E) . ...\, 35
675:1-1-9. ........... [AMENDED] .........cccovvvnn... 1729
675:3-12......... ... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvenn... 1730
675:3-13............ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1730
675:3-1-3.1. ......... INEW] oo 1732
675:3- 14 ........... [AMENDED] ........cevvveenn... 1732
675:10-1-1.2. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1733
675:10-1-4. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........vveeenn.. 36
675:10-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........cevvvenn... 1733
675:10-1-5. ......... [AMENDED](E) .. ...\, 36

XVii

675:10-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovvenenn.. 1733
675:10-1-6. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccvvvnn.. 1735
675:10-1-9. ......... [AMENDED](E) . ....'vvvoeennn. 37
675:10-1-9. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovvveenn... 1736
675:10-1-10. ........ [AMENDED](E) ...\ 38
675:10-1-10. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovveeenn.. 1736
675:10-1-12.1. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccovvenenn.. 1736
675:12-1-4. ......... [AMENDED](E) ...\ 38
675:12-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........covvveeenn.. 1737
675:12-1-6. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvveeenn.. 1737
675:12-1-8. ......... INEW] oo 1739
675:15-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........coovvenenn.. 1739
675:15-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovveenn.. 1739
675:15-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccvvvvnn.. 1740
675:20-1-6. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccvvveenn.. 1741
7100112, ... [AMENDED] ........cvvinen.. 685
710:10-2-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccoovveen.. 516
710:10-7-2.2. ........ [AMENDED] ......covvninan.. 517
710:10-7-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........cvuieen.. 518
710:10-7-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccoovveen.. 518
710:10-7-11. ........ [AMENDED] ......covvnnaan.. 519
710:10-7-13. ........ [AMENDED] ........cvvieen.. 519
710:10-14-1. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccoovvven.. 519
710:20-2-5. ......... [AMENDED] .......ovvnnan.. 520
710:20-2-6. ......... [AMENDED] ........cvveen.. 520
710:20-3-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccoovveen.. 522
710:20-5-6. ......... [AMENDED] ......oovvnnnan.. 522
710:22-5-11. ........ [AMENDED] ........cvvinen.. 522
710:25-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccoovveen.. 523
710:45-9-21. ........ [AMENDED] .......ovvniean.. 524
710:45-9-23. ........ [AMENDED] ........cvvieen.. 525
710:45-9-24. .. ...... [AMENDED] ........ccoovveen.. 525
710:45-9-27. ........ [AMENDED] ......oovinnnan.. 525
710:45-9-28. ........ [AMENDED] ........cvvieen.. 525
710:45-9-31. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovvueen.. 526
710:45-9-32.1. ....... [AMENDED] .......oovninen.. 526
710:45-9-34. ........ [AMENDED] ........cvveeen.. 527
710:45-9-35. ........ [AMENDED] ........cooovvnen.. 527
710:45-9-40. ........ [AMENDED] .......oevvnen.. 527
710:45-9-41. ........ [AMENDED] ........cvvinen.. 527
710:45-9-51. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovvveen.. 528
710:45-9-60. ........ [AMENDED] ......oovinean.. 528
710:45-9-62. ........ [AMENDED] ........cvvieen.. 529
710:45-9-62.1. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccovvueen.. 529
710:45-9-64. ........ [AMENDED] .......oevvvnan.. 530
710:45-9-70. ........ [AMENDED] ........cvvinen.. 530
710:45-9-71. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccoovunen.. 530
710:45-9-73. ........ [AMENDED] .......ovvnneen.. 531
710:45-9-82. ........ [AMENDED] ........coveeen.. 531
710:45-9-90. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovvveen.. 531
710:45-9-92. ........ [AMENDED] .......ovvnnan.. 531
710:45-9-93. ........ [AMENDED] ........covinen.. 532
710:50-3-54. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccvvvenn.. 1468
710:50-3-55. ........ INEW] oo 1470
710:50-15-53. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccovvveenn.. 1475
710:50-15-109. ...... [AMENDED] .........ccvvvnn.. 1471
710:50-15-110. ...... [AMENDED] ........covveeenn.. 1472
710:50-15-114. ...... INEW] oo 1473
710:50-15-115. ...... INEW] oo 1474
710:50-17-51. ....... [AMENDED] ........covvveeenn.. 1476
710:60-3-12. ........ [AMENDED] ........cvovieen.. 533
710:60-3-24. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccoovveen.. 533
710:60-3-140. ....... [AMENDED] .......ovvnnen.. 534
710:60-3-141. ....... [AMENDED] ........cvvinen.. 534
710:60-3-201. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccoveeen.. 535
710:60-5-2. ......... [AMENDED] .......ovvuneen.. 535
710:60-5-8. ......... INEW] oo 535



Rules Affected Index — continued

710:60-5-51. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:60-5-61. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:60-5-64. ... ..... INEW] .o,
710:60-5-77. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:60-5-91. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:60-7-3. ......... [AMENDED] ..............
710:60-9-54. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:60-9-132. ....... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-1-7. ......... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-3-1. ......... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-3-3. ......... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-7-6. ......... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-7-9. ......... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-7-13. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-9-10. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-13-15. ....... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-13-16. ....... [REVOKED] ..............
710:65-13-130. ...... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-13-152.1. .....[AMENDED] ..............
710:65-13-210. ...... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-13-337. ...... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-13-338. ...... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-13-511. ...... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-18-4. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-18-6. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-19-45. .. ..... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-19-49. ....... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-19-52. ....... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-19-55. ....... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-19-56. ....... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-19-76. ....... [REVOKED] ..............
710:65-19-109. ...... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-19-116. ...... INEW] ..o,
710:65-19-193. ...... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-19-210. ...... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-19-329. ...... [AMENDED] ..............
710:65-19-350. ...... [AMENDED] ..............
710:70-2-15. ........ INEW] oo
710:70-5-3. ......... [AMENDED] ..............
710:70-5-5. ......... [AMENDED] ..............
710:70-5-14. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:90-3-11. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-5-1. ......... [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-5-2. ......... [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-5-3. ......... [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-5-8. ......... [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-5-9. ......... [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-5-10. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-5-11. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-5-12. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-5-19. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-12-11. ....... INEW] oo,
710:95-17-3. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-17-7. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-19-6. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-19-7. ........ [AMENDED] ..............
710:95-21-1. ........ INEW] oo,
710:95-21-2. ........ INEW] oo
710:95-21-3. ........ INEW] oo
710:95-21-4. ........ INEW] oo,
710:95-21-5. ........ INEW] oo
710:95-21-6. ........ INEW] oo
710:95-21-7. ........ INEW] oo,
710:95-21-8. ........ INEW] oo,
710:95-21-9. ........ INEW] oo
710:95-21-10. ....... INEW] @,
712:10-5-1. ......... [AMENDED] ..............

712:10-5-2. ......... [AMENDED] ..............oiet 847
712:10-5-3. ......... [AMENDED] ..............ooit 848
712:10-5-4. ......... [AMENDED] ...t 851
715:1-1-2. ... [AMENDED] .............cooiet. 853
715:1-1-3............ [AMENDED] ..............ooiet. 853
715:1-1-4. ... .. [AMENDED] ...t 853
715:1-1-6............ [REVOKED] ..ot 853
715:1-1-9............ [REVOKED] .........coovviiiinnt. 854
715:10-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] ...t 855
715:10-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] ..............coit. 855
715:10-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] ..............ooiet 855
715:10-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] ...t 856
715:10-1-6. ......... [AMENDED] .............coontt. 856
715:10-1-7. ......... [AMENDED] .............cooouet 856
715:10-3-1. ......... [AMENDED] ...t 857
715:10-3-2. ......... [AMENDED] ..............ooitt. 857
715:10-3-3. ......... [AMENDED] ..............out 857
715:10-3-4. ......... [AMENDED] ...t 858
715:10-3-5. ......... [AMENDED] ..............cont. 858
715:10-5-4. ......... [REVOKED] .........cooviiiinnt. 858
715:10-5-7.3. ........ [AMENDED] ...t 859
715:10-5-9. ......... [AMENDED] .............cooont. 860
715:10-5-11. ........ [REVOKED] ..........ccooviiiinnt. 860
715:10-5-28. ........ [AMENDED] ...t 860
715:10-5-33. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 861
715:10-7-6. ......... [AMENDED] ...............ooont 861
715:10-9-2. ......... [REVOKED] ...t 861
715:10-9-3. ......... [AMENDED] ..............coiet. 861
715:10-9-4. ......... [REVOKED] ..........ccooviviinnt. 861
715:10-9-5. ......... [AMENDED] ...t 862
715:10-9-6. ......... [REVOKED] ...t 862
715:10-11-1. ........ [AMENDED] ..............cooet 862
715:10-11-2. ........ [AMENDED] ............ccooiint. 863
715:10-13-1. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 863
715:10-13-4.1. ....... [REVOKED] .........ccoviiiinnt. 864
715:10-13-9. ........ [REVOKED] ...... ..ot 864
715:10-13-13. ....... [AMENDED] .............coooitt. 865
715:10-15-1. ........ [AMENDED] ..............ooont 865
715:10-15-2. ........ [AMENDED] ............ccooiint. 865
715:10-15-7. ........ [AMENDED] .............cooont. 866
715:10-15-7.1. ....... [REVOKED] .........ccoviiiinnt. 866
715:10-15-10.2. ......[AMENDED] .................... . 866
715:10-15-10.3. ......[AMENDED] .................. ... 867
715:10-15-13. ....... [REVOKED] .........coovviiiinnt. 868
715:10-17-2. ........ [AMENDED] ............ccooint. 868
715:10-17-6. ........ [AMENDED] ..............coitt. 868
715:10-25-1. ........ [REVOKED] .........ccoviiiinnt. 869
715:10-25-2. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 869
715:10-25-3. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 869
715:10-25-4. ........ [REVOKED] .........cooviiiinnt. 869
715:10-25-5. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 869
715:10-25-6. ........ [REVOKED] ...t 870
720:10-3-3. ......... [AMENDED] ................o0oe 1486
720:10-3-5. ......... [AMENDED] ............cooiiit. 1486
720:10-3-9. ......... [AMENDED] ..............coooe 1487
730:1-3-4. ... [AMENDED] ..............coone 1487
730:10-1-1. ......... [AMENDED] ............cccoiit 1488
730:10-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] .............cooit 1488
730:10-1-3. ......... [AMENDED] ..............coone 1489
730:10-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] ............cccoiit. 1489
730:10-1-5. ......... [REVOKED] ...t 1490
730:10-1-6. ......... [REVOKED] ..........ccoviiit. 1490
730:10-1-7. ......... [AMENDED] ............ccooit. 1490
730:10-1-8. ......... [REVOKED] ...t 1490
730:10-1-9. ......... [AMENDED] ..............coout 1490
730:10-1-11. ........ [AMENDED] ............coiiit 1491
730:10-15-1. ........ [AMENDED] .............ccooie 1491



Rules Affected Index — continued

730:10-15-2. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccvivvennn... 1491
730:10, App. A. ....... [REVOKED] .....oooveeiann. 1492
730:10, App. B. ....... INEW] oo, 1493
730:15-19. ......... [REVOKED] ....ovvoeeennnn.. 1494
730:15-3-1. ......... INEW] oo 1494
730:15-3-2. ......... INEW] oo 1494
730:20-3-1. ......... INEW] oo 568
730:20-3-2. ......... INEW] oo 568
730:30-5-2. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvnn... 1495
730:35-53. ......... [AMENDED] .........covvvenn... 1496
730:35-5-18. ........ INEW] e 1499
748:1-12. ... ... ... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1645
748:1-14. ... ... ... [AMENDED] ........ccvvvvenn... 1645
748:3-12............ [AMENDED] .........cccovvenn... 1645
748:20-1-1. ......... INEW] e 1647
748:20-12. ......... INEW] oo 1647
748:20-1-3. ......... INEW] oo 1647
748:20-1-4. ......... INEW] oo, 1647
748:20-1-5. ......... INEW] oo 1647
748:20-16. ......... INEW] oo 1648
748:20-1-7. ......... INEW] oo 1648
748:20-1-8. ......... INEW] oo 1648
748:20-1-9. ......... INEW] oo 1649
748:20-1-10. ........ INEW] oo, 1649
748:20-1-11. ........ INEW] oo 1649
748:20-1-12. ........ INEW] oo 1649
748:20-1-13. ........ INEW] oo, 1650
748:20-1-14. ........ INEW] oo 1650
748:20-1-15. ........ INEW] oo 1651
748:20-1-16. ........ INEW] oo, 1651
748:20-1-17. ........ INEW] oo 1651
748:20-1-18. ........ INEW] oo 1651
748:20-3-1. ......... INEW] oo, 1652
748:20-3-2. ......... INEW] oo 1652
748:20-3-3. ......... INEW] oo 1652
748:20-3-4. ......... INEW] oo, 1652
748:20-3-5. ......... INEW] oo 1652
748:20-3-6. ......... INEW] oo 1653
748:20-3-7. ......... INEW] oo 1653
748:20-38. ......... INEW] oo 1653
748:20-3-9. ......... INEW] oo 1654
748:20-3-10. ........ INEW] oo 1654
748:20-3-11. ........ INEW] oo 1654
748:20-3-12. ........ INEW] oo 1655
748:20-3-13. ........ INEW] oo 1656
748:20-3-14. ........ INEW] oo 1656
748:20-7-1. ......... INEW] oo 1657
748:20-7-2. ......... INEW] oo 1657
748:20-7-3. ......... INEW] oo 1657
748:20-7-4. ......... INEW] oo 1657
748:20-7-5. ......... INEW] oo 1657
748:20-76. ......... INEW] oo 1658
748:20-7-7. ......... INEW] oo 1658
748:20-7-8. ......... INEW] oo 1658
748:20-79. ......... INEW] oo 1658
748:20-9-1. ......... INEW] oo 1660
748:20-9-2. ......... INEW] oo 1660
748:20-9-3. ......... INEW] oo 1660
748:20-9-4. ......... INEW] oo 1660
748:20-95. ......... INEW] oo 1660
748:20-9-6. ......... INEW] oo 1661
748:20-11-1. ........ INEW] oo 1661
748:20-11-2. ........ INEW] oo 1661
748:20-11-3. ........ INEW] oo 1661
748:20-11-4. ........ INEW] oo 1661
748:20-11-5. ........ INEW] oo 1661

XiX

748:20-11-6. ........ INEW] oo 1662
748:20-11-7. ........ INEW] oo 1662
748:20-11-8. ........ INEW] oo 1662
748:20-11-9. ........ INEW] oo 1664
748:20-13-1. ........ INEW] oo 1664
748:20-13-2. ........ INEW] oo 1664
748:20-13-3. ........ INEW] oo 1664
748:20-13-4. ........ INEW] oo 1664
748:20-13-5. ........ INEW] @ 1664
748:20-13-6. ........ INEW] oo 1665
748:20-13-7. ........ INEW] oo 1665
748:20-13-8. ........ INEW] oo 1665
748:20-13-9. ........ INEW] oo 1666
748:20-13-10. ....... INEW] oo 1666
748:20-15-1. ........ INEW] oo 1666
748:20-15-2. ........ INEW] oo 1666
748:20-15-3. ........ INEW] oo 1666
748:20-15-4. ........ INEW] oo 1667
748:20-15-5. ........ INEW] oo 1667
748:20-15-6. ........ INEW] oo 1667
748:20-15-7. ........ INEW] oo 1667
748:20-15-8. ........ INEW] oo 1668
748:20-15-9. ........ INEW] oo 1669
748:20-15-10. ....... INEW] oo 1669
748:20-15-11. ....... INEW] oo 1670
748:20-15-12. ....... INEW] oo 1670
748:20-15-13. ....... INEW] oo 1671
748:20-15-14. ....... INEW] oo 1671
748:20-15-15. ....... INEW] oo 1671
748:20-15-16. ....... NS T 1671
780:15-3-1. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovveeenn.. 1500
780:20-3-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvvnn.. 1501
780:20-3-4. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccovveenn.. 1507
800:1-11-1. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovvveenn.. 1508
800:10-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvvnn.. 1509
800:10-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1510
800:10-5-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........coovvenenn.. 1512
800:25-3-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........ccovvvnn.. 1513
800:25-3-3. ......... [AMENDED] .......ccovvienn.. 1515
800:25-7-3. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovvvnenn.. 1515
800:25-7-7. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccvvvenn.. 1516
800:25-7-48. ........ [AMENDED] ........covvveenn.. 1517
800:25-7-55. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovveeenn... 1517
800:25-7-57. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccvvvnn.. 1517
800:25-7-67. ........ [AMENDED] ........covvieenn.. 1518
800:25-7-83.1. ....... INEW] oo 1518
800:25-7-90. ........ [AMENDED] .........ccvvvnn... 1519
800:25-7-91. ........ [AMENDED] .......ccovvvienn... 1519
800:25-7-94. ........ [AMENDED] ........ccovvveenn.. 1520
800:25-7-94.1.1. ... [NEW] ...ooooiiineiiien, 1520
800:25-7-111. ....... [AMENDED] ........covveenn.. 1521
800:25-7-126. ....... [AMENDED] ........ccovveeenn.. 1521
800:25-7-131.1. ......[AMENDED] .........cccvvven.... 1521
800:25-7-131.2. ......[AMENDED] ........ccoveeenn... 1522
800:25-7-149.1. ......[AMENDED] .........cccvveen.... 1522
800:25-9-11. ........ [AMENDED] .........cccvvvenn.. 1522
800:25-29-3. ........ [AMENDED] ........covvveenn... 1523
800:25-29-4. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovvenenn.. 1523
800:30-1-2. ......... [AMENDED] .........cccvvvnn... 1524
800:30-1-4. ......... [AMENDED] ........covvvieenn.. 1525
800:30-1-5. ......... [AMENDED] ........ccovveenn.. 1526
800:30-1-7. ......... [AMENDED](E) . ... 1757
800:30-1-20. ........ [AMENDED] ........coovveeenn.. 1527
800:30-1-21. ........ = T 1527
45027-5-43.......... INEW] oo 670



Agency/Title Index

[Assigned as of 8-15-12]

Agency

Oklahoma ABSTRACTORS Board
Oklahoma ACCOUNTANCY Board
State ACCREDITING Agency
AD Valorem Task Force (abolished 7-1-93)
Oklahoma AERONAUTICS Commission
Board of Regents for the Oklahoma AGRICULTURAL and Mechanical
Colleges (exempted 11-1-98)
Oklahoma Department of AGRICULTURE, Food, and Forestry
Oklahoma Board of Licensed ALCOHOL and Drug Counselors
Board of Tests for ALCOHOL and Drug Influence
ALCOHOLIC Beverage Laws Enforcement Commission
ANATOMICAL Board of the State of Oklahoma
Board of Governors of the Licensed ARCHITECTS, Landscape
Architects and Registered Interior Designers of Oklahoma
(Formerly: Board of Governors of the Licensed ARCHITECTS
and Landscape Architects of Oklahoma; and Board of Governors of
the Licensed ARCHITECTS, Landscape Architects and Interior
Designers of Oklahoma
ARCHIVES and Records Commission
Board of Trustees for the ARDMORE Higher
Education Program (exempted 11-1-98)
Oklahoma ARTS Council
Oklahoma State ATHLETIC Commission (Formerly: Oklahoma
Professional BOXING Commission) - See Title 92
ATTORNEY General
State AUDITOR and Inspector
State BANKING Department
Oklahoma State Employees BENEFITS Council
Council of BOND Oversight
Oklahoma State ATHLETIC Commission (Formerly: Oklahoma
Professional BOXING Commission)
State BURIAL Board (abolished 7-1-92)
[RESERVED]
Oklahoma CAPITAL Investment Board
Oklahoma CAPITOL Improvement Authority
State CAPITOL Preservation Commission
CAPITOL-MEDICAL Center Improvement and Zoning
Commission
Oklahoma Department of CAREER and Technology Education
(Formerly: Oklahoma Department of VOCATIONAL and
Technical Education) - See Title 780
Board of Regents of CARL Albert State College (exempted
11-1-98)
Department of CENTRAL Services (Formerly: Office of PUBLIC
Affairs) - See Title 580
CEREBRAL Palsy Commission
Commission on CHILDREN and Youth
Board of CHIROPRACTIC Examiners
Oklahoma Department of EMERGENCY Management
(Formerly: Department of CIVIL Emergency Management)
Oklahoma Department of COMMERCE
COMMUNITY Hospitals Authority
COMPSOURCE Oklahoma (Formerly: State INSURANCE
Fund) - See Title 370
Oklahoma CONSERVATION Commission
CONSTRUCTION Industries Board
Department of CONSUMER Credit
CORPORATION Commission
Department of CORRECTIONS
State Board of COSMETOLOGY
Oklahoma State CREDIT Union Board
CRIME Victims Compensation Board
Joint CRIMINAL Justice System Task Force Committee
Board of DENTISTRY
Oklahoma DEVELOPMENT Finance Authority
Office of DISABILITY Concerns (Formerly: Office of
HANDICAPPED Concerns) - See Title 305
Board of Regents of EASTERN Oklahoma State College (exempted
11-1-98)

55
60

65
70

XX

Agency Title
EDGE FundPolicyBoard ...........cciiviiiiiiiinnnn.. 208
State Department of EDUCATION  ........... vt 210
EDUCATION OversightBoard . ...........coviiiiinnnnnn. 215
Oklahoma EDUCATIONAL Television Authority . ............. 220
[RESERVED] ittt 225
State ELECTIONBoard . ... 230
Oklahoma FUNERAL Board (Formerly: Oklahoma State Board of

EMBALMERS and Funeral Directors) .................. 235
Oklahoma Department of EMERGENCY Management

(Formerly: Department of CIVIL Emergency Management) -

See Title 145
Oklahoma EMPLOYMENT Security Commission . ............ 240
Oklahoma ENERGY ResourcesBoard . ............ ...t 243
State Board of Licensure for Professional ENGINEERS and Land

Surveyors (Formerly: State Board of Registration for Professional

ENGINEERS and Land SUrveyors) ...........oevuuennn 245
Board of Trustees for the ENID Higher

Education Program (exempted 11-1-98) .................. 250
Department of ENVIRONMENTAL Quality ................. 252
State Board of EQUALIZATION ... ... i 255
ETHICS Commission (Titlerevoked) ............c.ocoiue..n. 257
ETHICS CommisSiOn . v v vt e et eans 258
Officeof State FINANCE . ... . i e 260
State FIRE Marshal Commission . ...........cccvuvnnvnenn.. 265
Oklahoma Council on FIREFIGHTER Training . .............. 268
Oklahoma FIREFIGHTERS Pension and Retirement System . ... .. 270
[RESERVED] ittt 275
FORENSICReviewBoard ...........ccoviiiiinninnnnnnn. 277
State Board of Registration for FORESTERS ................. 280
FOSTER Care Review AdvisoryBoard . ............covvnnn 285
Oklahoma FUNERAL Board (Formerly: Oklahoma State Board of

Embalmers and Funeral Directors) - See Title 235
Oklahoma FUTURES ... ... i 290
GOVERNOR (See also Title 1, Executive Orders) . ............. 295
GRAND River Dam Authority . ........ ... 300
Group Self-Insurance Association GUARANTY Fund Board ...... 302
Individual Self-Insured GUARANTY FundBoard .............. 303

STATE Use Committee (Formerly: Committee on Purchases of Products

and Services of the Severely HANDICAPPED) ............ 304
Office of DISABILITY Concerns (Formerly: Office of

HANDICAPPED CONCEIMS) v vt v vt vieeiieneennns 305
Oklahoma State Departmentof HEALTH .................... 310
Oklahoma Basic HEALTH Benefits Board (abolished 11-1-97) ..... 315
Oklahoma HEALTH Care Authority . .........covivinnnn.. 317
HIGHWAY Construction Materials Technician Certification

Board ... 318
Oklahoma HISTORICAL SoCiety ... .vvvininnii i 320
Oklahoma HORSE Racing Commission . ..........cccvvvn.... 325
Oklahoma HOUSING Finance AgenCy .. ........ouvuvvnenn.. 330
Oklahoma HUMAN Rights Commission . .................... 335
Department of HUMAN Services . .........ovuviinvinnennn 340
Committee for INCENTIVE Awards for State Employees ......... 345
Oklahoma INDIAN Affairs Commission . .............covuu.. 350
Oklahoma INDIGENT Defense System . ..........c..ovvnnn.. 352
Oklahoma INDUSTRIAL Finance Authority ................. 355
INJURY ReviewBoard ........ ..o, 357
Oklahoma State and Education Employees Group INSURANCE

Board ... e 360
INSURANCE Department .. ... iiieeeee e 365
COMPSOURCE Oklahoma

(Formerly: State INSURANCEFund) ................... 370
Oklahoma State Bureau of INVESTIGATION ................ 375
Councilon JUDICIAL Complaints . .........couviennn... 376
Officeof JUVENILEAffairs ........ ..., 377
Departmentof LABOR . ... ... it 380
Department of the Commissioners of the LAND Office ........... 385
Council on LAW Enforcement Educationand Training ........... 390
Oklahoma LAW Enforcement Retirement System .. ............. 395
Board on LEGISLATIVE Compensation .................... 400



Agency/Title Index — continued

Agency Title
Oklahoma Department of LIBRARIES ...................... 405
LIEUTENANT GOVEINOr ..ot i it i i i e enns 410
Oklahoma LINKED DepositReviewBoard . .................. 415
Oklahoma LIQUEFIED Petroleum GasBoard . ............... 420

Oklahoma LIQUEFIED Petroleum Gas Research, Marketing and Safety

COMMISSION & .\ttt et e 422
LITERACY Initiatives Commission . ..........c.ouuiennennnn 425
LONG-RANGE Capital Planning Commission . ............... 428
Oklahoma State Board of Examiners for LONG-TERM Care

Administrators (Formerly: Oklahoma State Board of Examiners

for NURSING Home Administrators) - See Title 490
LOTTERY Commission,Oklahoma . ................ovvunn 429
Board of Trustees for the MCCURTAIN County Higher Education

Program (exempted 11-1-98) .. ... ... 430
Commission on MARGINALLY Producing Oil and Gas Wells ... .. 432
State Board of MEDICAL Licensure and Supervision . ........... 435
MEDICAL Technology and Research Authority of Oklahoma . .. ... 440
Board of MEDICOLEGAL Investigations . .................. 445
Department of MENTAL Health and Substance Abuse Services .. ... 450
MERIT Protection Commission .. .......ccvviueninrenneenns 455
MILITARY Planning Commission, Oklahoma Strategic .......... 457
Departmentof MINES . ... ... e 460
Oklahoma MOTOR Vehicle Commission ............ ...t 465
Board of Regents of MURRAY State College (exempted 11-1-98) 470
Oklahoma State Bureau of NARCOTICS and Dangerous Drugs

Control .. 475
Board of Regents of NORTHERN Oklahoma College (exempted

T 480
OklahomaBoard of NURSING . ............c.civiiinnnnn.. 485
Oklahoma State Board of Examiners for LONG-TERM Care

Administrators (Formerly: Oklahoma State Board of Examiners

for NURSING Home Administrators) ................... 490
Board of Regents of OKLAHOMA City Community College (exempted

2 495
Board of Regents of OKLAHOMA Colleges (exempted 11-1-98) .... 500
Board of ExaminersinOPTOMETRY ...........c.coivvnnn. 505
State Board of OSTEOPATHIC Examiners . .................. 510
PARDONandParoleBoard . ..........oiuuiiniinnnnnnnnn. 515
Oklahoma PEANUT COmMMISSION . v oo it e nie i enn s 520
Oklahoma State PENSION Commission . ...........ovvuvnn.. 525
State Board of Examiners of PERFUSIONISTS ............... 527
Office of PERSONNEL Management . ...........ccovivvnn.. 530
Board of Commercial PET Breeders ...........ccovuiiinennn 532
Oklahoma State Board of PHARMACY . ...... ..., 535
PHYSICIAN Manpower Training Commission . ............... 540
Board of PODIATRIC Medical Examiners ................... 545
Oklahoma POLICE Pension and Retirement System . ........... 550
State Department of POLLUTION Control (abolished 1-1-93) ..... 555
POLYGRAPH ExaminersBoard ............cccviuuinn... 560
Oklahoma Board of PRIVATE Vocational Schools . ............. 565
State Board for PROPERTY and Casualty Rates

(abolished 7-1-06; seealso Title 365) . ............ouu... 570
State Board of Examiners of PSYCHOLOGISTS .............. 575
Department of CENTRAL Services (Formerly: Office of PUBLIC

Affairs) ... 580
PUBLIC Employees RelationsBoard .. ..................... 585
Oklahoma PUBLIC Employees Retirement System . ............ 590
Departmentof PUBLIC Safety ............coviiniiinnnn. 595
REAL Estate AppraiserBoard . .......... ..o 600
Oklahoma REAL Estate Commission . .........oovvvuiueenn.. 605
Board of Regents of REDLANDS Community College (exempted

T 607
State REGENTS for Higher Education . ..................... 610
State Department of REHABILITATION Services ............. 612
Board of Regents of ROGERS State College (exempted 11-1-98) .... 615
Board of Regents of ROSE State College (exempted 11-1-98) ....... 620

XXi

Agency Title
Oklahoma SAVINGS and Loan Board (abolished 7-1-93) ......... 625
SCENIC Rivers COmmIsSiON .. v v v vt i i i inie e nnens 630
Oklahoma Commission on SCHOOL and County Funds

Management ... ... e 635
Advisory Task Force on the Sale of SCHOOL Lands (functions

concluded2-92) ... . e 640
The Oklahoma School of SCIENCE and Mathematics . .......... 645
Oklahoma Center for the Advancement of SCIENCE and

Technology .. e 650
SECRETARY OfState . ...... v 655
Departmentof SECURITIES ....... ... 660
Board of Regents of SEMINOLE State College (exempted

e 665
SHEEP and Wool Commission . ..........uiiinnnnnennnn.. 670
State Board of Licensed SOCIAL Workers . ...........cooun. 675
SOUTHERN Growth PoliciesBoard . ...........ccovvvvnnn.. 680
Oklahoma SOYBEAN Commission (abolished 7-1-97) . .......... 685
Board of Examiners for SPEECH-LANGUAGE Pathology and

Audiology (Formerly: Board of Examiners for SPEECH

Pathology and Audiology) . ....... ..., 690
STATE Employee Charitable Contributions, Oversight

Committee for (Formerly: STATE Agency

Review Committee) ........ ... 695

STATE Use Committee (Formerly: Committee on Purchases of Products
and Services of the Severely HANDICAPPED) —See Title 304

Oklahoma STUDENT Loan Authority ..., 700
TASKFOrce2000 ..o vt 705
Oklahoma TAX COmmISSioN ... .o vu v i i i 710
Oklahoma Commission for TEACHER Preparation ............. 712
TEACHERS’ Retirement System . .........coviiinnnnnnn 715
State TEXTBOOK Committee . ...........cooviiininnnn.. 720
TOBACCO Settlement Endowment TrustFund . ............... 723
Oklahoma TOURISM and Recreation Department . ............. 725
Department of TRANSPORTATION . ..., 730
Oklahoma TRANSPORTATION Authority (Name changed to

Oklahoma TURNPIKE Authority 11-1-05) - See Title 731
Oklahoma TURNPIKE Authority (Formerly: Oklahoma

TRANSPORTATION Authority AND Oklahoma TURNPIKE

Authority) -Seealso Title745 . ........... . i, 731
State TREASURER . ... i 735
Board of Regents of TULSA Community College (exempted

11-1-98) oo 740
Oklahoma TURNPIKE Authority (Name changed to Oklahoma

TRANSPORATION Authority 11-1-99 - no rules enacted in this

Title-See Title 731) ... .o v i e 745
Oklahoma UNIFORM Building Code Commission . ............ 748
Board of Trustees for the UNIVERSITY Center at Tulsa (exempted

1 750
UNIVERSITY Hospitals Authority ........... ..o 752
UNIVERSITY Hospitals Trust . ..., 753
Board of Regents of the UNIVERSITY of Oklahoma (exempted

11-1-98) o s 755
Board of Regents of the UNIVERSITY of Science and Arts

of Oklahoma (exempted 11-1-98) ...........ccovuinnn.. 760
Oklahoma USED Motor Vehicle and Parts Commission . .......... 765
Oklahoma Department of VETERANS Affairs ................ 770
Board of VETERINARY Medical Examiners . ................ 775
Oklahoma Department of CAREER and Technology Education

(Formerly: Oklahoma Department of VOCATIONAL and

Technical Education) . ..........cciiuiiiinnnennn.. 780
Oklahoma WATER ResourcesBoard . ............. ...t 785
Board of Regents of WESTERN Oklahoma State College (exempted

11-1-98) o 790
Oklahoma WHEAT Commission . .........covuvuennennenn . 795
Department of WILDLIFE Conservation . ................... 800
WILL Rogers and J.M. Davis Memorials Commission . .......... 805



XXii



Notices of Rulemaking Intent

Prior to adoption and gubernatorial/legislative review of a proposed PERMANENT rulemaking action, an agency must publish
a Notice of Rulemaking Intent in the Register. In addition, an agency may publish a Notice of Rulemaking Intent in the Register prior to
adoption of a proposed EMERGENCY or PREEMPTIVE rulemaking action.

A Notice of Rulemaking Intent announces a comment period, or a comment period and public hearing, and provides other
information about the intended rulemaking action as required by law, including where copies of proposed rules may be obtained.

For additional information on Notices of Rulemaking Intent, see 75 O.S., Section 303.

TITLE 748. UNIFORM BUILDING CODE
COMMISSION
CHAPTER 3. GENERAL PROVISIONS

[OAR Docket #12-842]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

Notice of proposed EMERGENCY rulemaking
PROPOSED RULES:

748:3-1-2. Definitions [AMENDED]

SUMMARY:

The proposed emergency rule amendment deletes the
definition of a Hardship Waiver of Late Fees from the section,
in conformity with the amendments to 59 O.S. 2011 § 1000.25
adopted by the Fifty-Third Legislature, 2012 Second Regular
Session effective November 1, 2012.

AUTHORITY:

This emergency rule is being promulgated under the
authority of 59 O.S. § 1000.24 and 1000.28.

COMMENT PERIOD:

Written and oral comments will be accepted during regular
business hours beginning August 16, 2012 and will be accepted
through September 14, 2012, at the offices of the Uniform
Building Code Commission. Written comments may be hand
delivered to the Commission at 2401 NW 23rd, Suite 2-F,
Oklahoma City, OK 73107 or may be mailed to the following
address: Uniform Building Code Commission, P.O. Box
700007, Oklahoma City, OK 73107.

PUBLIC HEARING:

A public hearing on this proposed emergency rule will be
held at 1:30 p.m. on September 18, 2012, at a regular meeting
of the Uniform Building Code Commission at 2401 NW 23rd,
Suite 2-F. Anyone who wishes to speak during the public
hearing must sign in at the door by 1:35 p.m.

REQUESTS FOR COMMENTS FROM BUSINESS
ENTITIES:

The Uniform Building Code Commission requests that
business entities affected by this proposed emergency rule
provide the Uniform Building Code Commission, within
the comment period set forth and described above, in dollar
amounts if possible, the increase or decrease in the level of
direct costs, such as administrative fees, and the indirect costs
such as report, recordkeeping, equipment, construction, labor,
professional services, revenue loss, or other costs that the
business entity expects to be incurred due to compliance with
the proposed emergency rule. Business entities may submit
this information in writing to Kathy Hehnly at the above

August 15, 2012

1786

mailing address, before the close of the comment period on
September 14, 2012.
COPIES OF PROPOSED RULES:

Copies of the proposed emergency rule may be obtained
from the Uniform Building Code Commission at, 2401 NW
23rd, Suite 2-F, Oklahoma City, OK 73107, before the close
of the comment period on September 14, 2012. The proposed
emergency rule can be found on the Uniform Building Code
Commission website at: www.ok.gov/oubcc.

RULE IMPACT STATEMENT:

Pursuant to 75 O.S. § 303 (D), a rule impact statement
has been prepared, and may be obtained from the Uniform
Building Code Commission at the above physical address.
CONTACT PERSONS:

Billy Pope, Chief Executive Officer 405-521-6501

Kathy Hehnly, Commission Secretary 405-521-6501

[OAR Docket #12-842; filed 7-18-12]

TITLE 748. UNIFORM BUILDING CODE
COMMISSION
CHAPTERS. FEESAND COLLECTION OF
FEES

[OAR Docket #12-841]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

Notice of proposed EMERGENCY rulemaking
PROPOSED RULES:

Subchapter 3. Collection and Late Fee Assessment

748:5-3-1. Late Fee Assessment [AMENDED]
SUMMARY:

The proposed emergency rule amendment is to conform the
late fee assessment requirements of the Oklahoma Uniform
Building Code Commission to those adopted by the Fifty-Third
Legislature, 2012 Second Regular Session in its amendments
t059 0.S. 2011, 8§1000.25, effective November 1, 2012.
AUTHORITY:

This emergency rule is being promulgated under the
authority of 59 O.S. § 1000.24 and 1000.28.

COMMENT PERIOD:

Written and oral comments will be accepted during regular
business hours beginning August 16, 2012 and will be accepted
through September 14, 2012, at the offices of the Uniform
Building Code Commission. Written comments may be hand
delivered to the Commission at 2401 NW 23rd, Suite 2-F,
Oklahoma City, OK 73107 or may be mailed to the following

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)



Notices of Rulemaking Intent

address: Uniform Building Code Commission, P.O. Box
700007, Oklahoma City, OK 73107.
PUBLIC HEARING:

A public hearing on this proposed emergency rule will be
held at 1:30 p.m. on September 18, 2012, at a regular meeting
of the Uniform Building Code Commission at 2401 NW 23rd,
Suite 2-F. Anyone who wishes to speak during the public
hearing must sign in at the door by 1:35 p.m.

REQUESTS FOR COMMENTS FROM BUSINESS
ENTITIES:

The Uniform Building Code Commission requests that
business entities affected by this proposed emergency rule
provide the Uniform Building Code Commission, within
the comment period set forth and described above, in dollar
amounts if possible, the increase or decrease in the level of
direct costs, such as administrative fees, and the indirect costs
such as report, recordkeeping, equipment, construction, labor,
professional services, revenue loss, or other costs that the
business entity expects to be incurred due to compliance with
the proposed emergency rule. Business entities may submit

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)

1787

this information in writing to Kathy Hehnly at the above
mailing address, before the close of the comment period on
September 14, 2012.

COPIES OF PROPOSED RULES:

Copies of the proposed emergency rule may be obtained
from the Uniform Building Code Commission at, 2401 NW
23rd, Suite 2-F, Oklahoma City, OK 73107, before the close
of the comment period on September 14, 2012. The proposed
emergency rule can be found on the Uniform Building Code
Commission website at: www.ok.gov/oubcc.

RULE IMPACT STATEMENT:

Pursuant to 75 O.S. § 303 (D), a rule impact statement
has been prepared, and may be obtained from the Uniform
Building Code Commission at the above physical address.
CONTACT PERSONS:

Billy Pope, Chief Executive Officer 405.521.6501

Kathy Hehnly, Commission Secretary 405.521-6501

[OAR Docket #12-841; filed 7-18-12]

August 15, 2012



Emergency Adoptions

An agency may adopt new rules, or amendments to or revocations of existing rules, on an emergency basis if the agency
determines that "an imminent peril exists to the preservation of the public health, safety, or welfare, or that a compelling public interest
requires an emergency rule[s]. . . . [Aln agency may promulgate, at any time, any such [emergency] rule[s], provided the Governor

first approves such rule[s]" [75 O.S., Section 253(A)].

An emergency action is effective immediately upon approval by the Governor or on a later date specified by the agency in the
preamble of the emergency rule document. An emergency rule expires on July 15 after the next regular legislative session following
promulgation, or on an earlier date specified by the agency, if not already superseded by a permanent rule or terminated through

legislative action as described in 75 O.S., Section 253(H)(2).

Emergency rules are not published in the Oklahoma Administrative Code; however, a source note entry, which references
the Register publication of the emergency action, is added to the Code upon promulgation of a superseding permanent rule or

expiration/termination of the emergency action.

For additional information on the emergency rulemaking process, see 75 O.S., Section 253.

TITLE317. OKLAHOMAHEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY
CHAPTER 30. MEDICAL PROVIDERS-FEE
FOR SERVICE

[OAR Docket #12-846]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

EMERGENCY adoption
RULES:

Subchapter 5. Individual Providers and Specialties

Part 51. Habilitation Services

317:30-5-482. [AMENDED]

(Reference APA WF # 12-01A)

AUTHORITY:

The Oklahoma Health Care Authority Board; The Oklahoma Health
Care Authority Act, Section 5003 through 5016 of Title 63 of Oklahoma
Statutes; Section 1915(C) of the Social Security Act pertaining to Home and
Community Based Services waivers as approved by the Centers for Medicare
and Medicaid Services; Homeward Bound, Inc., et al., v. Okla. Health Care
Auth., etal., Doc. 1523, No. 85-CV-437 (N.D. Okla. Apr. 30,2012).
DATES:

Adoption:

June 14th, 2012
Approved by Governor:

July 20, 2012
Effective:

Immediately upon Governor's approval
Expiration:

Effective through July 14, 2013, unless superseded by another rule or
disapproved by the Legislature
SUPERSEDED EMERGENCY ACTIONS:

N/A
INCORPORATIONS BY REFERENCE:

N/A
FINDING OF EMERGENCY:

The Agency finds that a compelling public interest exists which
necessitates promulgation of emergency rules and requests emergency
approval of rules as the result of a lawsuit filed on behalf of class members
of the Homeward Bound waiver. The rule revision will allow a Habilitation
Training Specialist (HTS) to provide more than 40 hours of service per week,
when the HTS resides in the same home as the member. As the lawsuit
mandates this change, OHCA has determined that emergency rule changes are
required.

ANALYSIS:

OHCA rules for the Homeward Bound Waiver are revised to provide an
exception for members of the Homeward Bound Waiver receiving Habilitation
Training Specialist (HTS) services. The rule revision will allow the HTS to
provide more than 40 hours of service per week, when the HTS resides in the
same home as the member. The rule revision is promulgated as the result of a
lawsuit filed on behalf of class members of the Homeward Bound waiver.
CONTACT PERSON:

Tywanda Cox at (405)522-7153

August 15, 2012

1788

PURSUANT TO THE ACTIONS DESCRIBED HEREIN,
THE FOLLOWING EMERGENCY RULES ARE
CONSIDERED PROMULGATED AND EFFECTIVE
UPON APPROVAL BY THE GOVERNOR AS SET
FORTHIN750.S.,SECTION 253(D):

SUBCHAPTERS. INDIVIDUAL PROVIDERS
AND SPECIALTIES

PART 51. HABILITATION SERVICES

317:30-5-482.  Description of services
Habilitation services include the services identified in
(1) through (15). Providers of any habilitation service must
have an applicable agreement with the Oklahoma Health Care
Authority (OHCA) to provide Developmental Disabilities Ser-
vices Division (DDSD) Home and Community Based Services
(HCBS).
(1) Dental services. Dental services are provided per
OAC 317:40-5-112.
(A) Minimum qualifications. Providers of dental
services must have non-restrictive licensure to prac-
tice dentistry in Oklahoma by the Board of Governors
of Registered Dentists of Oklahoma.
(B) Description of services. Dental services in-
clude services for maintenance or improvement of
dental health as well as relief of pain and infection.
These services may include:
(i) oral examination;
(i) bite-wing x-rays;
(iii)  prophylaxis;
(iv)  topical fluoride treatment;
(v) development of a sequenced treatment plan
that prioritizes:
) elimination of pain;
(m adequate oral hygiene; and
(1) restoration or improved ability to
chew;
(vi)  routine training of member or primary
caregiver regarding oral hygiene; and
(vii)  preventive restorative, replacement and re-
pair services to achieve or restore functionality are

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)



Emergency Adoptions

)

provided after appropriate review if applicable per

OAC 317:40-5-112.
(C) Coverage limitations. Coverage of dental ser-
vices is specified in the member’s Individual Plan (IP),
in accordance with applicable Waiver limits. Dental
services are not authorized when recommended for
cosmetic purposes.

Nutrition services. Nutrition Services are pro-

vided per OAC 317:40-5-102.

®3)

(4)

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)

Occupational therapy services.
(A)  Minimum qualifications. Occupational ther-
apists and occupational therapy assistants must have
current non-restrictive licensure by the Oklahoma
State Board of Medical Licensure and Supervision.
Occupational therapy assistants must be employed by
the occupational therapist.
(B) Description of services. Occupational therapy
services include evaluation, treatment, and consul-
tation in leisure management, daily living skills,
sensory motor, perceptual motor, and mealtime as-
sistance. Occupational therapy services may include
the use of occupational therapy assistants, within the
limits of their practice.
(i) Services are:
()] intended to help the member achieve
greater independence to reside and participate
in the community; and
(m rendered in any community setting as
specified in the member's IP. The IP must in-
clude a practitioner's prescription.
(i)  For purposes of this Section, a practitioner
is defined as all medical and osteopathic physi-
cians, physician assistants and other licensed
professionals with prescriptive authority to order
occupational therapy services in accordance with
the rules and regulations governing the Sooner-
Care program.
(ili)  The provision of services includes written
report or record documentation in the member's
record, as required.
(C) Coverage limitations. Payment is made for
compensable services to the individual occupational
therapist for direct services or for services provided
by a qualified occupational therapist assistant within
their employment. Payment is made in 15-minute
units, with a limit of 480 units per Plan of Care year.
Payment is not allowed solely for written reports or
record documentation.
Physical therapy services.
(A) Minimum qualifications. Physical therapists
and physical therapist assistants must have a current
non-restrictive licensure with the Oklahoma State
Board of Medical Licensure and Supervision. The
physical therapist assistant must be employed by the
physical therapist.
(B) Description of services. Physical therapy ser-
vices include evaluation, treatment, and consultation
in locomotion or mobility and skeletal and muscular

1789

(5)

conditioning to maximize the member's mobility
and skeletal/muscular well-being. Physical therapy
services may include the use of physical therapist
assistants, within the limits of their practice.

0] Services are intended to help the mem-
ber achieve greater independence to reside and
participate in the community. Services are pro-
vided in any community setting as specified in the
member's IP. The IP must include a practitioner's
prescription.

(i) For purposes of this Section, a practitioner

is defined as all licensed medical and osteopathic

physicians, and physician assistants in accor-
dance with the rules and regulations covering the

OHCA's SoonerCare program.

(ili)  The provision of services includes written

report or record documentation in the member's

record, as required.

(C) Coverage limitations. Payment is made for
compensable services to individual physical thera-
pists for direct services or for services provided by a
qualified physical therapist assistant within their em-
ployment. Payment is made in 15-minute units with
a limit of 480 units per Plan of Care year. Payment
is not allowed solely for written reports or record
documentation.

Psychological services.

(A) Minimum qualifications. Qualification as a
provider of psychological services requires non-re-
strictive licensure as a psychologist by the Oklahoma
Psychologist Board of Examiners, or licensing board
in the state in which service is provided.

(B) Description of services. Psychological ser-
vices include evaluation, psychotherapy, consulta-
tion, and behavioral treatment. Service is provided in
any community setting as specified in the member's
IP.

0] Services are:

()] intended to maximize a member's psy-
chological and behavioral well-being; and

(m provided in individual and group, six
person maximum, formats.

(i) A minimum of 15 minutes for each indi-

vidual encounter and 15 minutes for each group

encounter and record documentation of each treat-
ment session is included and required.
(C) Coverage limitations.

(i Limitations for psychological services are:
()] Description: Psychotherapy services
and behavior treatment services (individual):
Unit: 15 minutes; and
()] Description: Cognitive/behavioral
treatment (group): Unit: 15 minutes.

(i) Psychological services are authorized for a

period not to exceed six months.

M Initial authorization is through the
Developmental Disabilities Services Divi-
sion (DDSD) case manager, with review and

August 15, 2012



Emergency Adoptions

(6)

August 15, 2012

approval by the DDSD case management su-
pervisor.
(m Initial authorization must not exceed
192 units (48 hours of service).
N Monthly progress notes must include a
statement of hours and type of service provided,
and an empirical measure of member status as it
relates to each objective in the member's IP.
(IV)  If progress notes are not submitted to
the DDSD case manager for each month of ser-
vice provision, authorization for payment must
be withdrawn until such time as progress notes
are completed.
(iii)  Treatment extensions may be authorized
by the DDSD area manager based upon evidence
of continued need and effectiveness of treatment.
()] Evidence of continued need of treat-
ment, treatment effectiveness, or both, is sub-
mitted by the provider to the DDSD case man-
ager and must include, at a minimum, comple-
tion of the Service Utilization and Evaluation
protocol.
(m When revising a protective interven-
tion plan (PIP) to accommodate recommen-
dations of a required committee review or an
Oklahoma Department of Human Services
(OKDHS) audit, the provider may bill for only
one revision. The time for preparing the revi-
sion must be clearly documented and must not
exceed four hours.
(1) Treatment extensions must not exceed
24 hours (96 units) of service per request.
(iv)  The provider must develop, implement,
evaluate, and revise the PIP corresponding to the
relevant goals and objectives identified in the
member's IP.
(V) No more than 12 hours (48 units) may be
billed for the preparation of a PIP. Any clinical
document must be prepared within 45 days of the
request. Further, if the document is not prepared,
payments are suspended until the requested docu-
ment is provided.
(vi)  Psychological technicians may provide
up to 140 billable hours (560 units) of service per
month to members.
(vii)  The psychologist must maintain a record
of all billable services provided by a psychological
technician.
Psychiatric services.
(A)  Minimum qualifications. Qualification as
a provider of psychiatric services requires a non-re-
strictive license to practice medicine in Oklahoma.
Certification by the Board of Psychiatry and Neu-
rology or satisfactory completion of an approved
residency program in psychiatry is required.
(B) Description of services. Psychiatric ser-
vices include outpatient evaluation, psychotherapy,
and medication and prescription management and

1790

)

(®)

consultation provided to members who are eligible.
Services are provided in any community setting as
specified in the member's IP.
(i) Services are intended to contribute to the
member's psychological well-being.
(i) A minimum of 30 minutes for encounter
and record documentation is required.
(C) Coverage limitations. A unit is 30 minutes,
with a limit of 200 units per Plan of Care year.
Speech/language services.
(A) Minimum qualifications. Qualification as a
provider of speech/language services requires non-re-
strictive licensure as a speech/language pathologist by
the State Board of Examiners for Speech Pathology
and Audiology.
(B) Description of services. Speech therapy in-
cludes evaluation, treatment, and consultation in
communication and oral motor/feeding activities
provided to members who are eligible. Services are
intended to maximize the member's community living
skills and may be provided in any community setting
as specified in the member's IP. The IP must include a
practitioner's prescription.
(i) For purposes of this Section, a practitioner
is defined as all licensed medical and osteopathic
physicians, and physician assistants and other li-
censed professionals with prescriptive authority
to order speech/language services in accordance
with rules and regulations covering the OHCA's
SoonerCare program.
(i) A minimum of 15 minutes for encounter
and record documentation is required.
(C) Coverage limitations. A unit is 15 minutes,
with a limit of 288 units per Plan of Care year.
Habilitation training specialist (HTS) services.
(A) Minimum qualifications. Providers must
complete the OKDHS DDSD sanctioned training
curriculum. Residential habilitation providers:
0] are at least 18 years of age;
(i) are specifically trained to meet the unique
needs of members;
(iii)  have not been convicted of, pled guilty, or
pled nolo contendere to misdemeanor assault and
battery or a felony per Section 1025.2 of Title 56 of
the Oklahoma Statutes (56 O.S. ' 1025.2), unless a
waiver is granted per 56 O.S. ' 1025.2; and
(iv)  receive supervision and oversight from a
contracted agency staff with a minimum of four
years of any combination of college level educa-
tion or full-time equivalent experience in serving
persons with disabilities.
(B) Description of services. HTS services include
services to support the member's self-care, daily liv-
ing, and adaptive and leisure skills needed to reside
successfully in the community. Services are pro-
vided in community-based settings in a manner that
contributes to the member's independence, self-suffi-
ciency, community inclusion, and well-being.

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)



Emergency Adoptions

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)

0] Payment will not be made for:
()] routine care and supervision that is nor-
mally provided by family; or
(m services furnished to a member by
a person who is legally responsible per OAC
340:100-3-33.2.
(i) ~ Family members who provide HTS ser-
vices must meet the same standards as providers
who are unrelated to the member. HTS staff re-
siding in the same household as the member may
not provide services in excess of 40 hours per
week. Members who require more than 40 hours
per week of HTS must use staff members who do
not reside in the household and are employed by
the member's chosen provider agency to deliver
the balance of any necessary support staff hours.
Exceptions may be authorized when needed for
members who receive services through the Home-
ward Bound Waiver.
(iii)  Payment does not include room and board
or maintenance, upkeep, and improvement of the
member's or family's residence.
(iv)  For members who also receive intensive
personal supports (IPS), the member's IP must
clearly specify the role of the HTS and person
providing IPS to ensure there is no duplication of
services.
(v) DDSD case management supervisor re-
view and approval is required.
(vi)  Pre-authorized HTS services accomplish
the same objectives as other HTS services, but
are limited to situations where the HTS provider
is unable to obtain required professional and ad-
ministrative oversight from an oversight agency
approved by the OHCA. For pre-authorized HTS
services, the service:
()] provider will receive oversight from
DDSD area staff; and
(m must be pre-approved by the DDSD di-
rector or designee.
(C) Coverage limitations. HTS services are au-
thorized as specified in OAC 317:40-5-110, 317:40-5-
111, and 317:40-7-13, and OAC 340:100-3-33.1.
(i) A unitis 15 minutes.
(i) Individual HTS services providers will
be limited to a maximum of 40 hours per week
regardless of the number of members served.
(iili) ~ More than one HTS may provide care to a
member on the same day.
(iv)  Payment cannot be made for services pro-
vided by two or more HTSs to the same member
during the same hours of a day.
(v) A HTS may receive reimbursement for
providing services to only one member at any
given time. This does not preclude services from
being provided in a group setting where services
are shared among members of the group.

1791

(vi)  HTS providers may not perform any job
duties associated with other employment including
on call duties, at the same time they are providing
HTS services.
(9)  Self Directed HTS (SD HTS). SD HTS are pro-
vided per 317:40-9-1.
(10) Self Directed Goods and Services (SD GS). SD
GS are provided per 317:40-9-1.
(11) Audiology services.
(A) Minimum qualifications. Audiologists must
have licensure as an audiologist by the State Board of
Examiners for Speech Pathology and Audiology.
(B) Description of services. Audiology services
include individual evaluation, treatment, and con-
sultation in hearing to members who are eligible.
Services are intended to maximize the member's
auditory receptive abilities. The member's IP must
include a practitioner's prescription.
() For purposes of this Section, a practitioner
is defined as all licensed medical and osteopathic
physicians, and physician assistants in accordance
with rules and regulations covering the OHCA's
SoonerCare program.
(i) A minimum of 15 minutes for encounter
and record documentation is required.
(C) Coverage limitations. Audiology services are
provided in accordance with the member's IP.
(12) Prevocational services.
(A)  Minimum qualifications. Prevocational ser-
vices providers:
0] are at least 18 years of age;
(i)  complete the OKDHS DDSD sanctioned
training curriculum;
(iii)  have not been convicted of, pled guilty, or
pled nolo contendere to misdemeanor assault and
battery or a felony per 56 O.S. ‘8 1025.2, unless a
waiver is granted per 56 O.S.-§ 1025.2; and
(iv)  receive supervision and oversight by a per-
son with a minimum of four years of any combina-
tion of college level education or full-time equiva-
lent experience in serving persons with disabilities.
(B) Description of services. Prevocational ser-
vices are not available to persons who can be served
under a program funded per Section 110 of the Re-
habilitation Act of 1973 or Section 602(16) and (17)
of the Individuals with Disabilities Education Act
(IDEA). Services are aimed at preparing a member
for employment, but are not job-task oriented. Ser-
vices include teaching concepts, such as compliance,
attendance, task completion, problem solving, and
safety.
0] Prevocational services are provided to
members who are not expected to:
()] join the general work force; or
(m participate in a transitional sheltered
workshop within one year, excluding supported
employment programs.

August 15, 2012



Emergency Adoptions

August 15, 2012

(i) When compensated, members are paid at
less than 50 percent of the minimum wage. Ac-
tivities included in this service are not primarily
directed at teaching specific job skills, but at un-
derlying habilitative goals, such as attention span
and motor skills.
(iii)  All prevocational services will be reflected
in the member's IP as habilitative, rather than ex-
plicit employment objectives.
(iv)  Documentation must be maintained in
the record of each member receiving this service
noting that the service is not otherwise available
through a program funded under the Rehabilitation
Actof 1973 or IDEA.
(V) Services include:
()] center-based prevocational services as
specified in OAC 317:40-7-6;
) community-based prevocational ser-
vices as specified in OAC 317:40-7-5;
(1) enhanced community-based  pre-
vocational services as specified in OAC
317:40-7-12; and
(IV)  supplemental supports as specified in
OAC 317:40-7-13.
(C) Coverage limitations. A unit of center-based
or community-based prevocational services is one
hour and payment is based upon the number of hours
the member participates in the service. All prevoca-
tional services and supported employment services
combined may not exceed $25,000 per Plan of Care
year. The following services may not be provided to
the same member at the same time as prevocational
services:
Q) HTS;
(i) Intensive Personal Supports;
(iii)  Adult Day Services;
(iv)  Daily Living Supports;
(v) Homemaker; or
(vi)  therapy services such as occupational
therapy, physical therapy, nutrition, speech, psy-
chological services, family counseling, or family
training except to allow the therapist to assess the
individual's needs at the workplace or to provide
staff training and as allowed per 317:40-7-6.

(13) Supported employment.

(A) Minimum qualifications. Supported employ-
ment providers:
Q) are at least 18 years of age;
(i) complete the OKDHS DDSD sanctioned
training curriculum;
(iii)  have not been convicted of, pled guilty, or
pled nolo contendere to misdemeanor assault and
battery or a felony per 56 O.S. ‘8 1025.2, unless a
waiver is granted per 56 O.S. '8 1025.2; and
(iv)  receive supervision and oversight by a per-
son with a minimum of four years of any combina-
tion of college level education or full-time equiva-
lent experience in serving persons with disabilities.

1792

(B) Description of services. Supported employ-
ment is conducted in a variety of settings, particularly
work sites in which persons without disabilities are
employed, and includes activities that are outcome
based and needed to sustain paid work by members
receiving services through HCBS Waiver, including
supervision and training.
(M When supported employment services are
provided at a work site in which persons without
disabilities are employed, payment:
) is made for the adaptations, supervi-
sion, and training required by members as a
result of their disabilities; and
(1 does not include payment for the super-
visory activities rendered as a normal part of the
business setting.
(i) Services include:
()] job coaching as specified in OAC
317:40-7-7,
() enhanced job coaching as specified in
OAC 317:40-7-12;
(1) employment training specialist ser-
vices as specified in OAC 317:40-7-8; and
(IV)  stabilization as specified in OAC
317:40-7-11.
(iii)  Supported employment services furnished
under HCBS Waiver are not available under a pro-
gram funded by the Rehabilitation Act of 1973 or
IDEA.
(iv)  Documentation that the service is not oth-
erwise available under a program funded by the
Rehabilitation Act of 1973 or IDEA must be main-
tained in the record of each member receiving this
service.
(v) Federal financial participation (FFP) may
not be claimed for incentive payment subsidies or
unrelated vocational training expenses, such as:
n incentive payments made to an em-
ployer to encourage or subsidize the employer's
participation in a supported employment pro-
gram;
() payments that are passed through to
users of supported employment programs; or
(1) payments for vocational training that
are not directly related to a member's supported
employment program.
(C) Coverage limitations. A unit is 15 min-
utes and payment is made in accordance with OAC
317:40-7-1 through 317:40-7-21. All prevocational
services and supported employment services com-
bined cannot exceed $25,000 per Plan of Care year.
The DDSD case manager assists the member to iden-
tify other alternatives to meet identified needs above
the limit. The following services may not be provided
to the same member at the same time as supported
employment services:
(i) HTS;
(i) Intensive Personal Supports;

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)



Emergency Adoptions

(iii)  Adult Day Services;
(iv)  Daily Living Supports;
(V) Homemaker; or
(vi)  Therapy services such as occupational
therapy, physical therapy, nutrition, speech, psy-
chological services, family counseling, or family
training except to allow the therapist to assess the
individual's needs at the workplace or to provide
staff training.
(14) Intensive personal supports (IPS).
(A)  Minimum qualifications. IPS provider agen-
cies must have a current provider agreement with
OHCA and OKDHS DDSD. Providers:
0] are at least 18 years of age;
(i) complete the OKDHS DDSD sanctioned
training curriculum;
(ili)  have not been convicted of, pled guilty, or
pled nolo contendere to misdemeanor assault and
battery or a felony per 56 O.S. ‘§ 1025.2, unless a
waiver is granted per 56 O.S. '§ 1025.2;
(iv)  receive supervision and oversight by a per-
son with a minimum of four years of any combina-
tion of college level education or full-time equiva-
lent experience in serving persons with disabilities;
and
(V) receive oversight regarding specific meth-
ods to be used with the member to meet the mem-
ber's complex behavioral or health support needs.
(B) Description of services.
Q) IPS:
()] are support services provided to mem-
bers who need an enhanced level of direct
support in order to successfully reside in a com-
munity-based setting; and
(1 build upon the level of support pro-
vided by a HTS or daily living supports (DLS)
staff by utilizing a second staff person on duty
to provide assistance and training in self-care,
daily living, recreational, and habilitation activ-
ities.
(i) The member's IP must clearly specify the
role of HTS and the person providing IPS to ensure
there is no duplication of services.
(iiiy) DDSD case management supervisor re-
view and approval is required.
(C) Coverage limitations. IPS are limited to 24
hours per day and must be included in the member's
IP per OAC 317:40-5-151 and 317:40-5-153.
(15) Adult day services.
(A)  Minimum qualifications. Adult day services
provider agencies must:
0] meet the licensing requirements set forth
in 63 O.S. -8 1-873 et seq. and comply with OAC
310:605; and
(i) be approved by the OKDHS DDSD and
have a valid OHCA contract for adult day services.

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)

1793

(B) Description of services. Adult day services
provide assistance with the retention or improve-
ment of self-help, adaptive, and socialization skills,
including the opportunity to interact with peers in or-
der to promote maximum level of independence and
function. Services are provided in a non-residential
setting separate from the home or facility where the
member resides.

(C) Coverage limitations. Adult day services are
typically furnished four or more hours per day on a
regularly scheduled basis, for one or more days per
week. A unit is 15 minutes for up to a maximum of
six hours daily, at which point a unit is one day. All
services must be authorized in the member's IP.

[OAR Docket #12-846; filed 7-26-12]

TITLE 317. OKLAHOMA HEALTH CARE
AUTHORITY
CHAPTER 40. DEVELOPMENTAL
DISABILITIES SERVICES

[OAR Docket #12-847]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

EMERGENCY adoption
RULES:

Subchapter 5. Member Services

Part9. Service Provisions

317:40-5-110. [AMENDED]

(Reference APA WF # 12-01B)

AUTHORITY:

The Oklahoma Health Care Authority Board; The Oklahoma Health
Care Authority Act, Section 5003 through 5016 of Title 63 of Oklahoma
Statutes; Section 1915(C) of the Social Security Act pertaining to Home and
Community Based Services waivers as approved by the Centers for Medicare
and Medicaid Services; Homeward Bound, Inc., et al., v. Okla. Health Care
Auth., etal., Doc. 1523, No. 85-CV-437 (N.D. Okla. Apr. 30, 2012).
DATES:

Adoption:

June 14th, 2012
Approved by Governor:

July 20, 2012
Effective:

Immediately upon Governor's approval
Expiration:

Effective through July 14, 2013, unless superseded by another rule or
disapproved by the Legislature
SUPERSEDED EMERGENCY ACTIONS:

N/A
INCORPORATIONS BY REFERENCE:

N/A
FINDING OF EMERGENCY:

The Agency finds that a compelling public interest exists which
necessitates promulgation of emergency rules and requests emergency
approval of rules as the result of a lawsuit filed on behalf of class members
of the Homeward Bound waiver. The rule revision will allow a Habilitation
Training Specialist (HTS) to provide more than 40 hours of service per week,
when the HTS resides in the same home as the member. As the lawsuit
mandates this change, OHCA has determined that emergency rule changes are
required.

ANALYSIS:

OHCA rules for the Homeward Bound Waiver are revised to provide an
exception for members of the Homeward Bound Waiver receiving Habilitation
Training Specialist (HTS) services. The rule revision will allow the HTS to
provide more than 40 hours of service per week, when the HTS resides in the

August 15, 2012



Emergency Adoptions

same home as the member. The rule revision is promulgated as the result of a
lawsuit filed on behalf of class members of the Homeward Bound waiver.
CONTACT PERSON:

Tywanda Cox at (405)522-7153

PURSUANT TO THE ACTIONS DESCRIBED HEREIN,
THE FOLLOWING EMERGENCY RULES ARE
CONSIDERED PROMULGATED AND EFFECTIVE
UPON APPROVAL BY THE GOVERNOR AS SET
FORTHIN750.S.,SECTION 253(D):

SUBCHAPTER 5. MEMBER SERVICES

PART 9. SERVICE PROVISIONS

317:40-5-110.  Authorization for Habilitation Training
Specialist Services
(@) Habilitation Training Specialist (HTS) Services are:
(1) authorized as aresult of needs identified by the team
and informed selection by the SoonerCare member;
(2)  shared among SoonerCare members who are mem-
bers of the same household or being served in the same
community location;
(3) authorized only during periods when staff are en-
gaged in purposeful activity which directly or indirectly
benefits the service recipient. Staff must be physically
able and mentally alert to carry out the duties of the job.
At no time are HTS services authorized for periods during
which the staff are allowed to sleep;
(4) not authorized to be provided in the home of the
HTS unless the SoonerCare member and HTS reside in the
same home; and
(5) directed toward the development or maintenance
of a skill in order to achieve a specifically stated outcome.
The service provided is not a function which the parent
would provide for the individual without charge as a mat-
ter of course in the relationship among members of the
nuclear family when the member resides in a family home.
(b) HTS Services may be provided in a group home as
defined in 317:40-5-152 or community residential service
settings defined in OAC 340:100-5-22.1 including:
(1) agency companion services as described in OAC
317:40-5-1 through 40-5-39;
(2) as provided in accordance with Daily Living Sup-
ports policy at OAC 317:40-5-150; and,
(3) as provided in accordance with Specialized Foster
Care Policy at OAC 317:40-5-50 through 40-5-76; or
(4)  services for people with Prader Willi syndrome.
(c) HTS Services are based on need and limited to no more
than 12 hours per day per household in any setting other than
settings described in OAC 340:100-5-22.1, Community Res-
idential Supports, except with approval in accordance with
OAC 340:100-3-33, Service authorization, that the increased
services are necessary to avoid institutional placement due to:
(1) the complexity of the family or caregiver support
needs. Consideration must be given to:

August 15, 2012

1794

(A) the age and health of the caregiver;
(B) the number of household members requiring
the caregiver's time; and
(C) the accessibility of needed resources; and
(2)  the resources of the family, caregiver, or household
members that are available to the service recipient. Con-
sideration must be given to the number of family members
able to assist the caregiver and available community sup-
ports; and
(3) the resources of other agencies or programs avail-
able to the SoonerCare member or family. Consideration
must be given to services available from:
(A) the public schools;
(B) the Oklahoma Health Care Authority;
(C) the Oklahoma Department of Rehabilitative
Services;
(D) other OKDHS programs; and
(E) services provided by other local, state, or fed-
eral resources.
(d) When it appears that approval of an exception is needed
to prevent institutional placement, the case manager submits
the request which identifies the circumstances supporting the
need for an exception to the area manager.
(e) The DDSD area manager or designee must approve,
deny, or notify the case manager of issues preventing approval
within 10 working days.
(f)  HTS providers may not perform any job duties associ-
ated with other employment, including on call duties, at the
same time they are providing HTS services.
(g) HTS services are limited to no more than 40 hours per
week when the HTS resides in the same home as the service
recipient. If additional hours of service are needed, they must
be provided by someone living outside the home. Exceptions
may be authorized when needed for members who receive
services through the Homeward Bound Waiver.
(h)  When the member is out of the home for school, work,
adult day services or other non-HTS supported activities, the
total number of hours of HTS and hours away from the home
cannot exceed 12 hours per day unless an exception is granted
in accordance with subsection c¢ of this policy.
(i)  Inaccordance with OAC 340:100-3-33.1, services must
be provided in the most cost effective manner. When the need
for HTS services is expected to continue to exceed 9 hours
daily, cost effective community residential services must be
considered and requested in accordance with OAC 317:40-1-2.
For adults, continuation of non-residential services in excess of
9 hours per day for more than one plan of care year will not be
authorized except:
(1) when needed for members who receive services
through the Homeward Bound Waiver;
(2)  when determined by the division administrator or
designee to be the most cost effective option; or
(3) as atransition period of 120 days or less to allow
for identification of and transition to a cost effective res-
idential option. Members who do not wish to receive

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)



Emergency Adoptions

residential services will be assisted to identify options that
meet their needs within an average of 9 hours daily.

[OAR Docket #12-847; filed 7-26-12]

TITLE 340. DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN
SERVICES
CHAPTER 2. ADMINISTRATIVE
COMPONENTS

[OAR Docket #12-840]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

EMERGENCY adoption
RULES:

Subchapter 1. Human Resources Management Division (HRMD)

Part 5. Administrative Procedures

340:2-1-57 [REVOKED]

(Reference APA WF 12-04)

AUTHORITY:

Commission for Human Services, Article XXV, Sections 2 and 4 of the
Oklahoma Constitution; and the Governor's Executive Order number 2012-10,
signed February 6, 2012.

DATES:
Adoption:

June 12, 2012
Approved by Governor:

June 28, 2012
Effective:

July 1, 2012 or upon Governor's approval, whichever is later.

Expiration:

Effective through July 14, 2013, unless superseded by another rule or
disapproved by the Legislature.
SUPERSEDED EMERGENCY ACTIONS:

nla
INCORPORATIONS BY REFERENCE:

nla
FINDING OF EMERGENCY:

Emergency rulemaking approval is requested to comply with the
Governor's Executive Order number 2012-01, signed February 6, 2012.
ANALYSIS:

The proposed revision to Subchapter 1 of Chapter 2 revokes OAC
340:2-1-57 as it does not comply with the Governor's Executive Order number
2012-01, signed February 6, 2012.

CONTACT PERSON:
Dena Thayer at (405)521-4326

PURSUANT TO THE ACTIONS DESCRIBED HEREIN,
THE FOLLOWING EMERGENCY RULES ARE
CONSIDERED PROMULGATED AND EFFECTIVE
JULY 1, 2012 OR UPON APPROVAL BY THE
GOVERNOR, WHICHEVER ISLATER,ASSET FORTH
IN750.S.,SECTION 253(D):

SUBCHAPTER 1. HUMAN RESOURCES
MANAGEMENT DIVISION (HRMD)

PART 5. ADMINISTRATIVE PROCEDURES

340:2-1-57.

Tobacco policy [REVOKED]

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)

1795

[OAR Docket #12-840; filed 7-16-12]

TITLE595. DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC
SAFETY
CHAPTER 10. CLASS D DRIVER LICENSES
AND IDENTIFICATION CARDS AND
MOTOR LICENSE AGENT PROCEDURES

[OAR Docket #12-838]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

EMERGENCY adoption
PROPOSED RULES:

Subchapter 5. Medical Aspects

Part 1. Medical Conditions

595:10-5-5. Metabolic diseases [AMENDED]

AUTHORITY:

Commissioner of Public Safety; 47 O.S. § 6-101 et seq.

DATES:
Adoption:

June 1, 2012
Approved by Governor:

June 28, 2012
Effective:

Immediately upon Governor's approval.

Expiration:

Effective through July 14, 2013, unless superseded by another rule or
disapproved by the Legislature.
SUPERSEDED EMERGENCY ACTIONS:

n/a
INCORPORATIONS BY REFERENCE:

n/a
FINDING OF EMERGENCY:

The circumstance which created the need for this rule was the filing of an
EEOC complaint by an Oklahoma commercial driver license holder because
a school district fired the license holder from a bus driver position because
the license holder has controlled insulin-dependent diabetes. The EEOC
complaint named both the State Department of Education and the Department
of Public Safety, and a decision in the EEOC complaint was made in favor
of the license holder. The State Department of Education has amended its
corresponding rule in OAC 210:30-5-1 [see attached].

August 15, 2012



Emergency Adoptions

ANALYSIS:

Amendments to this chapter would provide procedures for determining if a
person with controlled insulin-dependent diabetes may be issued a commercial
driver license.

The proposed actions is to amend existing rule.

The circumstance which created the need for this rule was the EEOC case
decision as described in the "Finding of Emergency" above.

The intended effect of these rules is to allow the Department of Public
Safety to perform its duties as required or authorized by state law and federal
law and regulation without discriminating against any person based upon a
specific medical disability.

CONTACT PERSON:

David W. Beatty, Administrative Rules, Department of Public Safety, 3600
N. M.L. King Ave., P.O. Box 11415, Oklahoma City, OK 73136-0415. Phone:
(405) 425-2024. Fax: (405)419-2043. E-mail: dbeatty@dps.state.ok.us

PURSUANT TO THE ACTIONS DESCRIBED HEREIN,
THE FOLLOWING EMERGENCY RULES ARE
CONSIDERED PROMULGATED AND EFFECTIVE
UPON APPROVAL BY THE GOVERNOR, AS SET
FORTH IN750.S. § 253(D):

SUBCHAPTERS5. MEDICAL ASPECTS
PART 1. MEDICAL CONDITIONS

595:10-5-5. Metabolic diseases

(@) Diabetes mellitus.
(1) A person who has diabetes, about whom the De-
partment has received a report from a law enforcement
officer or from a licensed physician indicating the person
is incapable of properly controlling a motor vehicle, must
submit proof from his or her physician that the disease is
under reasonable control without either hypoglycemic or
hyperglycemic reactions severe enough to impair driving
ability. Future periodic medical reports may be required.
(2) A person having been diagnosed by his or her
physician as having insulin-dependent diabetes shall be
required to have driving restriction code number six (6),
"Food, fruit, or candy within reach of driver,” on the per-
son's driver license.
(3) A person who is a controlled insulin-dependent di-
abetic may obtain a Class A, B, or C intrastate commercial
driver license provided the license bears driving restriction
code number six (6), "Food, fruit, or candy within reach
of driver;” and-drivingrestriction-code-number-eight(8);

hicl !

M‘m‘ - . i j .
(4) The Department may adopt by reference and en-
force all or any portion of the federal motor carrier safety
regulations set forth under 49 C.E.R., Section 391.41, re-
lating to medical conditions which preclude the safe oper-
ation of a commercial motor vehicle.
(5)  The provisions in this section may be subject to the
limitations imposed by 49 C.F.R., Section 391.64, which
grandfathers certain drivers allowing the operation of a
school bus or commercial motor vehicle by insulin-con-
trolled diabetic drivers provided that:

August 15, 2012

1796

(A) The driver is physically examined every year,
including an examination by a board- certified/eligi-
ble endocrinologist attesting to the fact that the driver
is:
(i) Otherwise gualified under Section 391.41;
(ii)  Free of insulin reactions (an individual is
free of insulin reactions if that individual does not
have severe hypoglycemia or hypoglycemia un-
awareness, and has less than one documented,
symptomatic hypoglycemic reaction per month);
(iii)  Able to and has demonstrated willingness
to properly monitor and manage his/her diabetes;
and
(iv)  Not likely to suffer any diminution in driv-
ing ability due to his/her diabetic condition. [49
C.FR., 8391.64(a)(1)]
(B) The driver agrees to and complies with the fol-
lowing conditions:
() A source of rapidly absorbable glucose
shall be carried at all times while driving;
(ii)  Blood glucose levels shall be self-moni-
tored one (1) hour prior to driving and at least
once every four (4) hours while driving or on duty
prior to driving using a portable glucose monitor-
ing device equipped with a computerized memory;
(iii)  Submit blood glucose logs to the endocri-
nologist or medical examiner at the annual exam-
ination or when otherwise directed by the Depart-
ment;
(iv)  Provide a copy of the endocrinologist's re-
port to the medical examiner at the time of the an-
nual medical examination; and
(v)  Provide a copy of the annual medical cer-
tification to the Department and the employer for
retention in the driver's qualification file and re-
tain a copy of the certification on his/her person
while driving for presentation to a duly authorized
Federal, State or local enforcement official. [49
C.FR, 8 391.64(b)(2)]
(b) Hypoglycemia. A person with severe or uncontrolled
hypoglycemia (diagnosed low blood sugar) shall not be li-
censed until proof has been submitted from his or her physician
that the condition is under control by proper care and diet.

[OAR Docket #12-838; filed 7-12-12]

TITLES95. DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC
SAFETY
CHAPTER 70. SPECIAL
TRAFFIC-RELATED ENFORCEMENT
DESIGNATION

[OAR Docket #12-839]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
EMERGENCY adoption
PROPOSED RULES:
595:70-1-1. Purpose [NEW]
595:70-1-2. Definitions [NEW]

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)



Emergency Adoptions

595:70-1-3. Requesting an investigation [NEW]

595:70-1-4. Requirements of the request for investigation [NEW]

595:70-1-5. Conducting the investigation [NEW]

595:70-1-6. Cooperation in the investigation [NEW]

595:70-1-7. Reporting to the Attorney General and the Attorney General's

determination [NEW]

595:70-1-8. Duration of special traffic-related enforcement designation

[NEW]

595:70-1-9. Construction [NEW]
AUTHORITY:

Commissioner of Public Safety; 47 O.S. § 2-117
DATES:

Adoption:

June 12, 2012
Approved by Governor:

June 28, 2012
Effective:

Immediately upon Governor's approval.

Expiration:

Effective through July 14, 2013, unless superseded by another rule or
disapproved by the Legislature.
SUPERSEDED EMERGENCY ACTIONS:

n/a
INCORPORATIONS BY REFERENCE:

n/a
FINDING OF EMERGENCY:

Pursuant to 47 O.S., § 2-117, the Commissioner of Public Safety is
required to designate any portion of the National System of Interstate and
Defense Highways, and those portions of the federal-aid primary highways
and the state highway system which are located within the boundaries of and
on the outskirts of a municipality for special traffic-related enforcement by the
Oklahoma Highway Patrol Division upon receipt of the Attorney General's
determination that the traffic-related enforcement practices of the municipal
law enforcement agency are being conducted within the boundaries of and on
the outskirts of the municipality, and for the purpose of generating more than
fifty percent (50%) of the revenue needed for the operation of the municipality.

The Department is further required by this statute to adopt rules, in part
to uniformly implement the procedures and the criteria for determining the
length of time the designation of special traffic-related enforcement shall be in
force. During such period of special designation, the affected municipal law
enforcement agency shall be prohibited from regulating traffic and enforcing
traffic-related statutes or ordinances upon such designated portion of highways
without prior coordination and written approval of the Commissioner.

The Department has received written notice from the Attorney General on
May 9 and May 16, 2012, making the determination that the traffic-related law
enforcement practices of two towns are being conducted within the boundaries
of and on the outskirts of the municipality, and for the purpose of generating
more than fifty percent (50%) of the revenue needed for the operation of the
municipality. Therefore, the Commissioner is required to make a designation
of special traffic-related enforcement; however, the Department lacks the rules
to implement this designation as required by 47 O.S., § 2-117, thus resulting in
an emergency. Before undertaking such a restrictive action against these two
municipalities, the Department respectfully seeks the approval of the Governor
to immediately approve its proposed rules.

ANALYSIS:

Creation of this chapter would provide procedures for investigating
allegations related to use of highways for the purpose of generating more than
fifty percent (50%) of the revenue needed for the operation of the municipality
and designating such highways for special enforcement by the Oklahoma
Highway Patrol.

The proposed actions is to create new rules.

The circumstance which created the need for this rule was the EEOC case
decision as described in the "Finding of Emergency" above.

The intended effect of these rules is to allow the Department of Public
Safety to perform its duties as required or authorized by state law.

CONTACT PERSON:

Stephen J. Krise, General Counsel, Department of Public Safety, 3600 N.
M.L. King Ave., P.O. Box 11415, Oklahoma City, OK 73136-0415. Phone:
(405) 425-2148. E-mail: skrise@dps.state.ok.us

PURSUANT TO THE ACTIONS DESCRIBED HEREIN,

THE FOLLOWING EMERGENCY RULES ARE
CONSIDERED PROMULGATED AND EFFECTIVE

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)

1797

UPON APPROVAL BY THE GOVERNOR, AS SET
FORTH IN750.S. § 253(D):

595:70-1-1. Purpose
Pursuant to 47 O.S. § 2-117, the Department of Public
Safety hereby adopts this Chapter to uniformly implement pro-
cedures relating to the traffic-related enforcement practices of
a municipal law enforcement agency under the provisions of
this Chapter, and for determining the length of time the desig-
nation of special traffic-related enforcement shall be in force.
In connection with this section:
(1) The Oklahoma Highway Patrol Division of the De-
partment of Public Safety shall have primary law enforce-
ment authority respecting traffic-related offenses upon the
National System of Interstate and Defense Highways, and
may have special law enforcement authority on those por-
tions of the federal-aid primary highways and the state
highway system which are located within the boundaries
and on the outskirts of a municipality, and designated by
the Commissioner of Public Safety for such special law
enforcement authority. [47 O.S., § 2-117(D)(2)]
(2) The Commissioner of Public Safety may designate
any portion of the National System of Interstate and
Defense Highways, and those portions of the federal-aid
primary highways and the state highway system which
are located within the boundaries of and on the outskirts
of a municipality for special traffic-related enforcement
by the Oklahoma Highway Patrol Division. [47 O.S., §
2-117(D)(3)]
(3)  Upon receipt of such notice of special traffic-re-
lated enforcement , the affected law enforcement agency
shall not regulate traffic nor enforce traffic-related
statutes or ordinances upon any portion of the National
System of Interstate and Defense Highways, the fed-
eral-aid primary highways and the state highway system
so designated for such special enforcement, without prior
coordination and written approval of the Commissioner.
[47 O.S., § 2-117(D)(3)]

595:70-1-2. Definitions

The following words and terms, when used in this Chapter,
shall have the following meaning, unless the context clearly
indicates otherwise:

"Commissioner' means the Commissioner of Public
Safety or the Commissioner's designee.

"National System of Interstate and Defense High-
ways', "‘federal-aid primary highways™ and ''state
highway system'' shall mean any part of the federal and state
highway system in the State of Oklahoma.

""Qutskirts of a municipality’ means and shall be deter-
mined by presence of the following factors:

(A) low land use density,

(B) absence of any school or residential subdivi-
sion requiring direct ingress or egress from the high-
way, and

(C) a scarcity of retail or commercial business
abutting the highway. [47 O.S., § 2-117(D)(2)]

August 15, 2012



Emergency Adoptions

595:70-1-3. Requesting an investigation

Only the following persons may request the Commissioner
to investigate the traffic-related enforcement practices of a mu-
nicipal law enforcement agency [47 O.S., § 2-117(E)(1)] and

595:70-1-7. Reporting to the Attorney General and
the Attorney General's determination
(@) Upon completion of the investigation, the results of such

investigation shall be submitted by the Department to the Of-

the receipts and expenditures of a municipality [47 O.S., §

fice of Attorney General. The Attorney General shall make a

2-117(E)(3)]:

(1) The district attorney in whose jurisdiction the mu-

determination within sixty (60) days of receipt of the results of
the investigation as to whether the enforcement practices of the

nicipality is located,
(2) A majority of the county commissioners, by resolu-

municipal law enforcement agency are being conducted as pro-
vided in OAC 595:70-1-4(a) and (b) [47 O.S., § 2-117(E)(3)].

tion, of the county in which the municipality is located,
(3) The State Auditor and Inspector,

(4) The State Attorney General, or

(5)  Astate legislator in whose district the municipality

(b) Upon a determination that the enforcement practices are
not being conducted in such a manner, the Attorney General
shall notify the Commissioner in writing, and the Commis-
sioner shall take no action. [47 O.S., § 2-117(E)(3)]

is located. [47 O.S., § 2-117(E)(1)]

595:70-1-4. Requirements of the request for

investigation

As a prerequisite to commencement of an investigation,
the request for such investigation shall state that the requesting
party believes the enforcement practices of the municipal law
enforcement agency are being conducted:

(1)  Within the boundaries of and on the outskirts of the

municipality, and

(2) For the purpose of generating more than fifty per-

cent (50%) of the revenue needed for the operation of the

municipality. [47 O.S., § 2-117(E)(2)]

595:70-1-5. Conducting the investigation

Upon receipt of a request made in accordance with OAC
595:70-1-3 and 595:70-1-4, the Commissioner may order an
investigation of the traffic-related enforcement practices of the
municipal law enforcement agency and the receipts and expen-
ditures of the municipality [47 O.S., § 2-117(E)(3)]. No part
of this Chapter shall be construed to impose a mandatory re-
guirement to conduct an investigation.

595:70-1-6. Cooperation in the investigation

The law enforcement agency, the municipality, and the re-
guesting party shall each cooperate fully with any investiga-
tion ordered by the Commissioner [47 O.S., § 2-117(E)(3)]. If
the Commissioner determines that the law enforcement agency
or the municipality has failed to cooperate fully with the or-
dered investigation, the Commissioner may implement an in-
definite period of designation of special traffic-related enforce-
ment thereby prohibiting the affected law enforcement agency
from requlating traffic and enforcing traffic-related statutes and
ordinances upon such portions of the National System of Inter-
state and Defense Highways, the federal-aid primary highways
and the state highway system designated for special traffic-re-
lated enforcement. This indefinite period of designation may
be lifted by order of the Commissioner once full cooperation
with the investigation has been obtained to the satisfaction of
the Commissioner. If the requesting party fails to cooperate
fully with any investigation ordered by the Commissioner, the
Commissioner may order the investigation stopped until full
cooperation has been obtained to the satisfaction of the Com-
missioner.

August 15, 2012

1798

(c) Upon a determination that the enforcement practices are
being conducted as provided in OAC 595:70-1-4(a) and (b),
the Attorney General shall notify the Commissioner in writing,
and the Commissioner shall make the designation of special
traffic-related enforcement as provided in OAC 595:70-1-1(b),
which shall stay in force for such time as determined by the
Commissioner as provided in OAC 595:70-1-8. [47 O.S., §
2-117(E)(3)]
(d) Within ten (10) business days of receipt of written notifi-
cation by the Attorney General that the enforcement practices
are being conducted as provided in OAC 595:70-1-4(a) and (b),
the Commissioner shall make the designation of special traf-
fic-related enforcement as provided in OAC 595:70-1-1(b), and
provide written notification of such designation to the follow-

(1) The affected law enforcement agency;

(2) The municipality;

(3) The requesting party;

(4)  The sheriff of the county in which the special traf-

fic-related enforcement will take place;

(8) The District Attorney within whose jurisdiction the

special traffic-related enforcement will take place;

(6) The Chief of the Oklahoma Highway Patrol Divi-

sion; and

(7)  Other affected law enforcement agencies.
(f)  The date that the period of special traffic-related enforce-
ment by the Oklahoma Highway Patrol shall begin shall be
stated in the written notice. The period of time for such spe-
cial traffic-related enforcement shall be as provided in OAC
595:70-1-8. No special traffic-related enforcement by the Ok-
lahoma Highway Patrol shall occur without prior notification
and coordination with the affected law enforcement agency and

the municipality.

595:70-1-8. Duration of special traffic-related
enforcement designation

(@) Effective the date specified in the written notice of des-
ignation of special traffic-related enforcement, the affected law
enforcement agency shall not requlate traffic nor enforce traf-
fic-related statutes or ordinances upon such designated portion
of the National System of Interstate and Defense Highways or
such designated portions of the federal-aid primary highways
and the state highway system without prior coordination and
written approval of the Commissioner [47 O.S., 8 2-117(D)(3)]
for the following periods:

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)



Emergency Adoptions

(1) Ifitis the first designation of a special traffic-re-
lated enforcement by the Commissioner then the period
of designation shall be for no more than three (3) months.
(2) Ifitis the second designation of a special traffic-
related enforcement by the Commissioner then the period
of designation shall be for no more than six (6) months.
(3) Ifitis the third or subsequent designation of a spe-
cial traffic-related enforcement by the Commissioner then
the period of designation shall be for no more than twelve
(12) months.
(b) The commencement date and duration of the period of
designation shall be stated in the written notice sent to the law
enforcement agency and the municipality. For good cause, the
Commissioner may reduce the duration of those periods of des-
ignation specified in (1), (2) and (3) of (a).

595:70-1-9. Construction

Nothing in this Chapter shall limit a member of the Ok-
lahoma Highway Patrol Division from requesting assistance
from any other law enforcement agency nor limit officers of
such agency from rendering the requested assistance. The offi-
cer and the law enforcement agency responding to the request
of the member of the Oklahoma Highway Patrol Division or
sheriff's department shall have the same rights and immunities
as are possessed by the Oklahoma Highway Patrol Division.
[47 O.S., § 2-117(F)]

[OAR Docket #12-839; filed 7-12-12]

TITLE 600. REAL ESTATE APPRAISER
BOARD
CHAPTER 10. LICENSURE AND
CERTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

[OAR Docket #12-845]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
EMERGENCY adoption
RULES:
600:10-1-18. National Registry Fee [NEW]
AUTHORITY:
Oklahoma Real Estate Appraisers Act; 59 O.S. § 858-706 (B)
DATES:
Adoption:
June 13, 2012
Approved by Governor:
July 20, 2012
Effective:
Immediately upon Governor's approval.

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)

1799

Expiration:

Effective through July 14, 2013 unless superseded by Permanent Rule or
disapproved by the Legislature.
SUPERSEDED EMERGENCY ACTIONS:

n/a
INCORPORATIONS BY REFERENCE:

n/a
FINDING OF AN EMERGENCY:

59 0.S. 2011, Section 858-708 was amended pursuant to SB 1493 authored
by Senator Paddack of the Senate and Representative Thomsen of the House,
and signed by the Governor on May 8, 2012. The statutory amendments
require that the Real Estate Appraiser Board promulgate rules to assist
appraisers in meeting the requirements of the Appraisal Subcommittee of the
Federal Financial Institutions Examination Council. The emergency statutory
language took effect immediately upon approval by the Governor on May 8,
2012. Therefore, an emergency exists in which emergency rules need to be put
in effect in order for the Real Estate Appraiser Board to meet those statutory
requirements.

ANALYSIS:

The proposed amendment to rule 600:10 at 600:10-1-18 adds language
to allow the Real Estate Appraiser Board to collect the National Registry Fee
from licensed appraisers on an annual basis, in whatever amount is due, as
required by the Appraisal Subcommittee, and in turn pay the National Registry
Fee on behalf of Oklahoma appraisers.

CONTACT PERSON:

Christine McEntire, Director, Real Estate Appraiser Board, Oklahoma
Insurance Department, Five Corporate Plaza, 3625 N.W. 56t Street, Suite 100,
Oklahoma City, OK 73112 (405) 522-2475.

PURSUANT TO THE ACTIONS DESCRIBED
HEREIN, THE FOLLOWING EMERGENCY RULE IS
CONSIDERED PROMULGATED AND EFFECTIVE
UPON APPROVAL BY THE GOVERNOR AS SET
FORTHIN750.S.,SECTION 253(D):

600:10-1-18. National Registry Fee

(@) Pursuant to 59 O.S. 858-708, the Board will collect the
National Registry Fee on an annual basis from each appraiser,
at such time each appraiser renews their license. Said fee will
be in whatever amount is currently required by the Appraisal
Subcommittee. Notification of the Appraisal Subcommittee's
then-current National Registry Fee will be transmitted to the
appraiser on each vyear's renewal statement and provided to
each appraiser approximately six weeks in advance of their re-
newal date.

(b) Payment of the National Registry Fee by the Board will
be made to the Appraisal Subcommittee on a monthly basis,
upon invoice from such amounts as are actually paid to the
Board by each appraiser.

[OAR Docket #12-845; filed 7-26-12]

August 15, 2012



Executive Orders

As required by 75 O.S., Sections 255 and 256, Executive Orders issued by the Governor of Oklahoma are published in both the
Oklahoma Register and the Oklahoma Administrative Code. Executive Orders are codified in Title 1 of the Oklahoma Administrative

Code.

Pursuantto 75 O.S., Section 256(B)(3), "Executive Orders of previous gubernatorial administrations shall terminate ninety (90)
calendar days following the inauguration of the next Governor unless otherwise terminated or continued during that time by Executive

Order."

TITLE1. EXECUTIVE ORDERS

1:2012-19.

EXECUTIVE ORDER 2012-19

I, Mary Fallin, Governor of the State of Oklahoma, hereby
direct the appropriate steps be taken to fly all American and
Oklahoma flags on State property at half-staff until sunset on
Wednesday, July 25, 2012 to honor those who were killed and
injured on Friday, July 20, 2012 in the tragic theatre shooting
in Aurora, Colorado.

The flying of the flags at half-staff is a symbol that allows
the people of Oklahoma to express their sympathy and support
to the families and friends of the many innocent victims of this
heinous attack.

This executive order shall be forwarded to the Director
of the Department of Central Services who shall cause the
provisions of this order to be implemented by all appropriate
agencies of State government.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have hereunto set my hand and
caused the Great Seal of the State of Oklahoma to be affixed at
Oklahoma City, Oklahoma, this 23 day of July, 2012.

BY THE GOVERNOR OF THE
STATE OF OKLAHOMA

Mary Fallin

ATTEST:
Michelle R. Day
Assistant Secretary of State

[OAR Docket #12-843; filed 7-23-12]

1:2012-20.

EXECUTIVE ORDER 2012-20

I, Mary Fallin, Governor of the State of Oklahoma, hereby
direct the appropriate steps be taken to fly all American and
Oklahoma flags on State property at half-staff from 8:00 a.m.
until 5:00 p.m. on Tuesday, July 24, 2012, to honor former
State Senator Gene Stipe, who died on Saturday, July 21, 2012,

August 15, 2012

1800

Senator Stipe was first elected to the Oklahoma House of
Representative in 1948, making him the youngest Oklahoman
to be elected to the House. He was elected to the Senate in
1956. By the time Stipe left his Senate office in 2003, the
Demaocrat from McAlester had served 53 years in the state Leg-
islature, a record that still stands. This executive order shall be
forwarded to the Director of Central Services who shall cause
the provisions of this order to be implemented by all approriate
agencies of state government.

IN WITNESS WHEREOQOF, | have hereunto set my hand and
caused the Great Seal of the State of Oklahoma to be affixed at
Oklahoma City, Oklahoma, this 23 day of July, 2012.

BY THE GOVERNOR OF THE
STATE OF OKLAHOMA

Mary Fallin

ATTEST:
Michelle R. Day
Assistant Secretary of State

[OAR Docket #12-844; filed 7-23-12]

1:2012-21.

EXECUTIVE ORDER 2012-21

I, Mary Fallin, Governor of the State of Oklahoma, pursuant
to the power vested in me by Section 2 of Article VI of the Ok-
lahoma Constitution, hereby declare the following:

1. Due to Exceptional and Extreme Drought conditions
existing in 77 counties in Oklahoma, and the severe wildfires
beginning July 22, 2012, and continuing, there is hereby de-
clared a disaster emergency caused by wildfires and drought
in the State of Oklahoma that threatens the lives and property
of the people of this State and the public's peace, health, and
safety.

This declaration may be amended as conditions warrant.
2. It may be necessary to provide for the rendering of mutual
assistance among the State and political subdivisions of

the State with respect to carrying out disaster emergency
functions during the continuance of the State emergency

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)



Executive Orders

pursuant to the provisions of the Oklahoma Emergency
Management Act of 2003.

3. State agencies, in responding to this disaster emergency,
may make necessary emergency acquisitions to fulfill the
purposes of this proclamation without regard to limitations
or bidding requirements on such acquisitions.

4. The State Emergency Operations Plan has been activated
and resources of all State departments and agencies avail-
able to meet this emergency are hereby committed to the
reasonable extent necessary to protect lives and to prevent,
minimize, and repair injury and damage. These efforts
shall be coordinated by the Director of the Department of
Emergency Management with comparable functions of the
federal government and political subdivisions of the State.

5. This Executive Order shall terminate at the end of thirty
(30) days.

Copies of this Executive Order shall be distributed to the
Director of Emergency Management who shall cause the

Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23)

1801

provisions of this order to be implemented by all appropriate
agencies of state government.

IN WITNESS WHEREOQOF, I have hereunto set my hand and
caused the Great Seal of the State of Oklahoma to be affixed at
Oklahoma City, this 30 day of July, 2012.

BY THE GOVERNOR OF THE
STATE OF OKLAHOMA

Mary Fallin

ATTEST:
Michelle R. Day
Assistant Secretary of State

[OAR Docket #12-848; filed 7-30-12]

August 15, 2012



Oklahoma Register (Volume 29, Number 23) 1802 August 15, 2012



