\Volume 27
Number 12
March 1, 2010
Pages 653 - 670

The

Oklahoma
Registet

Oklahoma
Secretary of State
Office of Administrative Rules



Brad Henry, Governor
M. Susan Savage,
Secretary of State
Peggy Coe, Managing Editor

THE OKLAHOMA REGISTER is an official publication of the State of Oklahoma. It is published semi-monthly on
the first working day of the month and on the first working day following the 14th day of the month under the authority
of 75 O.S., Sections 250 et seq. and OAC 655:10-15-1. The rules of the State of Oklahoma are codified and published
in the Oklahoma Administrative Code.

The Oklahoma Register and the documents accepted for publication are AVAILABLE FOR PUBLIC INSPECTION
at the Office of Administrative Rules pursuant to the Oklahoma Open Records Act. Copies of the Register are also
available for public inspection at many County Clerks' offices in Oklahoma, the Jan Eric Cartwright Memorial Law
Library in the State Capitol, and the following depository libraries:

Ada - East Central University, Linscheid Library Norman - University of Oklahoma, Bizzell Memorial
Alva - Northwestern Oklahoma State University, Library

J.W. Martin Library Oklahoma City - Metropolitan Library System
Bartlesville - Bartlesville Public Library Oklahoma City - Oklahoma Department of Libraries
Clinton - Clinton Public Library Stillwater - Oklahoma State University, Edmon Low
Durant - Southeastern Oklahoma State University, H.G. Library

Bennett Memorial Library Tahlequah - Northeastern State University, John
Edmond - University of Central Oklahoma, Chambers Library Vaughan Library
Enid - Public Library of Enid and Garfield County Tulsa - Tulsa City-County Library System
Goodwell - Oklahoma Panhandle State University Tulsa - University of Tulsa, McFarlin Library
Lawton - Lawton Public Library Weatherford - Southwestern Oklahoma State
McAlester - McAlester Public Library University, Al Harris Library

CITE MATERIAL PUBLISHED IN THE OKLAHOMA REGISTER by the volume and the beginning page
number of the document in the Register. For example: 26 Ok Reg 256.

SUBSCRIPTION RATES for the Register are $500.00 per year for the printed issues and $300.00 per year for the
CD-ROM issues, payable in advance. When available, individual printed issues may be purchased for $20.00 plus the
cost of postage, payable in advance. Make checks payable to "Secretary of State.” Send subscription requests, change
of address notices, and undelivered copies to: Secretary of State, Office of Administrative Rules, P.O. Box 53390,
Oklahoma City, OK 73152-3390.

INFORMATION ABOUT THIS PUBLICATION may be obtained by contacting the Oklahoma Secretary of State,
Office of Administrative Rules, 2401 North Lincoln Boulevard, Will Rogers Building, Room 220, P.O. Box 53390,
Oklahoma City, OK 73152-3390, or by calling (405) 521-4911 or faxing (405) 522-3555. Office hours are 8:00 a.m.
to 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday.

This publication is issued and printed by the Secretary of State as authorized by 75 O.S., Section 255. 68 copies have been prepared and
distributed at a cost of $354.80. Copies have been deposited with the Oklahoma Department of Libraries, Publications Clearinghouse.
ISSN 0030-1728



Table of Contents

Agency/ACtION/SUDJECT INAeX ... iii
Rules Affected INAeX ... oo e iv
Agency Index (Title numbersassigned) ...t e vii
Notices of Rulemaking Intent
Firefighter Training, Oklahoma Council on (Title 268) ........ ...t e 653
Forensic Review Board (Title 277) .. ... e e e e 654
Public Safety, Department of (Title 595) ... ... i 654, 655, 656, 657
Scenic Rivers Commission (TIle 630) ... ..ot e e et e 657

Used Motor Vehicle and Parts Commission, Oklahoma (Title 765)

Submissions for Review
Corporation Commission (Title 165) .. ...t e e 659

Nursing, Oklahoma Board of (Title 485) . ... ... it i e e et ie s 659

Teachers’ Retirement System (Title 705) ... ..ot e et 659
Gubernatorial Approvals

Veterinary Medical Examiners, Board of (Title 775) ..o e 661
Withdrawn Rules

Agriculture, Food, and Forestry, Oklahoma Department of (Title35) ..., 663
Emergency Adoptions

Uniform Building Code Commission, Oklahoma (Title 748) ... 665, 666
Executive Orders (Title 1) ..o o e 669






AGRICULTURE, Food, and Forestry, Oklahoma
Department of (Title 35)

Withdrawn Rules

Animal Industry (Chapter 15)
CORPORATION Commission (Title 165)

Submissions for Review

Water Service Utilities (Chapter 65)
FIREFIGHTER Training, Oklahoma Council on
(Title 268)

Notices of Rulemaking Intent
Administrative Operations (Chapter 1)
Operations (Chapter 2)

FORENSIC Review Board (Title 277)

Notices of Rulemaking Intent

Forensic Review Board (Chapter 1)
GOVERNOR

Executive Orders

Ordering flags at half-staff to honor Captain David J.
Thompson (10-9)
NURSING, Oklahoma Board of (Title 485)

Submissions for Review
Administration (Chapter 1)
Licensure of Practical and Registered Nurses

(Chapter 10)
PUBLIC Safety, Department of (Title 595)

Notices of Rulemaking Intent

Class D Driver Licenses and Identification Cards and Motor
License Agent Procedures (Chapter 10) 654

Agency/Action/Subject Index

PUBLIC Safety, Department of — continued
Notices of Rulemaking Intent — continued

Commercial Driver Licenses (Chapter 11) ................. 655
Enforcement of Oklahoma Motor Carrier Safety
and Hazardous Materials Transportation Act
(Chapter35) ... 655
Boating and Water Safety (Chapter45) .................... 656
Tabs, Tags, Signs and Insignias (Chapter50) .............. 657
SCENIC Rivers Commission (Title 630)
Notices of Rulemaking Intent
Protection of Natural Resources (Chapter 15) ............. 657
TEACHERS’ Retirement System (Title 715)
Submissions for Review
General Operations (Chapter 10) ............ccovvvvennnnn. 659
UNIFORM Building Code Commission, Oklahoma
(Title 748)
Emergency Adoptions
General Provisions (Chapter3) .............oooiiiinne.. 665
Fees and Collection of Fees (Chapter5) ................... 666

USED Motor Vehicle and Parts Commission, Oklahoma
(Title 765)
Notices of Rulemaking Intent
Manufactured Home Installers (Chapter 37) 658
VETERINARY Medical Examiners, Board of (Title 775)
Gubernatorial Approvals
Licensure of Veterinarians, Veterinary Technicians and Animal
Euthanasia Tehnicians (Chapter 10) 661
Field Citation Penalties (Chapter 30)



Rules Affected Index

[(E) = Emergency action]

Rule Register Page
10:15-3-2. .. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ..ovvveeen. .. 6
10:15-3-3. . ... ... [AMENDED](E) ........ovviei 6
10:15-18-1. ......... [AMENDED](E)........ccvvvvvnnnnn. 6
10:15-18-4. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ...ovvveeen. .. 7
10:15-21-1. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ovvie 7
10:15-22-1. ......... [REVOKED](E) ...v'evveeveannn 7
10:15-23-1. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... .covvveeen. .. 8
10:15-23-2. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ovviein 9
10:15-25-1. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........covvvevnnn. 9
10:15-25-2. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ...ovvveeen. .. 9
10:15-25-3. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ovviein 9
10:15-25-4. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ccevvevnn. .. 10
10:15-27-7.1. ........ [REVOKED](E) ....oevveeaen. .. 10
10:15-27-8. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........oovvennn... 10
10:15-27-9. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvvevnn. .. 10
10:15-30-5. ......... [AMENDED](E) . ......covven. .. 11
10:15-32-2. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ocvvvennn. .. 11
10:15-32-5. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ccovevnn. .. 11
35:30-27-9.1. ........ [NEWT(E) ..o, 99
35:40-11-1. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o, 489
35:40-11-2. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o, 489
35:40-11-3. ......... [NEWJ(E) .o, 489
35:40-11-4. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o, 489
35:40-11-5. ......... [NEWJ(E) ...ovveieieeen, 490
35:40-11-6. ......... [NEWJ(E) .o, 490
87:10-24-1. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o, 490
87:10-24-2. ......... [NEWJ(E) ...ovveieieeen, 490
87:10-24-3. ......... [NEWJ(E) .. ooovoeni . 491
87:10-24-4. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o, 491
87:10-24-5. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o, 491
87:10-24-6. ......... [NEWT(E) ..ooovoenie . 491
87:10-24-7. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o, 491
87:10-24-8. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o, 491
87:10-24-9. ......... [NEWT(E) .o, 491
87:10-24-10. ........ [NEWJ(E) ..o, 492
87:10-24-11. ........ [NEWJ(E) ...ovveeeieie, 492
87:10-24-12. ........ [NEWT(E) ..ooovoenie . 492
87:10-28-1. ......... [NEWJ(E) ©.oveieieeien 43
87:10-28-2. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o 43
87:10-28-3. ......... [NEWT(E) ©.oooveee i, 44
87:10-28-4. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o, 44
87:10-28-5. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o 44
87:10-28-6. ......... [NEWT(E) ©.oooveeeee i, 44
87:10-28-7. ......... [NEWJ(E) ..o, 44
92:10-1-7............ [AMENDED](E).........ccvvvnnn.. 213
135:10-24-1. ........ [NEWT(E) .o, 281
135:10-24-2. ........ [NEWJ(E) ..o, 281
135:10-24-3. ........ [NEWJ(E) ..o, 282
150:65-11-1. ........ [NEWJ(E) ..o, 284
150:65-11-2. ........ [NEWJ(E) ..o 284
150:65-11-3. ........ [NEWJ(E) ..o, 284
150:65-11-4. ........ [NEWT(E) ..ooovoeniie . 284
160:45-1-1. ......... [AMENDED](E)........covvvnn... 492
160:45-1-2. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ccovvevnn. .. 12
160:45-1-2. ......... [AMENDED](E)........covvvvnnn. .. 493
160:45-1-3. ......... [AMENDED](E).........covvvnn.. 495
160:45-3-1. ......... [AMENDED](E).........cccvvnnn.. 214
160:45-3-7. ......... [AMENDED](E)........covvvvnn. .. 215
160:45-5-1. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ocvvvennn. .. 14
160:45-5-1. ......... [AMENDED](E).........cccvvnnn.. 495
160:45-5-3. ......... [AMENDED](E) .. .....covven. .. 16

Rule Register Page
160:45-9-7. ......... [NEW](E) ..o, 595
160:45-13-1. ........ [NEWI(E) oo 497
160:45-13-2. ........ [NEWI(E) oo, 499
160:45-13-3. ........ [NEW](E) ..o 500
160:45, App. H. ... ... [REVOKED](E) ..o 503
160:45, App. H....... [NEWI(E) ..o, 503
210:20-9-95. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ....covevnn. .. 596
210:40-52-5. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........oovvoeen. .. 107
230:10-7-48.1. ....... [NEWI(E) v, 597
230:10-7-59. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ....covevnn. .. 597
230:30-1-2. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........oovvoeen. .. 599
230:30-3-3. ......... [AMENDED](E).........ccvvvvn... 599
230:30-5-1.1. ........ [AMENDED](E) .. .....oveenn ... 600
230:30-5-8.1. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........oovvoeen. .. 601
230:30-5-8.2. ........ [AMENDED](E).........ccvvven.. 601
230:30-5-9. ......... [AMENDED](E) .. .....oveenn ... 601
230:30-7-6. ......... [AMENDED](E).........c.covvvn... 602
230:30-7-6.1. ........ [AMENDED](E) .........ccvvven.. 602
230:30-7-8. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ....oveenn. .. 602
230:30-7-9. ......... [AMENDED](E)..........c.coovvn... 602
230:30-7-10. ........ [AMENDED](E).........ccvven .. 603
230:30-9-2. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ....oveenn. .. 603
230:30-9-3. ......... [AMENDED](E).........c.coovnn... 604
230:30-9-5. ......... [AMENDED](E)........cccvvenn.. 604
230:30-9-5.1. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... .....ovuenn. .. 605
230:30-9-5.2. ........ [NEWJ(E) ..o 606
230:30-11-2. ........ [AMENDED](E)........ccevoeenn.. 606
230:30-11-6. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ....oveenn ... 607
230:30-11-6.1. ....... [AMENDED](E) ........ovvvoeen. .. 607
230:30-13-2. ........ [AMENDED](E)........ccevvvnn... 608
230:30-15-2. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ....ovvenn. .. 609
230:30-15-4. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........oovvveen. .. 609
230:30-15-5. ........ [AMENDED](E)........ccvvvne.. 609
230:30-15-6. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ....ovvenn. .. 610
230:30-15-7. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ovvveeen. .. 610
230:30-19-6. ........ [AMENDED](E)........cccvvnen.. 610
230:30-21-4. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ....ovvenn. .. 611
230:40-3-30. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........oovveen. .. 611
230:40-7-97.1. ....... [NEWI(E) .o, 612
317:1-1-8............ [AMENDED](E) .......covvvnn. .. 285
317:1-1-9. . .......... [AMENDED](E) ........oovveeen. .. 285
317:1-1-91. ......... [NEWI(E) .o, 285
317:1-1-10. ......... [REVOKED](E) ...ovveeaenn. .. 286
317:1-1-17. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ovvveeen. .. 287
317:1-3-31. ......... [AMENDED](E)........cccvvven .. 287
317:1-3-32. ......... [REVOKED](E) ... oovvoeeenn. .. 287
317:1-34. ... ..., [NEWI(E) .o, 287
317:15-1. ........... [REVOKED](E) ...vovvveeeeann .. 288
317:1-5-2. oo [REVOKED](E) ....ovvooeeenn. .. 288
317:1-53. ... [REVOKED](E) ..o 288
317:15-4. ... ..... [REVOKED](E) ...vovvveeeeann .. 288
317:1-5-5............ [REVOKED](E) ....ovvooeeenn. .. 289
317:1-7-1 ... [REVOKED](E) ..o 289
317:1-7-2. .o [REVOKED](E) ...vovveiveann.. 289
317:1-7-3. oo [REVOKED](E) ....ovvooeeenn. .. 290
317174 ... [REVOKED](E) ....ovvovean .. 290
317:1-7-5. ... ... [REVOKED](E) ...vovveeveann.. 291
317:1-7-6. ... [REVOKED](E) ... .ovvoeeenn. .. 291
317:1-7-61. ......... [REVOKED](E) ..o 291
317:1-7-7. ..o [REVOKED](E) ..o 291
317:1-7-8. ... [REVOKED](E) ....ovvoeeenn. .. 292



Rules Affected Index — continued

317:19-1. ...l [REVOKED](E) ....vvveeveann. 292
317:1:92. ... ... [REVOKED](E) ....vvveeveannn. 292
317:1-9-3............ [REVOKEDI(E) ... 292
317:1-9-4. . .......... [REVOKEDI(E) ... 292
317:1-95. . .......... [REVOKED](E) ....vvveeveannn. 292
317:1-96. . .......... [REVOKEDI(E) ... 292
317:1:9-9. ........... [REVOKEDI(E) ... 292
317:1-9-10. ......... [REVOKED](E) ....vvveeveannn. 293
317:30-3-5. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 612
317:30-3-24. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvveenn... 293
317:30-3-57. ........ [AMENDED](E) .........c.ovvv... 614
317:30-3-59. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvennn... 295
317:30-3-60. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvveenn... 296
317:30-3-61. ........ INEWI(E) ..o, 449
317:30-3-62. ........ INEWI(E) ..o 618
317:30-5-2. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ccvveenn... 297
317:30-5-9. ......... [AMENDED](E) .........c.ovvv... 301
317:30-5-14. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvennn... 619
317:30-5-20. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvven... 302
317:30-5-22. ........ [AMENDED](E) .........c.ovvv... 109
317:30-5-24. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvennn... 620
317:30-5-42.1. ....... [AMENDED](E) ........ccvven... 621
317:30-5-42.11. ...... [AMENDED](E) .........c.ovvvn.. 110
317:30-5-42.17. ... .. [AMENDED](E) ........ccvveenn... 302
317:30-5-65. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvennn.. 304
317:30-5-72. ........ [AMENDED](E) .........c.evvn... 616
317:30-5-72.1. ....... [AMENDED](E) ........cveenn... 306
317:30-5-95. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvvvnn... 111
317:30-5-137. ....... [AMENDED](E) .........c.ovvv... 451
317:30-5-137.1. . ..... [NEW](E) . ..''voeneaeneannn, 451
317:30-5-137.2. ... .. [NEW](E) ...''voeeninnanns, 451
317:30-5-138. ....... [REVOKED](E) ....vvveeveenn.. 452
317:30-5-139. ....... [REVOKEDI(E) ... 452
317:30-5-210.1. ......[NEW](E) ©.@vvoennenneennn, 453
317:30-5-210.2. ......[NEW](E) ....'vovnrennennnnn, 453
317:30-5-211.1. ...... [AMENDED](E) ... ....c'veennnn.. 454
317:30-5-211.8. ......[REVOKED](E) ... ..ovovvennnn.. 454
317:30-5-211.10. . . . .. [AMENDED](E) .........coovvn... 304
317:30-5-211.10. . . . .. [AMENDED](E) ........ccvven... 628
317:30-5-211.12. . ... .. [AMENDED](E) ........ccovvvn... 629
317:30-5-211.13. . ... .. [AMENDED](E) .........c.ovvv... 454
317:30-5-211.14. . ... .. [AMENDED](E) .......ccveenn... 455
317:30-5-211.15. . . . .. [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvven... 629
317:30-5-211.17. ... .. INEWI(E) ..o, 305
317:30-5-211.18. . ... .. INEWI(E) ..o 457
317:30-5-212. ....... [REVOKEDI(E) ....'vveeveannn 455
317:30-5-216. ....... [AMENDED](E) .........coevvn... 456
317:30-5-218. ....... [AMENDED](E) ........ccveen... 629
317:30-5-241.3. ......[AMENDED](E) .............c.o... 303
317:30-5-547. ....... [AMENDED](E) .........c.ovvv... 629
317:30-5-764. ....... [AMENDED](E) ........ccvven... 621
317:30-5-950. ....... [AMENDED](E) ........ccoovvn... 623
317:30-5-1040. ...... [AMENDED](E) .........c.ovvv... 624
317:30-5-1041. ...... [AMENDED](E) ........cvveenn... 624
317:30-5-1042. ...... [AMENDED](E) ........ccvveen... 624
317:30-5-1043. ...... [AMENDED](E) .........c.ovvv... 624
317:30-5-1044. ...... [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvenn... 627
317:30-5-1046. ...... [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvvn... 627
317:30-5-1047. ...... [AMENDED](E) .........c.oovv... 628
317:35-5-25. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvenn... 630
317:35-5-41.2. ....... [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvven... 113
317:35-5-42. ........ [AMENDED](E) .........c.ovvvn.. 115
317:35-6-60. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........cvveenn... 634
317:35-6-61. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........cc0vvvn... 635
317:35-10-26. ....... [AMENDED](E) .........c.ovvv... 120
317:35-13-4. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........cveeenn... 307

317:35-15-8.1. ....... [AMENDED](E) ........ccvven... 308

317:35-15-13.2. ......[AMENDED] (E) ... ......oovvvn. .. 309
317:35-15-13.2. ......[AMENDED] (E).................. 636
317:35-17-14. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 312
317:35-17-22. ....... [AMENDED](E) ........covveennn.. 638
317:40-9-1. ......... INEWI(E) ..o, 457
340:10-2-3. ......... [AMENDED](E) ...\ \eeeovvenn.. 156
340:10-2-4. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........covvennn.. 157
340:10-3-33. ........ [AMENDED](E) .........c0vevnnn.. 160
340:10-3-56. ........ [AMENDED](E) ...\ 18
340:10-15-1. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 20
340:25-5-351. ....... [AMENDED](E) .........cvenvnn.. 162
340:40-7-1. ......... [AMENDED](E) ...\ 21
340:40-7-1. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........covvennn.. 164
340:40-7-11. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ...ccvvenv.. .. 22
340:40-7-12. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ... 24
340:50-11-20. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ...covvennn.. 165
340:60-1-3. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o, 26
340:75-6-31.4. ....... [AMENDED](E) ...\ 44
340:75-15-128.1. .....[AMENDED](E) ... .......cooovvnn. .. 45
340:110-1-4.1. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ..., 49
340:110-1-6. ........ [AMENDED](E) ...\ 50
340:110-1-8. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 51
340:110-1-8.1. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o, 53
340:110-1-9. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... .\ 55
340:110-1-43.1. ......[AMENDED](E).........cooovvn... 56
340:110-1-45. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ...ccvven.. .. 57
340:110-1-46. ....... [AMENDED](E) ...\ 58
340:110-1-47. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 59
340:110-1-51. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ...ccvveen.. .. 60
340:110-3-5. ........ [AMENDED](E) ...\ 61
340:110-3-5.1. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ..oovvenn. .. 63
340:110-3-6. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ..., 63
340:110-3-7.1. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... .o 64
340:110-3-39. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 68
340:110-3-40. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ...ccvveenn.. .. 69
340:110-3-41. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... .o 69
340:110-3-42. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 70
340:110-3-85. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ...ccvvenn.. .. 72
340:110-3-88. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... .\ 75
340:110-3-89.1. ......[AMENDED](E)..........cooovven... 76
340:110-3-153. ...... [AMENDED](E) ........cvveenn.. .. 76
340:110-3-153.1. .. ... [AMENDED] (E) ... ...cvvennn... 77
340:110-3-168. ...... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 80
340:110-3-223. ...... [AMENDED](E) ... ..., 82
340:110-3-224. ...... [AMENDED](E) ...\ 83
340:110-3-225. ...... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 83
340:110-3-226. ...... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o, 84
340:110-5-7. ........ [AMENDED](E) ...\ 88
340:110-5-8. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 88
340:110-5-12. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o, 90
365:10-5-177. ....... [AMENDED](E) ......ooevvenn.. 316
365:10-17-4. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ...covvennn.. 318
365:10-25-4. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvennnn.. 319
365:10-25-5. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... .o 319
365:25-3-14. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........covvennn.. 166
365:25-5-50. ........ INEWI(E) ..ooveeineeinen, 169
365:25-5-51. ........ INEWI(E) ..o 169
365:25-5-52. ........ INEWI(E) ..o 170
365:25-5-53. ........ INEWI(E) ..o, 170
365:25-5-54. ........ INEWI(E) ..o 170
365:25-5-55. ........ INEWI(E) .o 170
365:25-5-56. ........ INEWI(E) ..o, 170
365:25-5-57. ........ INEWI(E) ..o 170
365:25-5-58. ........ INEWI(E) ..o 170
365:25-9-3. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvevnnn.. 170
365:25, App. C. ...... INEWI(E) ..o 172
365:25, App. M. ..... INEWI(E) .o 174



Rules Affected Index — continued

365:25, App. X....... INEWI(E) ..o, 175
365:25, App. Y. ...... INEWI(E) ..o, 176
365:45-1-1. ......... INEWI(E) ..o 177
365:45-1-2. ......... INEWI(E) ..o 177
365:45-3-1. ......... INEWI(E) ..o, 177
365:45-5-1. ......... INEWI(E) ..o 178
377:3-13-120. ....... INEWI(E) ..o, 639
377:3-13-121. ....... INEWI(E) ..., 639
377:3-13-122. ....... INEWI(E) ..o 639
377:3-13-123. ....... INEWI(E) ..o, 639
377:3-13-124. ....... INEWI(E) ..., 639
377:3-13-125. ....... INEWI(E) ..o 639
377:3-13-126. ....... INEWI(E) ..o, 639
377:3-13-127. ....... INEWI(E) ..., 640
377:3-13-128. ....... INEWI(E) ..o 640
377:3-13-129. ....... INEWI(E) ..o, 640
377:3-13-130. ....... INEWI(E) ..., 640
377:3-13-131. ....... INEWI(E) ..o 640
377:3-13-132. ....... INEWI(E) ..o, 641
377:3-13-133. ....... INEWI(E) ..., 641
377:3-13-134. ....... INEWI(E) ..o 641
377:3-13-135. ....... INEWI(E) ..o, 641
377:3-13-136. ....... INEWI(E) ..., 641
377:3-13-137. ....... INEWI(E) ..o 641
377:3-13-138. ....... INEWI(E) ..o, 642
377:3-13-139. ....... INEWI(E) ..o, 642
377:3-13-140. ....... INEWI(E) ..o 643
377:3-13-141. ....... INEWI(E) ..o, 643
377:3-13-142. ....... INEWI(E) ..o, 643
377:3-13-143. ....... INEWI(E) ..o 643
377:3-13-144. ... ... INEWI(E) ..o, 643
377:3-13-145. ....... INEWI(E) ..., 645
377:3-13-146. ....... INEWI(E) ..o 646
377:3-13-147. ....... INEWI(E) ..o 646
377:3-13-148. ....... INEWI(E) ..., 646
377:3-13-149. ....... INEWI(E) ..o 646
530:10-13-3. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ....ccvoeennn.. 381
530:10-15-45. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ....ccovevnn.. 382
530:10-17-70. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... .ovveennn.. 383
530:10-17-75. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ....ccveeennn.. 383
530:10-17-76. ....... INEWI(E) ..o, 384
530:10-17-77. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... .oeveannn.. 385
530:15-1-1. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ....ccveevnn.. 386
530:15-1-2. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ....ccovevnn.. 386
530:15-1-5. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... .ovoveennn.. 387
530:15-1-6. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ....ccveennn.. 387
530:15-1-7. ......... [AMENDED](E)........ccooevnnn.. 387
530:15-1-12. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... .ovveennn.. 388
530:15-3-7. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ....ccvvevnnn.. 388
530:15-3-7.1. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ....ccovevnn.. 388
530:15-3-8. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... .ovoveennn.. 389
530:15-5-8. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ....coveennnn.. 389
580:15-2-7. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ....cc0ovvnn.. 179
580:15-4-13. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 180
580:15-6-5. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ....ccveevnn... 181
580:15-6-6. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... .....cooevnn... 182
580:15-6-6.1. ........ INEWI(E) ..o, 185

Vi

580:15-6-6.2. ........ INEWI(E) ..o 185
580:15-6-10. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvvvvnn.. 186
580:15-6-14. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 186
580:15-6-21. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvveenn.. 187
580:25-5-1. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........cc.evvvn.. 321
595:11-1-21. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 323
595:11-1-31. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvveenn.. 324
595:11-1-55. ........ INEWI(E) ..o, 325
595:11-1-62. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 325
595:11-5-4. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ccvveenn.. 325
595:11-5-5. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........cc.evvvn.. 326
595:11-7-3. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 327
595:30-3-17. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvveenn.. 329
595:30-3-18. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........cc.evvvn.. 331
595:35-1-6. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 332
610:25-23-1. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccvveenn.. 334
610:25-23-2. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........cc.evvvn.. 334
610:25-23-5. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 335
610:25-23-7. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccveeenn.. 336
612:10-7-163. ....... [AMENDED](E) ........cc.evvvn.. 126
710:1-3-6. . .......... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 127
710:60-9-130. ....... [REVOKEDI(E) ... 128
710:60-9-130.1. ..... . [NEWJ(E) +.@vvovveennann.. 128
710:60-9-131. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... .oeveennn.. 128
710:60-9-133. ....... [AMENDED](E) ........cveenn.. 128
710:60-9-134. ....... [AMENDED](E) ........cc.ovvvn.. 128
710:60-9-135. ....... [REVOKEDI(E) «..''vveveann.. 129
710:60-9-137. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 129
710:65-18-5. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........cccevvvn.. 129
710:70-7-10. ........ INEWI(E) ..o 647
715:10-19-1. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ...oveenn.. 131
715:10-19-2. ........ [AMENDED](E) .........c.ovvvn.. 132
715:10-19-3. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 132
715:10-19-4. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ....cveenn.. 132
715:10-19-5. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........ccovevnn.. 133
715:10-19-7. ........ [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 135
715:10-19-8. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........cveenn.. 135
715:10-19-9. ........ [AMENDED](E) ........cc.ovvn... 137
715:10-19-11. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 138
715:10-19-12. ....... [AMENDED](E) ... ....coveeenn.. 138
715:10-19-13. ....... [AMENDED](E) ........cc.ovvv... 139
748:1-1-1. ... INEWI(E) ..o 461
748:1-1-2............ INEWI(E) .o, 461
748:1-1-3............ INEWI(E) .o 461
748:1-1-4. . .......... INEWI(E) ..o 461
748:3-1-1............ INEWI(E) ..o 665
748:3-1-2............ INEWI(E) .o 665
7485-1-1............ INEWI(E) ..o 666
748:5-3-1............ INEWI(E) .o 667
765:37-6-1. ......... INEWI(E) .o 139
765:37-7-1. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 140
765:37-7-2. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ccvveen... 140
800:10-1-5. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ccoovvvn.. 534
800:10-3-5. ......... [AMENDED](E) ... ..o 535
800:10-5-4. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ccvveen... 539
800:20-1-2. ......... [AMENDED](E) ........ccoovvnnn.. 539



Agency/Title Index

[Assigned as of 3-1-10]

Agency Title
Oklahoma ABSTRACTORSBoard . ........oovvuvennnnnnn. 5
Oklahoma ACCOUNTANCY Board ..........covvivvnnnn.. 10
State ACCREDITING AQENCY ..t iiiiiee e 15
AD Valorem Task Force (abolished 7-1-93) ................... 20
Oklahoma AERONAUTICS Commission . ........ccvvuuvvnnn. 25

Board of Regents for the Oklahoma AGRICULTURAL and Mechanical

Colleges . e 30
Oklahoma Department of AGRICULTURE, Food, and Forestry 35
Oklahoma Board of Licensed ALCOHOL and Drug Counselors 38
Board of Tests for ALCOHOL and Drug Influence .............. 40
ALCOHOLIC Beverage Laws Enforcement Commission . ........ 45
ANATOMICAL Board of the State of Oklahoma . .............. 50
Board of Governors of the Licensed ARCHITECTS, Landscape

Avrchitects and Registered Interior Designers of Oklahoma .. ... 55
ARCHIVES and Records Commission . ..........couvuvvnnnn. 60
Board of Trustees for the ARDMORE Higher

EducationProgram . ........ ot e 65
Oklahoma ARTS Council . ... oot e e 70
Oklahoma State ATHLETIC Commission (Formerly: Oklahoma

Professional BOXING Commission) - See Title 92
ATTORNEY General . ... ..ot 75
State AUDITOR and INSpector .. ........oviiiiinnnnnnnnn. 80
State BANKING Department .. .........oiiiiiin .. 85
Oklahoma State Employees BENEFITS Council . .............. 87
Councilof BOND Oversight .. ... oo 90
Oklahoma State ATHLETIC Commission (Formerly: Oklahoma

Professional BOXING Commission) . .................. 92
State BURIAL Board (abolished 7-1-92) . ........ ...t 95
[RESERVED] ..ttt 100
Oklahoma CAPITAL InvestmentBoard . .................... 105
Oklahoma CAPITOL Improvement Authority . ................ 110
State CAPITOL Preservation CommissSion . .......evvunenn.. 115
CAPITOL-MEDICAL Center Improvement and Zoning

COMMISSION vttt e i s 120
Oklahoma Department of CAREER and Technology Education

(Formerly: Oklahoma Department of VOCATIONAL and

Technical Education) - See Title 780
Board of Regents of CARL Albert State College . ............... 125
Department of CENTRAL Services (Formerly: Office of PUBLIC

Affairs) - See Title 580
CEREBRAL Palsy Commission . ........c.vviuiinnennnnn.. 130
Commissionon CHILDRENand Youth ..................... 135
Board of CHIROPRACTIC Examiners . ...........ocuvvun.. 140
Oklahoma Department of EMERGENCY Management

(Formerly: Department of CIVIL Emergency Management) 145
Oklahoma Department of COMMERCE  .................... 150
COMMUNITY Hospitals Authority . ......... ..o, 152
COMPSOURCE Oklahoma (Formerly: State INSURANCE

Fund) - See Title 370
Oklahoma CONSERVATION Commission . ........c.ououvnn.. 155
CONSTRUCTION IndustriesBoard . .........ccviuevnn... 158
Department of CONSUMER Credit . ...........ccivviune.nn. 160
CORPORATION COmMMISSION .. vt it i i e ii e iie e eiae s 165
Departmentof CORRECTIONS . ... ... 170
State Board of COSMETOLOGY ... .cviiiiiinii i nnns 175
Oklahoma State CREDIT UnionBoard .. ..............c..... 180
CRIME Victims CompensationBoard . ..................... 185
Joint CRIMINAL Justice System Task Force Committee ......... 190
Board of DENTISTRY ...ttt 195
Oklahoma DEVELOPMENT Finance Authority ............... 200
Office of DISABILITY Concerns (Formerly: Office of

HANDICAPPED Concerns) - See Title 305
Board of Regents of EASTERN Oklahoma State College ......... 205
EDGE FundPolicy Board . .........c.oiiiiiiiiininnnn 208
State Departmentof EDUCATION . ........ i, 210
EDUCATION OversightBoard .. .........ccoviiiuvnennn.. 215
Oklahoma EDUCATIONAL Television Authority . ............. 220
[RESERVED] ittt 225
State ELECTIONBoOard . ......coviiiiiii i 230

vii

Agency Title
Oklahoma FUNERAL Board (Formerly: Oklahoma State Board of
EMBALMERS and Funeral Directors) . ................. 235

Oklahoma Department of EMERGENCY Management

(Formerly: Department of CIVIL Emergency Management) -

See Title 145
Oklahoma EMPLOYMENT Security Commission . ............ 240
Oklahoma ENERGY ResourcesBoard . ...........c.ovvvunn.. 243

State Board of Licensure for Professional ENGINEERS and Land
Surveyors (Formerly: State Board of Registration for Professional

ENGINEERS and Land Surveyors) .............c.ovu... 245
Board of Trustees for the ENID Higher

EducationProgram . ...ttt 250
Department of ENVIRONMENTAL Quality ................. 252
State Board of EQUALIZATION ... .. iiiiiiinininnnnn 255
ETHICS Commission (Titlerevoked) ....................... 257
ETHICS COomMMISSION v v v it et e et e s 258
Officeof State FINANCE .. ... ...t 260
State FIRE Marshal Commission ............c.ouviineennn.. 265
Oklahoma Council on FIREFIGHTER Training . .............. 268
Oklahoma FIREFIGHTERS Pension and Retirement System . ..... 270
[RESERVED] ..ottt ittt 275
FORENSIC ReviewBoard ...........ccciiiiiiinnnne.ns 277
State Board of Registration for FORESTERS ................. 280
FOSTER Care Review AdvisoryBoard .. ................... 285
Oklahoma FUNERAL Board (Formerly: Oklahoma State Board of

Embalmers and Funeral Directors) - See Title 235
OklahomaFUTURES ... .. e 290
GOVERNOR ..t 295
GRAND River Dam Authority . ......... ..o, 300
Group Self-Insurance Association GUARANTY Fund Board ...... 302
Individual Self-Insured GUARANTY FundBoard .............. 303
STATE Use Committee (Formerly: Committee on Purchases of Products

and Services of the Severely HANDICAPPED) ............ 304
Office of DISABILITY Concerns (Formerly: Office of

HANDICAPPED CONCEINS) & v vt v v i n i nenn s 305
Oklahoma State Departmentof HEALTH . ................... 310
Oklahoma Basic HEALTH Benefits Board (abolished 11-1-97) ..... 315
Oklahoma HEALTH Care Authority . ..., 317
HIGHWAY Construction Materials Technician Certification

Board ... e 318
Oklahoma HISTORICAL Society . ... v v vii i e 320
Oklahoma HORSE Racing Commission . ...............uou... 325
Oklahoma HOUSING FinanCe AQENCY .. ..o v vvevnneennn. 330
Oklahoma HUMAN Rights Commission . .................... 335
Departmentof HUMAN Services ...........oviiiiinnnn.nn 340
Committee for INCENTIVE Awards for State Employees ......... 345
Oklahoma INDIAN Affairs Commission .............ccvuun.. 350
Oklahoma INDIGENT Defense System ..................... 352
Oklahoma INDUSTRIAL Finance Authority . ................ 355
INJURY ReviewBoard ........ ..., 357
Oklahoma State and Education Employees Group INSURANCE

Board . ... e 360
INSURANCE Department .. .....ovuiiiiiiiiiinnnnns 365
COMPSOURCE Oklahoma

(Formerly: State INSURANCEFund) ................... 370
Oklahoma State Bureau of INVESTIGATION ................ 375
Councilon JUDICIAL Complaints . ..., 376
Office of JUVENILE Affairs . ........ .. o, 377
Departmentof LABOR . ... ..ttt 380
Department of the Commissioners of the LAND Office ........... 385
Council on LAW Enforcement Education and Training . .......... 390
Oklahoma LAW Enforcement Retirement System .. ............. 395
Board on LEGISLATIVE Compensation . .............ove... 400
Oklahoma Departmentof LIBRARIES ...................... 405
LIEUTENANT GOVEIMOr . oottt it iii e nns 410
Oklahoma LINKED Deposit ReviewBoard . .................. 415
Oklahoma LIQUEFIED Petroleum GasBoard  ................ 420
Oklahoma LIQUEFIED Petroleum Gas Research, Marketing and Safety

COMMISSION . . vttt e i e i 422



Agency/Title Index — continued

Agency

LITERACY Initiatives Commission
LONG-RANGE Capital Planning Commission
Oklahoma State Board of Examiners for LONG-TERM Care
Administrators (Formerly: Oklahoma State Board of Examiners
for NURSING Home Administrators) - See Title 490
LOTTERY Commission, Oklahoma
Board of Trustees for the MCCURTAIN County Higher Education
Program
Commission on MARGINALLY Producing Oil and Gas Wells
State Board of MEDICAL Licensure and Supervision
MEDICAL Technology and Research Authority of Oklahoma
Board of MEDICOLEGAL Investigations
Department of MENTAL Health and Substance Abuse Services
MERIT Protection Commission
MILITARY Planning Commission, Oklahoma Strategic
Department of MINES
Oklahoma MOTOR Vehicle Commission
Board of Regents of MURRAY State College
Oklahoma State Bureau of NARCOTICS and Dangerous Drugs
Control
Board of Regents of NORTHERN Oklahoma College
Oklahoma Board of NURSING
Oklahoma State Board of Examiners for LONG-TERM Care
Administrators (Formerly: Oklahoma State Board of Examiners
for NURSING Home Administrators)
Board of Regents of OKLAHOMA City Community College
Board of Regents of OKLAHOMA Colleges
Board of Examiners in OPTOMETRY
State Board of OSTEOPATHIC Examiners
PARDON and Parole Board
Oklahoma PEANUT Commission
Oklahoma State PENSION Commission
State Board of Examiners of PERFUSIONISTS
Office of PERSONNEL Management
Oklahoma State Board of PHARMACY
PHYSICIAN Manpower Training Commission
Board of PODIATRIC Medical Examiners
Oklahoma POLICE Pension and Retirement System
State Department of POLLUTION Control (abolished 1-1-93)
POLYGRAPH Examiners Board
Oklahoma Board of PRIVATE Vocational Schools
State Board for PROPERTY and Casualty Rates
(abolished 7-1-06; see also Title 365)
State Board of Examiners of PSYCHOLOGISTS
Department of CENTRAL Services (Formerly: Office of PUBLIC
Affairs)
PUBLIC Employees Relations Board
Oklahoma PUBLIC Employees Retirement System
Department of PUBLIC Safety
REAL Estate Appraiser Board
Oklahoma REAL Estate Commission
Board of Regents of REDLANDS Community College
State REGENTS for Higher Education
State Department of REHABILITATION Services
Board of Regents of ROGERS State College
Board of Regents of ROSE State College
Oklahoma SAVINGS and Loan Board (abolished 7-1-93)
SCENIC Rivers Commission

viii

Agency Title
Oklahoma Commission on SCHOOL and County Funds

Management .. ..... ... 635
Advisory Task Force on the Sale of SCHOOL Lands (functions

concluded2-92) ... ... 640
The Oklahoma School of SCIENCE and Mathematics ........... 645
Oklahoma Center for the Advancement of SCIENCE and

Technology ... cov i 650
SECRETARY OfState . ....vvviiii it 655
Departmentof SECURITIES ........ ... i, 660
Board of Regents of SEMINOLE State College ................ 665
SHEEP and Wool Commission . ...........ccviiennnnennnn. 670
State Board of Licensed SOCIAL Workers . .......c.oovvvnnt. 675
SOUTHERN Growth PoliciesBoard . ..............covvuut. 680
Oklahoma SOYBEAN Commission (abolished 7-1-97) ........... 685
Board of Examiners for SPEECH-LANGUAGE Pathology and

Audiology ... e 690
STATE Employee Charitable Contributions, Oversight

Committee for (Formerly: STATE Agency

Review Committee) . ...... ..o 695

STATE Use Committee (Formerly: Committee on Purchases of Products
and Services of the Severely HANDICAPPED) - See Title 304

Oklahoma STUDENT Loan Authority ....... ..ot 700
TASKFOrce2000 .. ovvvvi it it e et e et i 705
Oklahoma TAX Commission .. ........uviuenniennnnnnnnn. 710
Oklahoma Commission for TEACHER Preparation ............. 712
TEACHERS’ Retirement System . ... ....viviiniin i 715
State TEXTBOOK Committee . .......ovinivnninnnnnn. 720
TOBACCO Settlement Endowment TrustFund . ............... 723
Oklahoma TOURISM and Recreation Department . ............. 725
Department of TRANSPORTATION ... ... 730
Oklahoma TRANSPORTATION Authority (Name changed to

Oklahoma TURNPIKE Authority 11-1-05) - See Title 731
Oklahoma TURNPIKE Authority (Formerly: Oklahoma

TRANSPORTATION Authority AND Oklahoma TURNPIKE

Authority) -Seealso Title745 .. ......... . ... 731
State TREASURER . ... .. e 735
Board of Regents of TULSA Community College ............... 740
Oklahoma TURNPIKE Authority (Name changed to Oklahoma

TRANSPORATION Authority 11-1-99 - no rules enacted in this

Title-See Title 731) ... .ot 745
Oklahoma UNIFORM Building Code Commission . ............ 748
Board of Trustees for the UNIVERSITY CenteratTulsa .......... 750
UNIVERSITY Hospitals Authority ...............coiin. 752
UNIVERSITY Hospitals Trust .. ...t 753
Board of Regents of the UNIVERSITY of Oklahoma ............ 755
Board of Regents of the UNIVERSITY of Science and Arts of

OKlahoma ... .o 760
Oklahoma USED Motor Vehicle and Parts Commission ........... 765
Oklahoma Department of VETERANS Affairs  ................ 770
Board of VETERINARY Medical Examiners ................. 775
Oklahoma Department of CAREER and Technology Education

(Formerly: Oklahoma Department of VOCATIONAL and

Technical Education) . ....... ..., 780
Oklahoma WATER ResourcesBoard . ..........ccovivvnnnn.. 785
Board of Regents of WESTERN Oklahoma State College ......... 790
Oklahoma WHEAT COmmISSION . v v v it e nie e i ennes 795
Department of WILDLIFE Conservation . ................... 800
WILL Rogers and J.M. Davis Memorials Commission ........... 805



Notices of Rulemaking Intent

Prior to adoption and gubernatorial/legislative review of a proposed PERMANENT rulemaking action, an agency must publish
a Notice of Rulemaking Intentin the Register. In addition, an agency may publish a Notice of Rulemaking Intent in the Register prior to
adoption of a proposed EMERGENCY or PREEMPTIVE rulemaking action.

A Notice of Rulemaking Intent announces a comment period, or a comment period and public hearing, and provides other
information about the intended rulemaking action as required by law, including where copies of proposed rules may be obtained.

For additional information on Notices of Rulemaking Intent, see 75 O.S., Section 303.

TITLE 268. OKLAHOMA COUNCIL ON
FIREFIGHTER TRAINING
CHAPTER 1. ADMINISTRATIVE
OPERATIONS

[OAR Docket #10-166]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

Notice of proposed PERMANENTrulemaking
PROPOSED RULES:

Subchapter 1. General Provisions

268:1-1-2. Description of organization [AMENDED]

268:1-1-3. Methods whereby the public may obtain

information or make submissions or requests
[AMENDED]
SUMMARY:

The proposed revision to 268:1-1-2 will add the Director of
Career Technology as an ex-officio and non-voting member of
the council.

The proposed revision to 268:1-1-3 will update information
about the Council on Firefighter Training address, phone
number and office hours.

AUTHORITY:

Council on Firefighter Training; 740 O.S., §325.1
COMMENT PERIOD:

Written and oral comments will be accepted until the
conclusion of the public hearing on March 31, 2010 at the
Council on Firefighter Training office. Written comments may
be mailed to the Council on Firefighter Training, 2716 NE 50th,
Oklahoma City, OK 73111.

PUBLIC HEARING:

A public hearing will be held at 10:00am, Wednesday,
March 31, 2010 at the office of the Council on Firefighter
Training, 2716 NE 50th, Oklahoma City, OK 73111.
REQUESTS FOR COMMENTS FROM BUSINESS
ENTITIES:

N/A
COPIES OF PROPOSED RULES:

Copies of proposed rules are available in the office of the
Council on Firefighter Training, 2716 NE 50th, Oklahoma City,
OK 73111 on March 1, 2010.

RULE IMPACT STATEMENT:

Pursuantto 75 O.S., Section 303(D), a rule impact statement
will be prepared and will be available in the office Council on
Firefighter Training, 2716 NE 50t, Oklahoma City, OK 73111.
March 1, 2010.

March 1, 2010

CONTACT PERSON:
Cheryl Lumry, Office Manager, Council on Firefighter
Training Office, 405-601-8862

[OAR Docket #10-166; filed 2-5-10]

TITLE 268. OKLAHOMA COUNCIL ON
FIREFIGHTER TRAINING
CHAPTER 2. OPERATIONS

[OAR Docket #10-168]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

Notice of proposed PERMANENTrulemaking
PROPOSED RULES:

Subchapter 5. Main Office Operations

268:2-5-3. Description of main office operations
[AMENDED]
SUMMARY:

The proposed revision to 268:2-5-3 will add a standing
committee review fire training standards, accreditation and
certification. The number of committee members and criteria
for representation shall be explained. The minimum number
of meetings and option to establish sub-committees shall be
explained.

The proposed revision to 268:2-5-3 will add a standing
committee to review, approve and list on an annual basis, all
fire training providers. The number of committee members and
criteria for representation shall be explained. The minimum
number of meetings and option to establish sub-committees
shall be explained.

AUTHORITY:

Council on Firefighter Training; 74 O.S., §325.1
COMMENT PERIOD:

Written and oral comments will be accepted until the
conclusion of the public hearing on March 31, 2010 at the
Council on Firefighter Training office. Written comments may
be mailed to the Council on Firefighter Training, 2716 NE 50th,
Oklahoma City, OK 73111.

PUBLIC HEARING:

A public hearing will be held at 10:00am, Wednesday,
March 31, 2010 at the office of the Council on Firefighter
Training, 2716 NE 50th, Oklahoma City, OK 73111.
REQUESTS FOR COMMENTS FROM BUSINESS
ENTITIES:

N/A

Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)



Notices of Rulemaking Intent

COPIES OF PROPOSED RULES:

Copies of proposed rules are available in the office of the
Council on Firefighter Training, 2716 NE 50th, Oklahoma City,
OK 73111 on March 1, 2010.

RULE IMPACT STATEMENT:

Pursuantto 75 O.S., Section 303(D), a rule impact statement
will be prepared and will be available in the office Council on
Firefighter Training, 2716 NE 50, Oklahoma City, OK 73111.
March 1, 2010.

CONTACT PERSON:

Cheryl Lumry, Office Manager, Council on Firefighter

Training Office, 405-601-8862

[OAR Docket #10-168; filed 2-9-10]

TITLE 277. FORENSIC REVIEW BOARD
CHAPTER 1. FORENSIC REVIEW BOARD

[OAR Docket #10-160]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

Notice of proposed PERMANENT rulemaking
PROPOSED RULES:

Chapter 1. Forensic Review Board [NEW]

SUMMARY:

In accordance with the Administrative Procedures Act the
proposed rules implement 22 O.S. § 1161, which authorizes
the Forensic Review Board upon delegation by the Governor,
to determine which individuals confined with the Department
of Mental Health and Substance Abuse Services, pursuant to
a finding of "not guilty by reason of insanity", are eligible for
therapeutic visits, conditional release or discharge and whether
the Board wishes to make such a recommendation to the court
of the county where the individual was found not guilty by
reason of insanity.

AUTHORITY:

Forensic Review Board; 22 O.S. § 1161.
COMMENT PERIOD:

Persons wishing to submit written comments may do so
until 5:00 p.m., March 31, 2010, to the attention of Stephanie
Kennedy, Administrative Rules Liaison. Written comments
may be mailed to the Department of Mental Health and
Substance Abuse Services, P.O. Box 53277, Oklahoma
City, OK 73152-3277, e-mailed to skennedy@odmhsas.org,
hand-delivered to the Department at 1200 N.E. 13t Street,
Oklahoma City, OK or by facsimile, at (405) 522-0401.
PUBLIC HEARING:

A public hearing will be conducted on March 31, 2010 at
9:00 a.m. in Conference Room A of the Department Mental
Health and Substance Abuse Services at the address given
above.

REQUESTS FOR COMMENTS FROM BUSINESS
ENTITIES:

The FRB asks business entities affected by the proposed

rules to provide written information to the Department, in

Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)

dollar amounts if possible, about the increase in the level
of direct costs, indirect costs, or other costs expected to be
incurred by the business entity due to compliance with the
proposed rules. Business entities may submit this information
in writing to Stephanie Kennedy, at the above address, before
the close of the comment period on March 31, 2010.

COPIES OF PROPOSED RULES:

Copies of the proposed rules may be obtained from
Stephanie Kennedy, Administrative Rules Liaison, at the above
address or through the ODMHSAS website at odmhsas.org.
RULE IMPACT STATEMENT:

Pursuant to 75 O.S. § 303(D) the FRB will prepare a rule
impact statement which will be available beginning March
5, 2010. Copies may be obtained from Stephanie Kennedy,
Administrative Rules Liaison, at the above address or through
the ODMHSAS website at odmhsas.org.

CONTACT PERSON:

Stephanie Kennedy, Administrative Rules Liaison, (405)

522-3871 or skennedy@odmhsas.org.

[OAR Docket #10-160; filed 2-5-10]

TITLE 595. DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC
SAFETY
CHAPTER10. CLASS D DRIVER LICENSES
AND IDENTIFICATION CARDS AND
MOTOR LICENSE AGENT PROCEDURES

[OAR Docket #10-161]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Notice of proposed PERMANENT rulemaking.
PROPOSED RULES:
Subchapter 1. Procedures for Obtaining and Maintaining a
Driver License or Identification Card [AMENDED]

Subchapter 13.  Parent-Taught Driver Education
[AMENDED]
SUMMARY:

Amendments to this chapter would update procedures
relating to driver licenses and identification cards, motor
license agent activities, and parent-taught driver education.

The proposed actions are amendments to existing rules.

The circumstance which created the need for these rules are
to comply with EHB 1052, EHB 1599, and ESB 1185 enacted
in the 2009 legislative session

The intended effect of these rules is to allow the Department
of Public Safety to perform its duties as required or authorized
by law.

AUTHORITY:

Commissioner of Public Safety; 47 O.S. 8§ 6-101 et seq.
COMMENT PERIOD:

Interested persons may present their views regarding
these rules in writing to the contact person referenced below.
Comments will be accepted up to the close of the public
hearing.

March 1, 2010



Notices of Rulemaking Intent

PUBLIC HEARING:

A public hearing regarding these proposed rules will be held
at 9:00 a.m., Wednesday, March 31, 2010, in the Conference
Room of the Robert E. Lester Training Center, 3600 N. Martin
Luther King, Oklahoma City, OK. Anyone who wishes to
speak must sign in at the door by 9:05 a.m.

REQUESTS FOR COMMENTS FROM BUSINESS
ENTITIES:

Any business entity affected by these proposed rules is
requested to provide the Department of Public Safety, in
writing to the contact person and within the comment period or
at the public hearing, in dollar amounts if possible, the increase
in the level of direct costs such as fees, and indirect costs such
as reporting, record keeping, equipment, construction, labor,
professional services, revenue loss, or other costs expected to
be incurred due to compliance with these proposed rules.
COPIES OF PROPOSED RULES:

A copy of the proposed rules may be obtained from the
contact person.

RULE IMPACT STATEMENT:

A Rule Impact Statement for the proposed rules will be
prepared, as required by 75 O.S. §303(D), and may be obtained
from the contact person.

CONTACT PERSON:

David W. Beatty, Administrative Rules, Department of
Public Safety, 3600 N. M.L. King Ave., P.O. Box 11415,
Oklahoma City, OK 73136-0415. Phone: (405) 425-2024.
Fax: (405) 419-2043. E-mail: dbeatty@dps.state.ok.us

[OAR Docket #10-161; filed 2-5-10]

TITLE595. DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC
SAFETY
CHAPTER 11. COMMERCIAL DRIVER
LICENSES

[OAR Docket #10-162]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

Notice of proposed PERMANENT rulemaking.
PROPOSED RULES:

Subchapter 5. Commercial Driver License Third-party

Examiners [AMENDED]

Subchapter 7. Truck Driver Training [AMENDED]
SUMMARY:

Amendments to this chapter would clarify scrivener's errors.

The proposed actions are amendments to existing rules.

The circumstance which created the need for these rules
is scrivener's errors when creating the chapter in the 2009
rulemaking process.

The intended effect of these rules is to allow the Department
of Public Safety to perform its duties as required or authorized
by law.

AUTHORITY:
Commissioner of Public Safety; 47 O.S. § 6-101 et seq.

March 1, 2010

COMMENT PERIOD:

Interested persons may present their views regarding
these rules in writing to the contact person referenced below.
Comments will be accepted up to the close of the public
hearing.

PUBLIC HEARING:

A public hearing regarding these proposed rules will be held
at 10:00 a.m., Wednesday, March 31, 2010, in the Conference
Room of the Robert E. Lester Training Center, 3600 N. Martin
Luther King, Oklahoma City, OK. Anyone who wishes to
speak must sign in at the door by 10:05 a.m.

REQUESTS FOR COMMENTS FROM BUSINESS
ENTITIES:

Any business entity affected by these proposed rules is
requested to provide the Department of Public Safety, in
writing to the contact person and within the comment period or
at the public hearing, in dollar amounts if possible, the increase
in the level of direct costs such as fees, and indirect costs such
as reporting, record keeping, equipment, construction, labor,
professional services, revenue loss, or other costs expected to
be incurred due to compliance with these proposed rules.
COPIES OF PROPOSED RULES:

A copy of the proposed rules may be obtained from the
contact person.

RULE IMPACT STATEMENT:

A Rule Impact Statement for the proposed rules will be
prepared, as required by 75 O.S. §303(D), and may be obtained
from the contact person.

CONTACT PERSON:

David W. Beatty, Administrative Rules, Department of
Public Safety, 3600 N. M.L. King Ave., P.O. Box 11415,
Oklahoma City, OK 73136-0415. Phone: (405) 425-2024.
Fax: (405) 419-2043. E-mail: dbeatty@dps.state.ok.us

[OAR Docket #10-162; filed 2-5-10]

TITLE 595. DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC
SAFETY
CHAPTER 35. ENFORCEMENT OF
OKLAHOMA MOTOR CARRIER
SAFETY AND HAZARDOUS MATERIALS
TRANSPORTATION ACT

[OAR Docket #10-163]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Notice of proposed PERMANENT rulemaking.
PROPOSED RULES:

Chapter 35. Enforcement of Oklahoma Motor Carrier
Safety and Hazardous Materials Transportation Act
[AMENDED]

SUMMARY:

Amendments to this chapter would bring rules into

conformity with federal regulations.

The proposed actions are amendments to existing rules.

Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)



Notices of Rulemaking Intent

The circumstance which created the need for these rules is to
remove or update language which is not in conformity with or is
contradictory to federal regulations.

The intended effect of these rules is to allow the Department
of Public Safety to perform its duties as required or authorized
by law.

AUTHORITY:

Commissioner of Public Safety; 47 O.S. § 230.4.
COMMENT PERIOD:

Interested persons may present their views regarding
these rules in writing to the contact person referenced below.
Comments will be accepted up to the close of the public
hearing.

PUBLIC HEARING:

A public hearing regarding these proposed rules will be held
at 1:30 p.m., Wednesday, March 31, 2010, in the Conference
Room of the Robert E. Lester Training Center, 3600 N. Martin
Luther King, Oklahoma City, OK. Anyone who wishes to
speak must sign in at the door by 1:35 p.m.

REQUESTS FOR COMMENTS FROM BUSINESS
ENTITIES:

Any business entity affected by these proposed rules is
requested to provide the Department of Public Safety, in
writing to the contact person and within the comment period or
at the public hearing, in dollar amounts if possible, the increase
in the level of direct costs such as fees, and indirect costs such
as reporting, record keeping, equipment, construction, labor,
professional services, revenue loss, or other costs expected to
be incurred due to compliance with these proposed rules.
COPIES OF PROPOSED RULES:

A copy of the proposed rules may be obtained from the
contact person.

RULE IMPACT STATEMENT:

A Rule Impact Statement for the proposed rules will be
prepared, as required by 75 O.S. §303(D), and may be obtained
from the contact person.

CONTACT PERSON:

David W. Beatty, Administrative Rules, Department of
Public Safety, 3600 N. M.L. King Ave., P.O. Box 11415,
Oklahoma City, OK 73136-0415. Phone: (405) 425-2024.
Fax: (405) 419-2043. E-mail: dbeatty@dps.state.ok.us

[OAR Docket #10-163; filed 2-5-10]

TITLE 595. DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC
SAFETY

CHAPTER 45. BOATING AND WATER
SAFETY

[OAR Docket #10-164]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Notice of proposed PERMANENT rulemaking.

Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)

656

PROPOSED RULES:

Subchapter 3. Boating Safety Education [AMENDED]
SUMMARY:

Amendments to this chapter would clarify procedures for
issuance of a boater education card.

The proposed actions are amendments to existing rules.

The circumstance which created the need for these is to
provide procedures related to replacing boater education cards.

The intended effect of these rules is to allow the Department
of Public Safety to perform its duties as required or authorized
by law.

AUTHORITY:

Commissioner of Public Safety; 63 O.S. 8§ 4009, 4202, and
4232.

COMMENT PERIOD:

Interested persons may present their views regarding
these rules in writing to the contact person referenced below.
Comments will be accepted until 1 p.m., Wednesday, March
31, 2010.

PUBLIC HEARING:

A public hearing regarding these proposed rules has not
been scheduled. A public hearing will be scheduled if written
request is received by the contact person no later than 1 p.m.,
Wednesday, March 31, 2010, in accordance with 75 O.S. §
303(C).

REQUESTS FOR COMMENTS FROM BUSINESS
ENTITIES:

Any business entity affected by these proposed rules is
requested to provide the Department of Public Safety, in
writing to the contact person and within the comment period or
at the public hearing, in dollar amounts if possible, the increase
in the level of direct costs such as fees, and indirect costs such
as reporting, record keeping, equipment, construction, labor,
professional services, revenue loss, or other costs expected to
be incurred due to compliance with these proposed rules.
COPIES OF PROPOSED RULES:

A copy of the proposed rules may be obtained from the
contact person
RULE IMPACT STATEMENT:

A Rule Impact Statement for the proposed rules will be
prepared, as required by 75 O.S. §303(D), and may be obtained
from the contact person.

CONTACT PERSON:

David W. Beatty, Administrative Rules, Department of
Public Safety, 3600 N. M.L. King Ave., P.O. Box 11415,
Oklahoma City, OK 73136-0415. Phone: (405) 425-2024.
Fax: (405) 419-2043. E-mail: dbeatty@dps.state.ok.us

[OAR Docket #10-164; filed 2-5-10]

March 1, 2010



Notices of Rulemaking Intent

TITLE595. DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC
SAFETY
CHAPTER50. TABS, TAGS, SIGNS AND
INSIGNIAS

[OAR Docket #10-165]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

Notice of proposed PERMANENT rulemaking.
PROPOSED RULES:

Subchapter 3. Handicap Parking Placards for Physically

Disabled Persons [AMENDED]
SUMMARY:

Amendments to this chapter would bring rules into
conformity with state law.

The proposed actions are amendments to existing rules.

The circumstance which created the need for these rules is to
remove or update language which is not in conformity with or is
contradictory to state law.

The intended effect of these rules is to allow the Department
of Public Safety to perform its duties as required or authorized
by law.

AUTHORITY:

Commissioner of Public Safety; 47 O.S. §2-108.
COMMENT PERIOD:

Interested persons may present their views regarding
these rules in writing to the contact person referenced below.
Comments will be accepted until 1 p.m., Wednesday, March
31, 2010.

PUBLIC HEARING:

A public hearing regarding these proposed rules has not
been scheduled. A public hearing will be scheduled if written
request is received by the contact person no later than 1 p.m.,
Wednesday, March 31, 2010, in accordance with 75 O.S. §
303(C).

REQUESTS FOR COMMENTS FROM BUSINESS
ENTITIES:

Any business entity affected by these proposed rules is
requested to provide the Department of Public Safety, in
writing to the contact person and within the comment period or
at the public hearing, in dollar amounts if possible, the increase
in the level of direct costs such as fees, and indirect costs such
as reporting, record keeping, equipment, construction, labor,
professional services, revenue loss, or other costs expected to
be incurred due to compliance with these proposed rules.
COPIES OF PROPOSED RULES:

A copy of the proposed rules may be obtained from the
contact person.

RULE IMPACT STATEMENT:

A Rule Impact Statement for the proposed rules will be
prepared, as required by 75 O.S. §303(D), and may be obtained
from the contact person.

CONTACT PERSON:

David W. Beatty, Administrative Rules, Department of

Public Safety, 3600 N. M.L. King Ave., P.O. Box 11415,

March 1, 2010

Oklahoma City, OK 73136-0415. Phone: (405) 425-2024.
Fax: (405) 419-2043. E-mail: dbeatty@dps.state.ok.us

[OAR Docket #10-165; filed 2-5-10]

TITLE 630. SCENIC RIVERS COMMISSION
CHAPTER 15. PROTECTION OF NATURAL
RESOURCES

[OAR Docket #10-156]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

Notice of proposed PERMANENT rulemaking
PROPOSED RULES:

630:15-1-14. Ice chest restrictions [AMENDED]
SUMMARY:

No change is proposed to what was adopted last year. This
will correct an error in the text of the rule that was inadvertently
published in the Oklahoma Register as the final rule. The
language proposed today will result in the actual language that
was adopted by the OSRC on March 17, 2009. This proposed
rulemaking action is intended simply to correct the records at
the Office of Administrative Rules.

AUTHORITY:

Scenic Rivers Commission: 82 0.S., §8§ 1451 - 1471.
COMMENT PERIOD:

Anyone may submit written comments to Ed Fite at
the Scenic Rivers Commission through March 31, 2010.
The OSRC is located 2 miles northeast of Tahlequah on
State Highway #10, and its mailing address is P.O. Box
292, Tahlequah, OK 74465-0292. You may also email to
osrc@fullnet.net.

The OSRC will then consider adopting the correction at a
special meeting at 5:30 p.m. on Wednesday, March 31, 2010,
at the Tahlequah Armory Municipal Center, located at 100
North Water Street, Tahlequah, Oklahoma.

PUBLIC HEARING:

A public hearing to take comments will convene during the
March 31, 2010 Special Business Meeting.

REQUESTS FOR COMMENTS FROM BUSINESS
ENTITIES:

Although nothing in this rulemaking action is expected to
adversely impact small business, the OSRC requests that any
business entity affected by these proposed changes provide the
OSRC with information, within the comment period, in dollar
amounts if possible, about the increase in the level of direct
costs, indirect costs, or other costs expected to be incurred due
to compliance with the proposed rules.

COPIES OF PROPOSED RULES:

Copies of the proposed rule may be obtained by writing to
or visiting the OSRC office listed above, or from the OSRC
website at www.oklahomascenicrivers.net.

Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)



Notices of Rulemaking Intent

RULE IMPACT STATEMENT:

Pursuant to 75 O.S., § 303(D), a rule impact statement is
being prepared and will be available for review at the OSRC
office and website by February 17, 2010.

CONTACT PERSON:
Ed Fite, (918) 456-3251

[OAR Docket #10-156; filed 2-3-10]

TITLE 765. OKLAHOMA USED MOTOR
VEHICLE AND PARTS COMMISSION
CHAPTER 37. MANUFACTURED HOME
INSTALLERS

[OAR Docket #10-157]

INTENDED RULEMAKING ACTION:

Notice of proposed PERMANENT rulemaking
PROPOSED RULES:

Subchapter 6. Definitions [NEW]

765:37-6-1 [NEW]

Subchapter 7. Installation Standards For Ground Sets

765:37-7-1 [AMENDED]

765:37-7-2 [AMENDED]

SUMMARY:

The United States Department of Housing and Urban
Development has enacted rules which affect the education and
training of manufactured home installers, the standards for
installation of new manufactured homes, and remedies for any
party injured by improper manufactured home installations.
It is necessary to adopt permanent rules for manufactured
home installations of new manufactured homes in the state
of Oklahoma to conform state standards with the new federal
standards.

AUTHORITY:

Oklahoma Used Motor Vehicle and Parts Commission

47 O.S. Section 582(E)(1)

75 0O.S. Section 302(A)(1)

Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)

658

75 0.S. Section 307
COMMENT PERIOD:

Persons wishing to present their views regarding this action
may do so by delivering or mailing their written comments
to the Used Motor Vehicle and Parts Commission, 2401 NW
23rd, Suite 57, Oklahoma City, Oklahoma 73107, prior to the
public hearing.

PUBLIC HEARING:

The public hearing will be held on Wednesday, March 31,
2010, at 10:30 AM, at the office of the Used Motor Vehicle and
Parts Commission, 2401 NW 23rd, Suite 57, Oklahoma City,
Oklahoma.

REQUEST FOR COMMENTS FROM BUSINESS
ENTITIES:

The Used Motor Vehicle and Parts Commission requests
that business entities affected by these proposed rules provide
the Commission, within the comment period, in dollar amounts
if possible, the increase in the level of direct costs, indirect
costs, or other costs expected to be incurred by the business
entity due to compliance with the proposed rules. Business
entities may submit this information in writing to John W.
Maile, at the above address, before the close of the comment
period on March 31, 2010.

COPIES OF PROPOSED RULES:

Copies of the proposed rules may be obtained for review at
the office of the Used Motor Vehicle and Parts Commission,
2401 NW 23rd, Suite 57, Oklahoma City, Oklahoma.

RULE IMPACT STATEMENT:

A rule impact statement will be prepared and be available
after February 3, 2010, at the office of the Used Motor Vehicle
and Parts Commission.

CONTACT PERSON:

John W. Maile, Director, Used Motor Vehicle and Parts
Commission, 2401 NW 23rd, Suite 57, Oklahoma City,
Oklahoma 73107 (405)949-2626.

[OAR Docket #10-157; filed 2-4-10]

March 1, 2010



Submissions for Review

Within 10 calendar days after adoption by an agency of a proposed PERMANENT rulemaking action, the agency must submit
the proposed rules to the Governor and the Legislature for review. In addition, the agency must publish in the Register a "statement"

that the rules have been submitted for gubernatorial/legislative review.
For additional information on submissions for gubernatorial/legislative review, see 75 O.S., Section 303.1, 303.2, and 308.

TITLE 165. CORPORATION COMMISSION
CHAPTER 65. WATER SERVICE UTILITIES

[OAR Docket #10-150]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission for gubernatorial and legislative review
RULES:

Subchapter 9. Records, Reports, and Filing Requirements
165:65-9-11. Relief from rate increase requirements

[NEW]
SUBMITTED TO GOVERNOR:
January 27, 2010
SUBMITTED TO HOUSE:
January 27, 2010
SUBMITTED TO SENATE:
January 27, 2010

[OAR Docket #10-150; filed 2-2-10]

TITLE 485. OKLAHOMA BOARD OF
NURSING
CHAPTER 1. ADMINISTRATION

[OAR Docket #10-155]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission for gubernatorial and legislative review
RULES:
485:1-1-1. [AMENDED]
485:1-1-2. [AMENDED]
485:1-1-4. [AMENDED]
485:1-1-5. [AMENDED]
SUBMITTED TO GOVERNOR:
February 3, 2010
SUBMITTED TO HOUSE:
February 3, 2010
SUBMITTED TO SENATE:
February 3, 2010

[OAR Docket #10-155; filed 2-3-10]

March 1, 2010

TITLE 485. OKLAHOMA BOARD OF
NURSING
CHAPTER 10. LICENSURE OF PRACTICAL
AND REGISTERED NURSES

[OAR Docket #10-154]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission for gubernatorial and legislative review
RULES:
Subchapter 1. General Provisions
485:10-1-2. [AMENDED]
Subchapter 5. Minimum Standards for Approved Nursing
Education Programs
485:10-5-8. [AMENDED]
Subchapter 7. Requirements for Registration and Licensure
as a Registered Nurse
485:10-7-2. [AMENDED]
Subchapter 9. Requirements for Registration and Licensure
as a Licensed Practical Nurse
485:10-9-2. [AMENDED]
Subchapter 10. Advanced Unlicensed Assistive Personnel
485:10-10-8. [AMENDED]
485:10-10-8.1. [AMENDED]
Subchapter 11. Disciplinary Action
485:10-11-2. [AMENDED]
Subchapter 13. Requirements for Employment
485:10-13-1. [AMENDED]
Subchapter 19. Peer Assistance Program
485:10-19-4. [AMENDED]
485:10-19-5. [AMENDED]
485:10-19-8 [AMENDED]
SUBMITTED TO GOVERNOR:
February 3, 2010
SUBMITTED TO HOUSE:
February 3, 2010
SUBMITTED TO SENATE:
February 3, 2010

[OAR Docket #10-154; filed 2-3-10]

TITLE 715. TEACHERS' RETIREMENT
SYSTEM
CHAPTER 10. GENERAL OPERATIONS
[OAR Docket #10-147]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Submission for gubernatorial and legislative review

659 Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)



Submissions for Review

RULES:

Subchapter 13. Contributions for Membership Service

715:10-13-1. Regular annual compensation requirements
[AMENDED]

715:10-13-5. Compensation corrections [AMENDED]

Subchapter 17. Post-retirement Employment

715:10-17-7. Employment by a disabled retiree
[AMENDED]

715:10-17-12. Earnings report by remitting agencies
[AMENDED]

Subchapter 19. Tax-sheltered Annuity Program

715:10-19-1. Authority for program [AMENDED]

715:10-19-2. General description [AMENDED]

715:10-19-3. Eligible employees [AMENDED]

715:10-19-4. Program requisites [AMENDED]

715:10-19-5. Contributions [AMENDED]

715:10-19-7. Methods of computing maximum TSA
contribution [AMENDED]

715:10-19-8. Distributions [AMENDED]

715:10-19-9.  Withdrawals for financial hardship
[AMENDED]

Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)

660

715:10-19-11. Rollovers from OTRS 403(b) program to
other eligible retirement plans [AMENDED]
715:10-19-12. The Oklahoma Teachers' Deferred Savings
Incentive Plan Fund [AMENDED]
715:10-19-13. Contributions from the Oklahoma Teachers'
Deferred Savings Incentive Plan Fund into Tax-Sheltered
Annuity accounts of active contributing TRS members
[AMENDED]
Subchapter 21. Investment Policy
715:10-21-1. Investment of funds [AMENDED]
715:10-21-2. Statement of investment policy [AMENDED]
SUBMITTED TO GOVERNOR:
February 1, 2010
SUBMITTED TO HOUSE:
February 1, 2010
SUBMITTED TO SENATE:
February 1, 2010

[OAR Docket #10-147; filed 2-1-10]

March 1, 2010



Gubernatorial Approvals

Upon notification of approval by the Governor of an agency’s proposed PERMANENT rulemaking action, the agency must
submit a notice of such gubernatorial approval for publication in the Register.
For additional information on gubernatorial approvals, see 75 O.S., Section 303.2.

TITLE 775. BOARD OF VETERINARY
MEDICAL EXAMINERS
CHAPTER 10. LICENSURE OF
VETERINARIANS, VETERINARY
TECHNICIANS AND ANIMAL EUTHANASIA
TEHNICIANS

[OAR Docket #10-152]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Gubernatorial approval of permanent rules
RULES:
Subchapter 3. Licensure of Veterinarians [AMENDED]
Subchapter 8. Certification of Euthanasia Technicians
[AMENDED]
GUBERNATORIAL APPROVAL.:
January 22, 2010

[OAR Docket #10-152; filed 2-2-10]

March 1, 2010 661

TITLE 775. BOARD OF VETERINARY
MEDICAL EXAMINERS
CHAPTER 30. FIELD CITATION
PENALTIES

[OAR Docket #10-153]

RULEMAKING ACTION:
Gubernatorial approval of permanent rules
RULES:
775:30-1-1. Classifications and administrative penalties
[AMENDED]
GUBERNATORIAL APPROVAL.:
January 22, 2010

[OAR Docket #10-153; filed 2-2-10]

Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)



Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12) 662 March 1, 2010



Withdrawn Rules

An agency may withdraw proposed PERMANENT rules prior to final adoption (approval by Governor/Legislature) by notifying
the Governor and the Legislature and by publishing a notice in the Register of such a withdrawal.

An agency may withdraw proposed EMERGENCY rules prior to approval/disapproval by the Governor by notifying the
Governor, the Legislature, and the Office of Administrative Rules. The withdrawal notice is not published in the Register, however,
unless the agency published a Notice of Rulemaking Intent in the Register before adopting the EMERGENCY rules.

For additional information on withdrawal of proposed rules, see 75 O.S., Section 308(F) and 253(K) and OAC 655:10-7-33.

TITLE 35. OKLAHOMA DEPARTMENT OF Submitted to Governor:

AGRICULTURE, FOOD, AND FORESTRY January 26, 2010
CHAPTER 15. ANIMAL INDUSTRY Submitted to House:
January 26, 2010
[OAR Docket #10-151] Submitted to Senate:
January 26, 2010
RULEMAKING ACTION: Withdrawn:
Withdrawal of PERMANENT rulemaking February 2, 2010
WITHDRAWN RULES:
Subchapter 1. General Provisions [OAR Docket #10-151; filed 2-2-10]
35:15-1-4 [NEW] _—
DATES:
Adoption:

January 20, 2010

March 1, 2010 663 Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)



Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12) 664 March 1, 2010



Emergency Adoptions

An agency may adopt new rules, or amendments to or revocations of existing rules, on an emergency basis if the agency
determines that "an imminent peril exists to the preservation of the public health, safety, or welfare, or that a compelling public interest
requires an emergency rule[s] . . . . [A]Jn agency may promulgate, at any time, any such [emergency] rule[s], provided the Governor

firstapproves such rule[s]" [75 O.S., Section 253(A)].

An emergency action is effective immediately upon approval by the Governor or on a later date specified by the agency in the
preamble of the emergency rule document. An emergency rule expires on July 15 after the next regular legislative session following
promulgation, or on an earlier date specified by the agency, if not already superseded by a permanent rule or terminated through

legislative action as described in 75 O.S., Section 253(H)(2).

Emergency rules are not published in the Oklahoma Administrative Code; however, a source note entry, which references
the Register publication of the emergency action, is added to the Code upon promulgation of a superseding permanent rule or

expiration/termination of the emergency action.

For additional information on the emergency rulemaking process, see 75 O.S., Section 253.

TITLE 748. UNIFORM BUILDING CODE
COMMISSION
CHAPTER 3. GENERAL PROVISIONS

[OAR Docket #10-158]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

EMERGENCY adoption
RULES:

748:3-1-1. Context and interpretation [NEW]

748:3-1-2. Definitions [NEW]

AUTHORITY:

Uniform Building Code Commission; 59 O.S. §§ 1000.23 and 1000.25.
DATES:

Public Hearing:

December 2, 2009
Adoption:

December 2, 2009
Approved by Governor:

January 12, 2010
Effective:

Immediately upon Governor's approval
Expiration:

Effective through July 14, 2010, unless superseded by another rule or
disapproved by the Legislature
SUPERSEDED EMERGENCY ACTIONS:

"n/a"

INCORPORATIONS BY REFERENCE:

"n/a"

FINDING OF EMERGENCY:

The Uniform Building Code Commission (UBCC) finds compelling and
extraordinary circumstances for the promulgation of emergency rules for the
operation and funding of the UBCC and the administration of the Oklahoma
Uniform Building Code Commission Act (“the Act") at 59 O.S. §§ 1000.20 -
1000.29. The Act requires immediate actions from the UBCC requiring the
adoption of codes for the protection of the public welfare and safety. These
actions require funds and the Act provides that the UBCC may implement
rules establishing fees within parameters established by the Legislature, even
though the Legislature is not in session. The rules herein were developed in
accordance with Oklahoma law to satisfy the immediate needs of the Statewide
construction industries and to protect the health, safety and welfare of the
consuming public.

ANALYSIS:

748:3-1-1 sets forth the context and interpretive guidance for definitions
promulgated by the UBCC. 80:3-1-2 defines essential terms for UBCC
operations and fee collections.

CONTACT PERSONS:

David Timberlake, Chairman, Uniform Building Code Commission,
2401 N.W. 23,Ste 5, Oklahoma City, OK 73107 telephone:(405) 840-2521;
facsimile: (405) 271-5254; electronic mail: dbt@timberlakeconstruction.com
AND Mitchell Hort, Vice-Chairman, Uniform Building Code Commission,
2401 N.W. 23, Ste 5, Oklahoma City, OK 73107 telephone:(405)354-6676;
electronic mail:_mhort@cityofyukon.gov

March 1, 2010

PURSUANT TO THE ACTIONS DESCRIBED HEREIN,
THE FOLLOWING EMERGENCY RULES ARE
CONSIDERED PROMULGATED AND EFFECTIVE
UPON APPROVAL BY THE GOVERNOR AS SET
FORTHIN750.S.,SECTION 253(D):

748:3-1-1. Context and Interpretation

Unless the context otherwise requires, singular words shall
be deemed to include the plural, and masculine words to in-
clude the feminine, and vice versa.

748:3-1-2. Definitions

"Authority Having Jurisdiction means an organi-
zation, office, or individual responsible for enforcing the
requirements of the State Adopted Building Codes, includ-
ing the prior authorization or approval of any equipment,
materials, installations or procedures used in all or part of
the construction of a new, or the alteration or renovation of
an existing, building or structure, including integral finishes,
fixtures and building systems therein.

"Building Code'" means a collection of required stan-
dards and practices intended to apply to all or part of the con-
struction of new, or the alteration or renovation of existing,
buildings or structures, including integral finishes, fixtures and
building systems therein.

"Building Permit'’ means any written or verbal autho-
rization or approval, issued by an authority having jurisdiction,
which allows the holder or other persons to commence the con-
struction, alteration or renovation of all or part of a residential
or commercial building or structure subject to the requirements
of the State Adopted Building Codes. For purposes of this Ti-
tle, the term building permit includes any process wherein au-
thorization, approval or registration is required prior to con-
struction even though: 1) a permitting or registration docu-
ment is not issued at that time; 2) the authority having juris-
diction refers to the authorization, approval or registration as
something other than a "permit"”; or 3) the only activities per-
formed by the authority having jurisdiction are fee-based in-
spections of the work performed. For purposes of this Title,
each segment of a multi-segment permit shall be considered
a separate building permit if the seqment meets each of the
following conditions: 1) the authority having jurisdiction re-
quires a separate, stand-alone building permit for the segment

Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)



Emergency Adoptions

work when said work is not performed as part of a multi-seg-
ment construction project; 2) the authority having jurisdiction
charges a stand-alone building permit fee for the segment work
when said work is not performed as part of a multi-segment
construction project; and 3) the segment work is subject to the
requirements of the State Adopted Building Codes.

""Construction Code'" and ""Construction Permit'* shall
have the same meaning as, and be respectively interchangeable
and synonymous with, the terms "Building Code" and "Build-
ing Permit" as defined herein, respectively.

"Multi-Segment Permitting'" is the administrative
process of consolidating multiple building permit work autho-
rizations, approvals and/or registrations and the payment of
required permit fees for a multi-segment construction project
into a single administrative process.

""'State Adopted Building Codes'" means any legally ap-
plicable building code currently in force and effect within the
State or a governing jurisdiction until superceded by a code
adopted by the Commission and all building codes adopted by
the Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission.

[OAR Docket #10-158; filed 2-5-10]

TITLE 748. UNIFORM BUILDING CODE
COMMISSION
CHAPTERS. FEES AND COLLECTION OF
FEES

[OAR Docket #10-159]

RULEMAKING ACTION:

EMERGENCY adoption
RULES:

Subchapter 1. Fees [NEW]

748:5-1-1. Fee for initial permit and permit renewal [NEW]

Subchapter 3. Collection and Late Fee Assessment [NEW]

748:5-3-1. Late Fee Assessment [NEW]

AUTHORITY:

Uniform Building Code Commission; 59 O.S. §8§ 1000.23 and 1000.25.
DATES:

Public Hearing:

December 2, 2009
Adoption:

December 2, 2009
Approved by Governor:

January 12, 2010
Effective:

Immediately upon Governor's approval
Expiration:

Effective through July 14, 2010, unless superseded by another rule or
disapproved by the Legislature
SUPERSEDED EMERGENCY ACTIONS:

nla
INCORPORATIONS BY REFERENCE:

n/a
FINDING OF EMERGENCY:

The Uniform Building Code Commission (UBCC) finds compelling and
extraordinary circumstances for the promulgation of emergency rules for the
operation and funding of the UBCC and the administration of the Oklahoma
Uniform Building Code Commission Act (‘the Act’) at 59 O.S. §§ 1000.20 -
1000.29. The Act requires immediate actions from the UBCC requiring the
adoption of codes for the protection of the public welfare and safety. These
actions require funds and the Act provides that the UBCC may implement
rules establishing fees within parameters established by the Legislature, even
though the Legislature is not in session. The rules herein were developed in

Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)

accordance with Oklahoma law to satisfy the immediate needs of the Statewide
construction industries and to protect the health, safety and welfare of the
consuming public.

ANALYSIS:

748:5-1-1 establishes fees in accordance with 59 O.S. § 1000.25 and sets
forth the guidelines for the collection and administration of said fees consistent
with the Act. 748:5-3-1 sets forth the timelines, percentage and assessment
procedures for the assessment of late fees as set forth in the Actat 59 O.S. §
1000.25. The UBCC has found that these emergency rules are required by the
enactment of SB1182, which became effective on June 2, 2009. As expressly
stated in 59 O.S. 8§ 1000.22, 1000.24 and 1000.26, the UBCC is required to
take immediate action.

CONTACT PERSONS:

David Timberlake, Chairman, Uniform Building Code Commission,
2401 N.W. 23,Ste 5, Oklahoma City, OK 73107 telephone:(405) 840-2521;
facsimile: (405) 271-5254; electronic mail: dbt@timberlakeconstruction.com
AND Mitchell Hort, Vice-Chairman, Uniform Building Code Commission,
2401 N.W. 23, Ste 5, Oklahoma City, OK 73107 telephone:(405)354-6676;
electronic mail:_mhort@cityofyukon.gov

PURSUANT TO THE ACTIONS DESCRIBED HEREIN,
THE FOLLOWING EMERGENCY RULES ARE
CONSIDERED PROMULGATED AND EFFECTIVE
UPON APPROVAL BY THE GOVERNOR AS SET
FORTHIN750.S.,SECTION 253(D):

SUBCHAPTER 1. FEES

748:5-1-1. Fee for initial permit and permit renewal
(@) Beginning the first day of the month 60 days following
the Governor's approval of the emergency rules, the Commis-
sion shall charge a fee of $4.00 on all building permits issued
by any state agency, municipality, or other political subdivi-
sion of this state which authorizes work governed by the State
Adopted Building Codes. Beginning the first day of the month
60 days following the Governor's approval of the emergency
rules, the Commission shall charge a fee of $0 on all renewal
building permits issued by any state agency, municipality, or
other political subdivision of this state which authorizes work
governed by the State Adopted Building Codes.

(b) Such fees shall be collected by the state agency, munici-
pality or other political subdivision issuing the building or con-
struction permits within this state. The fees shall be deposited
in an account created by the collecting entity for that purpose;
(c) The state agency, municipality or other political subdivi-
sion shall remit the monies in the account on a monthly basis
directly to the State Treasury for deposit in the Oklahoma Uni-
form Building Code Commission Revolving Fund created pur-
suant to Section 1000.28 of Title 59 of the Oklahoma statutes.
(d) Any state agency, municipality or other political subdivi-
sion collecting and remitting fees pursuant to this section may
levy a fee up to fifty cents ($.50) for every building permit.
Any state agency, municipality or other political subdivision
collecting and remitting fees pursuant to this section may levy a
fee of $0 for any building renewal permit issued. These monies
shall be deposited into an account for the sole use of the state
agency, municipality or other political subdivision. The state
agency, municipality or other political subdivision shall state
the total amount of funds collected and the total number of

March 1, 2010



Emergency Adoptions

fees imposed to the State Treasury in the report required by

SUBCHAPTER 3. COLLECTION AND LATE FEE

subparagraph (q) of this section.

(e) It shall be the responsibility of the state agency, munic-
ipality or other political subdivision to account for and ensure
the correctness and accuracy of payments made to the State
Treasury pursuant to Uniform Building Code Commission Act
as found at 59 O.S. §1000.21 et seq.

(f)  Funds collected by a state agency, municipality or other
political subdivision and remitted to the State Treasury pur-
suant to the Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission
Act shall be deposited in the Oklahoma Uniform Building
Code Commission Revolving Fund and shall be used solely
for the purposes of the Oklahoma Uniform Building Code
Commission Act.

(@) Along with the deposits required by subparagraph (d),
each state agency, municipality or other political subdivision
shall also submit a report stating the total amount of funds col-
lected and the total number of fees imposed during the pre-
ceding month. The report shall be made on computerized or
manual disposition forms as prescribed by the Commission.

March 1, 2010

667

ASSESSMENT

748:5-3-1. Late Fee Assessment

Deposits of fees to the Oklahoma Uniform Building Code
Commission Revolving Fund shall be due on the twentieth day
of each month for the fees collected during the preceding cal-
endar month. There shall be a late fee imposed for failure to
make timely deposits. The Oklahoma Uniform Building Code
Commission, in its discretion, may waive all or part of the late
fee. Such late fee shall be one percent (1%) of the principal
amount due per day beginning from the tenth day after pay-
ment is due and accumulating until the late fee reaches one
hundred percent (100%) of the principal amount due.

[OAR Docket #10-159; filed 2-5-10]

Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)



Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12) 668 March 1, 2010



Executive Orders

Asrequired by 75 O.S., Sections 255 and 256, Executive Orders issued by the Governor of Oklahoma are published in both the
Oklahoma Register and the Oklahoma Administrative Code. Executive Orders are codified in Title 1 of the Oklahoma Administrative

Code.

Pursuantto 75 O.S., Section 256(B)(3), "Executive Orders of previous gubernatorial administrations shall terminate ninety (90)
calendar days following the inauguration of the next Governor unless otherwise terminated or continued during that time by Executive

Order."

TITLE1l. EXECUTIVE ORDERS

1:2010-9.

EXECUTIVE ORDER 2010-9

I, Brad Henry, Governor of the State of Oklahoma, hereby
direct the appropriate steps be taken to fly all American and
Oklahoma flags on State property at half-staff from 8:00 a.m.
until 5:00 p.m. on Sunday, February 7, 2010, to honor Cap-
tain David J. Thompson, an Oklahoma resident, who died
on Friday, January 29, 2010, at age 39 while on active duty
supporting Operation Enduring Freedom in Wardak province,
Afghanistan.

This executive order shall be forwarded to the Director of
Central Services who shall cause the provisions of this order
to be implemented by all appropriate agencies of state govern-
ment.

March 1, 2010

669

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have hereunto set my hand and
caused the Great Seal of the State of Oklahoma to be affixed at
Oklahoma City, Oklahoma, this 5th day of February, 2010.

BY THE GOVERNOR OF THE
STATE OF OKLAHOMA

Brad Henry

ATTEST:
Michelle Waddell
Acting Assistant Secretary of State

[OAR Docket #10-169; filed 2-9-10]

Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12)



Oklahoma Register (Volume 27, Number 12) 670 March 1, 2010



